Bid # 6010-012320-1 Title: ALS Supplies for EMS Units Date: 01/23/2020

Time: 2:00 PM
Bid Tabulation: Preliminary Vendor Vendor Vendor Vendor
Bound Tree Medical, LLC Henry Schein, Inc. Quadmed, Inc. Life-Assist, Inc.
Item #| Qty |Description Cost Each Total Price Cost Each Total Price Cost Each Total Price Cost Each Total Price

1 1 |Restraint Straps Limb Holder Disposable W/ Double D Ring S 425 |S 425 1S 3.00 | $ 3.00|$ 360 |S 360 | S 3.00 S 3.00
2 2 |Dressing, Trauma, 12 In X 30 In, Sterile S 1.10 | $ 220 | $ 071 S 142 | S 0.65 | S 130 | $ 1.00 | $ 2.00
3 1 |Curaplex Burn Sheet, 60 Inch X 90 Inch, Sterile S 220 S 220 |$ 133 |$ 133 | S 1.46 | S 1.46 | $ 325 |S 3.25
4 1 |Curaplex Ob Kit Sealed Standard S 6.96 | S 6.96 | $ 471 |S 471 S 456 | S 456 | S 750 | $ 7.50
5 1 |Curaplex Disposable Penlight * $4.40/pk of 6 S 4.40 | * $3.36/pk of 6 S 360 | S 384 | S 384 | S 0.80 | S 0.80
6 1 |Curaplex Paramedic Shears, White, 7.5 In S 073 | S 073 | 062 S 062 |S 0.67 | S 067 | S 325 |S 3.25
7 5 |Kerlix Roll, 3.4 In. X 3.6 Yards, 6 Ply, Sterile In Soft Pouch, S 1.10 | $ 550 | $ 091 S 4.55 | * $1.83/box of 6 S 183 | $ 1.20 | $ 6.00
8 5 |Gauze Bandage 4.5 In X 3.1 Yd Sterile Kerlix S 1.77 | $ 885 S 0.58 | $ 290 | $ 049 | S 245 | S 1.75 | S 8.75
9 1 |Cloth Surgical Tape 1/2 In X 10 Yds * $9.40/box of 24 S 9.40 | *$8.40/boxof24 | S 8.40 | *$7.13/boxof 24 | S 7.13 | * $9.20/box S 9.20
10 1 |Tape Adhesive Cloth Surgical 1 In X 10 Yds * $9.40/box of 24 S 9.40 | *$8.04/boxof12 |$ 8.04 | *$7.13/boxof12 | $ 713 S 0.75 | S 0.75
11 1 |Quikclot Combat Gauze, LE Z-Fold, 3 Inch X 4 Yards, Black Pack| $ 37.04 | S 37.04 | S 3491 | S 3491 | S 36.61 | S 36.61 | $ 36.50 | $ 36.50
12 1 |Hyfin Vent Chest Seal Twin Pack, 6 In HX 6 In W 2/Pk S 13.79 | § 13.79 | S 11.44 | S 11.44 | * $13.34/pk of 2 S 1334 | S 13.29 | $ 13.29
13 1 |ARS For Needle Decompression, 14 Ga X 3.25 In, S 938 |S 9.38 | $ 743 | S 743 |§ 9.23 | S 923 | S 8.76 | $ 8.76
14 1 |SOF Tactical Tourniquet - Wide, 1.5 Inch Wide, Rescue Orange| $ 2740 | S 27.40 | $ 30.76 | $ 30.76 | $ 2333 | S 2333 | S 2993 | $ 29.93
15 1 |Curaplex Aneroid Sphygmomanometer, Adult, With Case S 7.00 | S 7.00 | $ 484 | S 484 | S 595 |$ 595 |$ 775 | S 7.75
16 1 |Curaplex Aneroid Sphygmomanometer, Child, With Case S 7.00 | S 7.00 | $ 484 | S 484 | S 535S 535S 930S 9.30
17 1 |Stethoscope Adscope Brand Lightweight Red Adscope 609 S 17.05 | $ 17.05 | $ 16.87 | S 16.87 | $ 15.18 | $§ 15.18 | $ 2245 (S 22.45
18 1 |Stethoscope Adscope Brand Dualhead Neon Pink Pediatric S 492 | S 492 (S 399 | S 399 | $ 238 | S 238 | S 6.40 | $ 6.40
19 1 |Curaplex Fingertip Pulse Oximeter S 22.00 | $ 22.00 | $ 2267 | S 2267 | S 17.80 | § 17.80 | S 32.00 | S 32.00
20 1 |02 Cylinder, D Tank, Aluminum, W/Toggle S 70.41 | S 70.41 | S 60.77 | S 60.77 | S 44.08 | S 44,08 | $ 47.25 | S 47.25

Oxygen Regulator, Rhino, Cga870, 0-25 Lpm, 2 Diss Check
21 1 |Valve, 1 Hose Barb Outlet, Gauge S 209.17 | $ 209.17 | S 26.08 | $ 26.08 | S 27.99 | S 27.99 | $ 143.00 | $ 143.00

Curaplex Oxygen Mask, Adult, Elongated, High Conc, Total
22 2 |NRB W/O Vent, Reservoir Bag, S 0.81|S 162 | S 0.67 | S 134 | S 0.61|S 1.22 | S 150 | $ 3.00

Curaplex Oxygen Mask, Pediatric, Elongated, Total NRB, W/O
23 1 |Safety Vent, 7 Ft S 081 S 0.81 S 071 1S 071 S 071 S 071 |S$ 1.20 | $ 1.20

Mask High Concentration Non Rebreather, Infant, Tubing
24 1 |With Univeral Connector, Latex Free S 1.40 | S 1.40 | $ 1.07 | $ 1.07 | S 150 | S 150 | $ 144 | S 1.44

Curaplex Oxygen Nasal Cannula, Adult, Conventional, Clear,
25 2 |Flared Prongs, 7 Ft Tubing, S 030 |5 0.60 | S 027 | $ 054 | $ 024 | $ 048 | $ 030 $ 0.60
26 1 |Curaplex Oxygen Nasal Cannula, Pediatric, Over-The-Ear, 7Ft | $ 0311S 0311S 029 | S 029 | S 030 |S 030 |S 075 | S 0.75
27 1 |Nasal Cannula W/Tubing, Infant, Straight Tip W/Universal S 0.78 | S 078 | S 056 | S 056 | S 071 071 |8$ 0.70 | $ 0.70
28 1 |Bvm Disp Ad Patriot S 8.67 | S 867 | S 853 S 853 |S 8.54 | S 854 | S 1150 | $ 11.50
29 1 |Bvm Disp Ch Patriot W/ Pop Off Valve S 897 | S 897 |$ 853 S 853 |S 874 | S 874 | S 13.75 | $ 13.75
30 1 |Bvm Disp Inf Patriot S 891 S 891 S 10.05 | $ 10.05 | $ 772 | $ 772 |S 13.75 | $ 13.75
31 1 |02 Nebulizer, LSP 64085, Adult, Mask W/Tubing S 1.78 | $ 1.78 | $ 0.73 | S 073 | S 1.45 | S 1.45 | $ 1.25 | $ 1.25
32 1 [Berman Oral Airway Kit, Incl 43 Mm, 60 Mm, 80 Mm, 90 Mm, | $ 279 | S 279 | S 1.56 | $ 156 | $ 141 | S 141 | S 225§ 2.25
33 1 |Nasopharyngeal Airway Kit, LF, Robertazzi, Incl 20, 24, 28, S 19.40 | $ 19.40 | $ 7.40 | S 7.40 | $ 2157 | S 2157 | S 1450 | $ 14.50
34 1 |Curaplex Tourniquet 1" X 18", Blue, Rolled, Latex-Free 250/ *$21.99/bg of 250 | $ 21.99 | * $25.00/bg of 250 | $ 25.00 | $ 787 |$ 7.87 | *$25.35/bxof | $ 25.35
35 50 |Curaplex IV Catheter, Clearsafe, 14 Ga X 1 1/4 In, Safety S 153 | S 76.50 | * $65.50/box of 50 | $ 65.50 | $$70.83/box S 70.83 | $ 1.78 | $ 89.00
36 50 |Curaplex IV Catheter, Clearsafe, 16 Ga X 1 1/4 In, Safety S 153 | S 76.50 | * $65.50/box of 50 | $ 65.50 | $$70.83/box S 70.83 | $ 1.78 | $ 89.00
37 50 |Curaplex IV Catheter, Clearsafe, 18 Ga X 1 1/4 In, Safety S 153 | S 76.50 | * $65.50/box of 50 | $ 65.50 | $$70.83/box S 70.83 | S 1.78 | $ 89.00
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38 50 |Curaplex IV Catheter, Clearsafe, 20 Ga X 1 1/4 In, Safety S 153 | S 76.50 | * $65.50/box of 50 | $ 65.50 | $$70.83/box S 70.83 | S 1.78 | $ 89.00
39 50 |Curaplex IV Catheter, Clearsafe, 22 Ga X 1 In, Safety S 153 | S 76.50 | * $65.50/box of 50 | $ 65.50 | $$70.83/box S 70.83 | S 1.78 | $ 89.00
40 50 |Curaplex IV Catheter, Clearsafe, 24 Ga X 3/4 In, Safety S 153 | $ 76.50 | * $65.50/box of 50 | $ 65.50 | $$70.83/box S 70.83 | S 1.78 | $ 89.00
41 2 |Needleless IV Set, 10 Drops, 92 In, 1 INTERLINK Splint Septum,| $ 276 | S 552 |$ 1.00 | $ 2.00 | S 295 | S 590 | $ 250 |S 5.00
42 2 |60 Drop Iv Admin Set 1 Clearlink Luer Valve And 1 Interlink S 281 | S 562 |$ 1.00 | $ 2.00 | S 256 | S 512 | S 280 | S 5.60
43 4 |Needle Filter 18 Gauge X 1.5 In 5 Micron Filter S 0.36 | S 1.44 | * $29.00/box of 100| $ 29.00 NO BID S 0.50 | $ 2.00
44 2 |Syringe And Needle, EXEL, 1cc Tuberculin, 25 Ga X 5/8 Inch S 0.10 | $ 0.20 | * $8.18/box of 100 | $ 8.18 | * $8.54/box of 100 | $ 854 | S 0.15 | S 0.30
45 2 |Syringe Only, 5cc, Luer Lock, S 012 | S 0.24 | * $5.50/box of 100 | $ 5.50 | * $7.32/box of 100 | $ 732 |S 0.15 | S 0.30
46 2 |Syringe Only, 10cc, Luer Lock, S 0.15 | S 0.30 | * $5.50/box of 100 | $ 5.50 | * $7.32/box of 100 | $ 732 |S 0.15 | S 0.30
47 2 |Splint, Sam, Orange/Blue, Rolled, 4.25In X 36 In S 821 S 16.42 | S 3.00 | S 6.00 | $ 3.05|S$ 6.10 | S 375 |S 7.50
48 2 |Extrication Collar, Stifneck Select, Adult, Adjustable, Nasal S 6.59 | $§ 13.18 | § 5.09 | $ 10.18 | § 591§ 11.82 | S 575|$ 11.50
49 2 |Extrication Collar, Stifneck Pedi-Select, Pediatric, Adjustable | $ 6.10 | $§ 1220 | $ 509 | $ 10.18 | $ 6.89 | $ 13.78 | $ 580 | S 11.60
50 1 |Emergency Tape, Pediatape, For Pediatric Patients, Measure | $ 18.57 | § 18.57 | § 19.70 | $§ 19.70 | § 31.25 | $ 31.25 | S 4.00 | S 4.00
51 1 |Mask Surgical Cone Shape Dust Mask 50/Bx S 536 |S 536 | S 391 |8$ 3.91 | *$19.95/boxof20 | $ 19.95 | * $54.40/box | $ 54.40
52 1 |Safety Glasses, V20 Purity, Clear Anti-Fog Lens Kimberly Clark | * $1.93/ea S 23.16 | $ 4572 | $ 45.72 | * $43.68/boxof 12 | § 4368 | S 3.00 S 3.00
53 1 |Blade, Laryngoscope, Intubrite, Mac 0, Disposable Dual Led S 6.20 | S 6.20 | S 507 | S 5.07 NO BID S 7.00 | $ 7.00
54 1 |Blade, Laryngoscope, Intubrite, Mac 1, Disposable Dual Led S 6.20 | $ 6.20 | $§ 507 | $ 507 | $ 585§ 585 |S 7.00 | $ 7.00
55 1 |Blade, Laryngoscope, Intubrite, Mac 2, Disposable Dual Led S 6.20 | S 6.20 | S 507 | S 507 | $ 585 |$ 585 |$ 7.00 | $ 7.00
56 1 |Blade, Laryngoscope, Intubrite, Mac 3, Disposable Dual Led S 6.20 | S 6.20 | S 507 | S 507 | $ 585 |$ 585 |$ 7.00 | $ 7.00
57 1 |Blade, Laryngoscope, Intubrite, Mac 4, Disposable Dual Led S 6.20 | $ 6.20 | $§ 507 | $ 507 | $ 585§ 585 | S 7.00 | $ 7.00
58 1 |Blade, Laryngoscope, Intubrite, Miller O, Disposable, Dual Led | $ 6.20 | S 6.20 | S 507 | S 507 | $ 585 |$ 585 |$ 7.00 | S 7.00
59 1 |Blade, Laryngoscope, Intubrite, Miller 1, Disposable, Dual Led | $ 6.20 | S 6.20 | S 507 | S 507 | $ 585 |$ 585 |$ 7.00 | S 7.00
60 1 |Blade, Laryngoscope, Intubrite, Miller 2, Disposable, Dual Led | $ 6.20 | $ 6.20 | $§ 507 | $ 507 | $ 585§ 585 S 7.00 | $ 7.00
61 1 |Blade, Laryngoscope, Intubrite, Miller 3, Disposable, Dual Led | $ 6.20 | S 6.20 | $ 507 | $ 507 | $ 585 |$ 585 |$ 7.00 | S 7.00
62 1 |Blade, Laryngoscope, Intubrite, Miller 4, Disposable, Dual Led | $ 6.20 | S 6.20 | $ 507 | $ 507 | $ 585 |$ 585 |$ 7.00 | S 7.00
63 1 |Curaplex Select Laryngoscope Handle, Reusable, Led, Water- | $ 12.50 | $ 12.50 | $§ 872 |6$ 872 |S 893 |8S 893 | S 575|$ 5.75
64 1 |Curaplex Select Endotracheal Tube With Stylette, 2.5mm, S 1.40 | S 1.40 | $ 1.47 | $ 1.47 | $ 152 | S 152 | S 250 | S 2.50
65 1 |Curaplex Select Endotracheal Tube With Stylette, 3.0mm, S 1.40 | S 1.40 | $ 133 | S 133 | S 118 | $ 1.18 | S 250 | S 2.50
66 1 |Curaplex Select Endotracheal Tube With Stylette, 3.5mm, S 1.40 | $ 1.40 | $ 133 | $ 133 | S 1.18 | $ 1.18 | $ 250 | S 2.50
67 1 |Curaplex Select Endotracheal Tube With Stylette, 4.0mm, S 163 | S 163 | S 130 | $ 130 | $ 118 | $ 1.18 | S 400 S 4.00
68 1 |Curaplex Select Endotracheal Tube With Stylette, 4.5mm, S 163 | S 163 | S 130 | $ 130 | $ 118 | $ 1.18 | S 400 | S 4.00
69 1 |Curaplex Select Endotracheal Tube With Stylette, 5.0mm, S 163 | S 1.63|$ 130 | $ 130 | $ 1.18 | $ 1.18 | $ 250 | S 2.50
70 1 |Curaplex Select Endotracheal Tube With Stylette, 6.5mm, S 163 | S 1.63|S 130 | $ 130 | S 1.18 | S 1.18 | $ 250 | $ 2.50
71 1 |Curaplex Select Endotracheal Tube With Stylette, 7.5mm, S 163 | S 1.63|S 130 | $ 130 | S 1.18 | S 1.18 | $ 250 | $ 2.50
72 1 |Curaplex Select Endotracheal Tube With Stylette, 8.5mm, S 163 |S 1.63 | S 1.30 | S 130 | S 1.18 | S 1.18 | $ 250 | S 2.50
73 1 |ET Tube Introducer, Bougie-To-Go, Adult W/ Coude Tip, 15 S 493 |S 493 | S 3.72 | $ 372 | $ 6.71 | $ 6.71 | $ 775 | $ 7.75
74 1 |Co2 Detector, Easy Cap 6ea/Bx 4bx/Cs (24/Cs) *$11.39/ea S 273.36 | $ 216.72 | $ 216.72 | $ 178.56 | S 178.56 | * $122.00/cs | S 122.00
75 1 |Curaplex Magill Intubating Forceps, Adult S 412 | S 412 | S 350 $ 350 | $ 3.70 | $ 3.70 | § 450 | S 4.50
76 1 |Curaplex Magill Intubating Forceps, Child, 8 In S 412 | S 412 | S 341 |S 341 | S 3.70 | $ 3.70 | § 450 | S 4.50
77 1 |ECG Electrode, Medi-Trace 230, Adult, Foam, Teardrop S 337 |S 337 | S 391 |S$ 391 S 382 |S 3.82 | *$105.40/cs | S 105.40
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78 3 |Curaplex Select Multi-Function Defib Pads, Physio-Control S 19.49 | $§ 58.47 | S 1520 | $ 45.60 | S 13.13 | $ 3939 | S 18.50 | $ 55.50
79 1 |[Suction Unit, LCSU 4 (Laerdal Compact Suction Unit), 300ml S 473.67 | $ 473.67 | $ 456.75 | $ 456.75 | $ 593.86 | $ 593.86 | $ 450.00 | $ 450.00
80 1 |Suction Catheter, SSCOR Ducanto Catheter, Diameter: 0.26 In | $ 207 | $ 207 | S 1.77 | $ 1.77 | S 1.86 | S 1.86 | $ 325 (S 3.25
81 1 |Suction Catheter, 6 Fr, Coiled, W/Whistle Tip And Thumb S 0.18 | S 0.18 | $ 0.17 | S 0.17 | S 0.21S 021 1S 0.25 | S 0.25
82 1 |Suction Catheter, 18 Fr, Coiled, W/Whistle Tip And Thumb S 0.18 | S 0.18 | $ 0.17 | S 0.17 | S 0.19 | S 0.19 | S 0.25 | S 0.25
83 1 |Suction Tubing, 3/16 In. X 1 1/2 Ft, Sterile, Molded Female S 0.98 | S 0.98 | $ 042 |S 0.42 NO BID * $50/cs S 50.00
84 1 |02 MAX Bitrac ED Mask, W/ Neb, Adult MED, W/3-SET Valve | $ 44.00 | S 44.00 NO BID S 3756 | S 37.56 | S 4350 | S 43.50
85 1 |Ferno Trauma/Airway Management Kit Professional li Red S 22263 | $ 22263 | S 208.30 | $ 208.30 | $ 420.00 | $§ 420.00 | $ 280.00 | $ 280.00
86 1 |Case, Pelican 1460EMS, Orange, Adj Tray Dividers, Sharps S 226.90 | $ 226.90 | $ 281.44 | S 281.44 | S 218.00 | S 218.00 | $ 225.00 | $ 225.00
87 1 |[LA Rescue 02 To Go Pro Plus Bag, 28in L X 12in W X 10in H S 110.00 | S 110.00 | S 77.22 | S 77.22 | S 75.00 | S 75.00 | S 250.00 | $ 250.00
88 1 |NIO Pediatric With Start Kit S 102.00 | S 102.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
89 1 |NIO Adult With Start Kit S 102.00 | S 102.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
90 1 |IGELSize 3 Resus Pack Kit With Strap S 2499 | S 24,99 | S 2247 | S 22.47 NO BID S 25.00 | S 25.00
91 1 |IGEL Size4, Resus Pack Kit With Strap S 2499 | S 24,99 | S 2247 | S 22.47 NO BID S 25.00 | S 25.00
92 1 |IGELSize 5, Resus Pack Kit With Strap S 2499 | S 24,99 | S 2247 | S 22.47 NO BID S 25.00 | S 25.00
93 3 |Adenosine 6mg/2ml Vial * $23.24/boxof 10 | $ 23.24 | * $90.75/box of 25 | $ 90.75 NO BID S 540 | S 16.20
94 2 |Albuterol 2.5mg/3ml Vial * $3.15/box of 25 S 3.15 | *$3.20/boxof 25 | $ 3.20 NO BID * $4.25/cs S 4.25
95 2 |Amiodarone 150mg Vial * $45.78/box of 25 | § 45.78 | * $14/box of 10 S 14.00 NO BID S 0.90 | $ 1.80
96 1 |Aspirin 81 Mg/ Tablets 250 Per Bottle * $0.79/bt of 36 S 5.53 | * $0.80/bt of 36 S 5.56 NO BID S 457 | S 4.57
97 3 |Atropine 1mg/10ml Prefilled Syringe * $115.00/box of 10 | $ 115.00 | * $76.00/box of 10 | $ 76.00 NO BID S 12.00 | $ 36.00
98 1 |Benadryl 50mg/ 1ml Prefilled Syringe * $32.00/pk of 25 S 32.00 | * $23.10/box of 10 | $ 23.10 NO BID S 340 | S 3.40
99 2 |Calcium Chloride 1 Gram (10cc Of 10% Soultion) Prefilled * $§115.00/box of 25 | § 115.00 | * $93.40/box of 10 | $ 93.40 NO BID S 1195 | $ 23.90
100 2 |Dextrose/ 50 Ml Prefilled Syringe * $115.00/box of 10 | $ 115.00 | * $141.00/box of 10| $ 141.00 NO BID S 1590 | $ 31.80
101 4 |Epinephrine 1mg/1ml 1:1000 Ampule * $124.00/pk of 10 S 124.00 | * $168.10/pkof 10 | $ 168.10 NO BID S 13.20 | $ 52.80
102 5 |Epinephrine 1mg/10ml 1:10000 Prefilled Syringe * $65.00/boxof 10 | $ 65.00 | * $85.20/box of 10 | $ 85.20 NO BID S 1050 | $ 52.50
103 1 |Lasix 40mg/4mg Prefilled Syringe * $95.00/boxof 10 | $ 95.00 | * $123.30 S 123.30 NO BID S 370 | $ 3.70
104 3 |Lidocaine 100mg/5mg Prefilled * $40.00/boxof 10 | $ 40.00 | * $41.20/boxof 10 | $ 41.20 NO BID S 6.10 | § 18.30
105 2 |Ketamine 500mg/ 5ml Vial * $95.00/box of 10 S 95.00 | * $126.60/box of 10| $ 126.60 NO BID * $195.00/cs S 195.00
106 4 |Mag Sulfate 1 Gram/2ml Vial * $52.00/box of 25 S 52.00 | * $52.75/box of 25 | S 52.75 NO BID S 292 |S 11.68
107 2 |Narcan 2mg/2ml Prefilled Syringe * $350.00/cs of 10 S 350.00 | * $337.00/cs of 10 | $ 337.00 NO BID S 40.00 | $ 80.00
108 1 |Nitroglycerin .04 Mg/ Tablet (Bottle Of 20) * $82.00/box of 100 | $ 82.00 | * $44.00/box of 25 | S 44.00 NO BID S 19.50 | $ 19.50
109 1 |Ondansetron/Zofran 4mg/2mg Vial * $23.00/boxof 25 | $ 23.00 | *$9.75/boxof 25 | S 9.75 NO BID S 090 | S 0.90
110 1 |Sodium Bicarb 50 Meq/50ml Prefilled 8.4% Syringe * $125.00/box of 10 | $ 125.00 | * $131.00/box of 10| $ 131.00 NO BID *$280.70/cs | S 280.70
111 1 |Thiamine 200mg/2ml Vial * $330.00/box of 25 | $ 330.00 | * $225.50/box of 25| $ 225.50 NO BID S 2160 | S 21.60
112 2 |Versed 2mg/2ml Vial * $23.00/box of 25 S 23.00 | * $16.25/box of 25 | $ 16.25 NO BID * $89.00/cs S 89.00
113 1 |Dopamine 400mg/250ml Premix Bag * $115.00/box of 12 | $ 115.00 | * $313.20/box of 18| $ 313.20 NO BID S 13.20 | $ 13.20
114 1 |Lidocaine 1 Gram/250 Ml Premix Bag * $168.00/cs of 24 S 168.00 | * $83.28/cs of 24 S 83.28 NO BID S 975 | $ 9.75
115 1 |Normal Saline 250 MI Bag S 265 |$ 265 |S 214 | S 2.14 NO BID S 575|$ 5.75
116 2 |Normal Saline 1000 Ml Bag S 265 |$ 530 |8$ 229 | S 4.58 NO BID S 495 |S 9.90
Total| $ 5,064.37 N/A - No Bid on Some Lines N/A - No Bid on Some Lines N/A - No Bid on Some Lines
Notes|* Bid Quantities Different. * Bid Quantities Different. * Bid Quantities Different.
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