

Bid Tabulation: Preliminary		Super Sports Sporting Goods, LLC		MAC Uniform		American Eagle Imagewear		Wagner's Team Sports		Brown & Bigelow, Inc.		International Promotional Ideas	
Item #	Description	Bid Price	4XL-5XL Extra	Bid Price	4XL-5XL Extra	Bid Price	4XL-5XL Price	Bid Price	4XL-5XL Extra	Bid Price	4XL-5XL Extra	Bid Price	4XL-5XL Extra
1	Short Sleeve Pocket T-Shirt	\$ 6.85	\$ 2.00	\$ 10.30	\$ 2.00	\$ 9.84	\$ 13.57	\$ 5.40	Varies	\$ 7.33	\$ 2.00	\$ 8.50	\$ 4.00
2	Long Sleeve Pocket T-Shirt	\$ 9.20	\$ 2.00	\$ 12.40	\$ 2.00	\$ 11.26	\$ 14.87	\$ 6.90	Varies	\$ 9.86	\$ 2.00	\$ 11.00	\$ 4.00
3	Dri-Fit Short Sleeve T-Shirt	\$ 5.16	\$ 2.00	\$ 7.50	N/A	\$ 7.36	\$ 10.20	\$ 3.65	Varies	\$ 5.85	\$ 2.00	\$ 8.00	\$ 2.00
4	Dri-Fit Long Sleeve T-Shirt	\$ 7.35	\$ 2.00	\$ 10.20	N/A	\$ 10.16	\$ 15.42	\$ 6.10	Varies	\$ 7.85	\$ 2.00	\$ 10.00	\$ 2.50
5	Hi-Vis Short Sleeve T-Shirt	\$ 15.00	\$ 2.00	\$ 15.90	\$ 4.50	\$ 12.66	N/A	\$ 9.04	N/A	\$ 12.84	\$ 3.50	\$ 13.00	\$ 1.50
6	Hi-Vis Long Sleeve T-Shirt	\$ 19.98	\$ 2.00	\$ 20.50	\$ 4.50	\$ 19.04	N/A	\$ 13.60	N/A	\$ 17.13	\$ 3.50	\$ 17.00	N/A
7	Hi-Vis Cor-Brite Class 3 Zip Hoodie	\$ 38.00	\$ 5.00	\$ 31.90	N/A	\$ 36.01	N/A	\$ 33.85	N/A	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 42.00	\$ 2.00
8	Hi-Vis Cor-Brite Class 3 Crew Sweatshirt	\$ 38.00	\$ 5.00	\$ 28.90	N/A	\$ 37.30	N/A	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 39.00	\$ 2.00
9	Crewneck Sweatshirt	\$ 11.60	\$ 2.00	\$ 15.60	N/A	\$ 13.82	\$ 18.29	\$ 8.39	\$ 2.25	\$ 9.98	\$ 2.50	\$ 11.00	\$ 6.00
10	Full Zip Hooded Sweatshirt	\$ 15.50	\$ 2.00	\$ 28.50	\$ 4.50	\$ 24.24	\$ 35.10	\$ 12.96	Varies	\$ 16.27	\$ 3.00	\$ 79.00	\$ 85.00
11	Hooded Sweatshirt	\$ 13.50	\$ 2.00	\$ 24.90	N/A	\$ 20.45	\$ 29.90	\$ 12.35	Varies	\$ 15.09	\$ 3.00	\$ 14.00	\$ 9.00
12	Short Sleeve Industrial Button-Up Work Shirt	\$ 15.00	\$ 2.00	\$ 13.50	\$ 3.00	\$ 14.90	\$ 16.39	\$ 11.34	\$ 2.15	\$ 12.76	\$ 2.00	\$ 14.00	\$ 2.00
13	Long Sleeve Industrial Button-Up Work Shirt	\$ 16.00	\$ 2.00	\$ 15.90	\$ 1.50	\$ 16.36	\$ 19.42	\$ 12.55	\$ 2.15	\$ 13.94	\$ 2.00	\$ 14.00	\$ 2.00
14	Tech Short Sleeve Polo Shirt	\$ 30.00	N/A	\$ 31.90	N/A	\$ 39.80	\$ 45.65	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 37.28	\$ 3.00	\$ 33.00	\$ 4.00
15	100% Polyester Polo	\$ 16.65	\$ 2.00	\$ 16.90	\$ 4.50	\$ 18.13	\$ 24.95	\$ 11.95	Varies	\$ 14.27	\$ 2.00	\$ 16.00	\$ 3.00
16	60% Cotton/40% Polyester Polo	\$ 12.50	\$ 2.00	\$ 10.90	\$ 8.00	\$ 11.63	\$ 17.05	\$ 7.16	Varies	\$ 8.56	\$ 2.00	\$ 11.00	\$ 6.00
17	Non-Insulated Coveralls	\$ 28.00	N/A	\$ 30.90	\$ 6.00	\$ 33.95	\$ 40.99	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 39.00	\$ 7.00
18	Insulated Coveralls	\$ 51.00	N/A	\$ 74.90	\$ 8.00	\$ 77.64	\$ 79.31	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 77.00	\$ 14.00
19	Non-Insulated Bibs (Overalls)	\$ 66.00	N/A	\$ 37.50	\$ 6.00	\$ 63.71	\$ 69.97	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 80.00	N/A
20	Insulated Bibs (Overalls)	\$ 93.00	N/A	\$ 94.90	N/A	\$ 106.77	\$ 146.15	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 80.00	N/A
21	Hooded Jacket	\$ 86.65	\$ 10.00	\$ 99.90	\$ 10.50	\$ 106.77	\$ 117.33	\$ 75.75	\$ 7.00	\$ 88.27	\$ 5.00	\$ 80.00	\$ 7.00
22	Traditional Quilt-Lined Jacket	\$ 105.00	\$ 10.00	\$ 115.00	\$ 10.00	\$ 127.90	\$ 138.46	\$ 90.50	\$ 7.50	\$ 106.20	\$ 5.00	\$ 65.00	\$ 3.00
23	V-Neck Raglan Wind Shirt	\$ 14.85	\$ 2.00	\$ 18.90	\$ 6.00	\$ 19.75	\$ 26.17	\$ 13.15	Varies	\$ 18.57	\$ 3.00	\$ 19.00	\$ 4.00
24	Men's Full-Zip Fleece Jacket	\$ 26.65	\$ 5.00	\$ 21.90	\$ 4.50	\$ 24.15	\$ 30.55	\$ 21.60	Varies	\$ 19.99	\$ 2.50	\$ 19.00	\$ 4.00
25	Men's Full-Zip Fleece Vest	\$ 26.65	\$ 5.00	\$ 20.30	\$ 4.50	\$ 21.38	\$ 28.80	\$ 13.15	Varies	\$ 17.13	\$ 2.50	\$ 18.00	\$ 3.00
26	Waterproof Jacket	\$ 35.70	\$ 5.00	\$ 40.90	\$ 4.50	\$ 42.51	\$ 47.00	\$ 29.85	Varies	\$ 35.67	\$ 3.00	\$ 35.00	\$ 3.00
27	Waterproof Pants	\$ 32.84	\$ 5.00	\$ 38.00	\$ 4.50	\$ 39.26	\$ 44.68	\$ 27.49	Varies	\$ 28.73	\$ 3.00	\$ 31.00	\$ 3.00
28	Breathable Polyester Adjustable Hat	\$ 6.65	N/A	\$ 4.50	N/A	\$ 5.67	N/A	\$ 4.75	N/A	\$ 5.96	N/A	\$ 10.00	N/A
29	Mesh Back Adjustable Hat	\$ 5.50	N/A	\$ 4.00	N/A	\$ 5.67	N/A	\$ 4.38	N/A	\$ 5.27	N/A	\$ 7.00	N/A
30	6-Panel Cotton Adjustable Hat	\$ 4.75	N/A	\$ 3.20	N/A	\$ 4.04	N/A	\$ 2.49	N/A	\$ 4.63	N/A	\$ 7.00	N/A
31	Low Profile Cotton Twill Visor	\$ 4.50	N/A	\$ 4.00	N/A	\$ 4.85	N/A	\$ 3.15	N/A	\$ 4.63	N/A	\$ 7.00	N/A
32	Acrylic Knit Beanie	\$ 4.98	N/A	\$ 3.00	N/A	\$ 3.39	N/A	\$ 2.89	N/A	\$ 4.50	N/A	\$ 6.00	N/A
33	Sun Hat	\$ 21.00	N/A	\$ 17.10	N/A	\$ 17.47	N/A	\$ 10.70	N/A	\$ 15.38	N/A	\$ 16.00	N/A
34	Twill Relaxed Fit Work Pants	\$ 37.32	N/A	\$ 38.90	N/A	\$ 66.13	N/A	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 33.00	N/A
35	Carpenter Pants	\$ 37.32	N/A	\$ 38.90	N/A	\$ 35.25	\$ 38.55	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 26.00	\$ 5.00
36	Men's Tactical Pants	\$ 68.00	N/A	\$ 42.90	N/A	\$ 57.94	N/A	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 47.00	N/A
37	Men's Industrial Work Pants	\$ 19.75	N/A	\$ 18.30	\$ 3.00	\$ 19.89	\$ 23.64	\$ 14.95	N/A	\$ 16.98	\$ 3.50	\$ 17.50	N/A

Bid Tabulation: Preliminary		Super Sports Sporting Goods, LLC		MAC Uniform		American Eagle Imagewear		Wagner's Team Sports		Brown & Bigelow, Inc.		International Promotional Ideas	
Item #	Description	Bid Price	4XL-5XL Extra	Bid Price	4XL-5XL Extra	Bid Price	4XL-5XL Price	Bid Price	4XL-5XL Extra	Bid Price	4XL-5XL Extra	Bid Price	4XL-5XL Extra
38	Men's Pleated Work Pants	\$ 19.75	N/A	\$ 24.00	\$ 4.50	\$ 26.89	\$ 32.05	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 22.50	\$ 3.50	\$ 27.00	N/A
39	Women's Long Sleeve Industrial Button-Up Work Shirt	\$ 12.50	\$ 3.00	\$ 17.50	N/A	\$ 21.84	\$ 35.85	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 15.37	\$ 2.00	\$ 21.00	\$ 3.00
40	Women's Short Sleeve Industrial Button-Up Work Shirt	\$ 18.50	\$ 3.00	\$ 15.00	\$ 1.50	\$ 15.39	\$ 18.30	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 16.79	\$ 3.00	\$ 18.00	\$ 3.00
41	Women's Blended Polo	\$ 9.98	\$ 5.00	\$ 13.50	\$ 6.00	\$ 14.07	\$ 21.70	\$ 8.95	Varies	\$ 10.70	\$ 2.50	\$ 13.00	\$ 6.00
42	Women's 100% Polyester Polo	\$ 16.65	\$ 2.00	\$ 17.20	\$ 4.50	\$ 18.13	\$ 23.55	\$ 11.95	Varies	\$ 14.27	\$ 2.50	\$ 16.00	\$ 3.00
43	Women's Fleece Vest	\$ 17.21	\$ 2.00	\$ 20.50	\$ 4.50	\$ 21.38	\$ 26.80	\$ 14.35	Varies	\$ 17.13	\$ 2.00	\$ 18.00	\$ 3.00
44	Women's Fleece Jacket	\$ 19.98	\$ 5.00	\$ 23.90	\$ 4.50	\$ 24.15	\$ 29.46	\$ 16.75	Varies	\$ 19.99	\$ 3.00	\$ 20.00	\$ 4.00
45	Women's Cardigan	\$ 28.55	\$ 3.00	\$ 22.30	\$ 4.50	\$ 23.01	\$ 28.42	\$ 23.90	Varies	\$ 27.46	\$ 3.00	\$ 27.00	\$ 3.00
46	Women's Industrial Pants	\$ 19.50	N/A	\$ 19.90	\$ 4.00	\$ 22.44	\$ 26.70	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 18.62	\$ 3.00	\$ 23.00	N/A
47	Women's Tactical Pants	\$ 65.00	N/A	\$ 42.90	N/A	\$ 44.69	N/A	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 47.00	N/A
48	One-Color Embroidery per Garment	\$ 3.50	N/A	\$ 3.00	N/A	\$ 1.95	N/A		N/A	\$ 3.25	N/A	\$ 2.00	N/A
49	Two-Color Embroidery per Garment	\$ 3.75	N/A	\$ 3.00	N/A	\$ 1.95	N/A		N/A	\$ 3.25	N/A	\$ 2.00	N/A
50	One-Color Screen-Printing per Garment	\$ 0.95	N/A	\$ 1.50	N/A	No Charge	N/A		N/A	\$ 1.00	N/A	\$ 1.00	N/A
51	Two-Color Screen-Printing per Garment	\$ 1.25	N/A	\$ 1.50	N/A	No Charge	N/A		N/A	\$ 1.50	N/A	\$ 1.00	N/A
<b>NOTES</b>		Local Bidder - Qualifies for 5% Local Bidder Preference. Some price variances for 2XL & above.		Hat & Visor Embroidery - \$4.50		Bid submissions for 4X-5X are total price, not additional amount.		No Specification or Website Info Included with Bid		No Specification or Website Info Included with Bid		No Specification or Website Info Included with Bid	

Bid Tabulation: Preliminary		Weatherford Office & Janitorial Supply		Galls, LLC		Elaborate Images		Express Press	
Item #	Description	Bid Price	4XL-5XL Extra	Bid Price	4XL-5XL Price	Bid Price	4XL-5XL Extra	Bid Price	4XL-5XL Extra
1	Short Sleeve Pocket T-Shirt	\$ 6.60	\$ 1.05	\$ 7.40	N/A	\$ 7.00	\$ 3.00	\$ 5.00	See Notes
2	Long Sleeve Pocket T-Shirt	\$ 9.00	\$ 1.00	\$ 9.97	\$ 12.90	\$ 8.50	\$ 3.00	\$ 7.80	See Notes
3	Dri-Fit Short Sleeve T-Shirt	\$ 5.40	N/A	\$ 5.96	\$ 8.68	\$ 5.25	\$ 3.00	\$ 4.21	See Notes
4	Dri-Fit Long Sleeve T-Shirt	\$ 7.00	N/A	\$ 7.68	\$ 10.76	\$ 7.00	\$ 3.00	\$ 6.44	See Notes
5	Hi-Vis Short Sleeve T-Shirt	\$ 8.36	N/A	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 9.50	\$ 1.00	\$ 13.01	See Notes
6	Hi-Vis Long Sleeve T-Shirt	\$ 12.86	N/A	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 12.00	\$ 1.00	\$ 16.44	See Notes
7	Hi-Vis Cor-Brite Class 3 Zip Hoodie	\$ 25.65	N/A	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 30.00	\$ 1.00	\$ 37.64	See Notes
8	Hi-Vis Cor-Brite Class 3 Crew Sweatshirt	\$ 23.08	N/A	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 28.75	\$ 1.00	\$ 32.83	See Notes
9	Crewneck Sweatshirt	\$ 11.00	N/A	\$ 11.70	N/A	\$ 8.75	\$ 3.00	\$ 7.52	See Notes
10	Full Zip Hooded Sweatshirt	\$ 23.00	N/A	\$ 23.50	N/A	\$ 19.40	\$ 3.00	\$ 15.19	See Notes
11	Hooded Sweatshirt	\$ 14.00	N/A	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 13.50	\$ 3.00	\$ 11.43	See Notes
12	Short Sleeve Industrial Button-Up Work Shirt	\$ 12.00	N/A	\$ 11.30	\$ 13.54	\$ 12.50	\$ 2.00	\$ 11.30	See Notes
13	Long Sleeve Industrial Button-Up Work Shirt	\$ 13.50	N/A	\$ 13.80	\$ 16.60	\$ 13.75	\$ 2.00	\$ 12.45	See Notes
14	Tech Short Sleeve Polo Shirt	\$ 29.88	N/A	\$ 30.76	N/A	\$ 32.55	\$ 3.00	\$ 10.72	See Notes
15	100% Polyester Polo	\$ 13.00	\$ 1.00	\$ 15.37	N/A	\$ 12.75	\$ 3.00	\$ 11.87	See Notes
16	60% Cotton/40% Polyester Polo	\$ 7.75	\$ 1.00	\$ 9.22	\$ 15.37	\$ 7.95	\$ 3.00	\$ 7.29	See Notes
17	Non-Insulated Coveralls	\$ 38.00	N/A	\$ 31.62	\$ 37.94	\$ 37.50	\$ 3.00	\$ 37.00	See Notes
18	Insulated Coveralls	\$ 72.00	N/A	\$ 57.63	\$ 69.15	\$ 82.50	\$ 3.00	\$ 74.66	See Notes
19	Non-Insulated Bibs (Overalls)	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 66.15	\$ 91.54	\$ 120.00	\$ 120.00	\$ 86.84	See Notes
20	Insulated Bibs (Overalls)	\$ 83.00	N/A	\$ 91.54	\$ 99.23	\$ 82.00	\$ 2.00	\$ 132.60	See Notes
21	Hooded Jacket	\$ 83.00	N/A	\$ 87.69	\$ 95.38	\$ 82.00	\$ 2.00	\$ 75.40	See Notes
22	Traditional Quilt-Lined Jacket	\$ 100.00	N/A	\$ 103.85	\$ 111.54	\$ 97.79	\$ 2.00	\$ 90.27	See Notes
23	V-Neck Raglan Wind Shirt	\$ 14.00	\$ 1.00	\$ 16.91	\$ 23.06	\$ 13.98	\$ 3.00	\$ 13.01	See Notes
24	Men's Full-Zip Fleece Jacket	\$ 16.01	\$ 1.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 15.49	\$ 3.00	\$ 17.04	See Notes
25	Men's Full-Zip Fleece Vest	\$ 14.50	\$ 1.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 14.25	\$ 3.00	\$ 14.76	See Notes
26	Waterproof Jacket	\$ 32.00	\$ 1.00	\$ 38.45	\$ 44.60	\$ 31.75	\$ 3.00	\$ 28.48	See Notes
27	Waterproof Pants	\$ 29.50	\$ 1.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 29.25	\$ 3.00	\$ 26.74	See Notes
28	Breathable Polyester Adjustable Hat	\$ 7.52	N/A	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 4.49	N/A	\$ 4.44	See Notes
29	Mesh Back Adjustable Hat	\$ 6.42	N/A	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 5.50	N/A	\$ 3.30	See Notes
30	6-Panel Cotton Adjustable Hat	\$ 6.10	N/A	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 2.49	N/A	\$ 2.72	See Notes
31	Low Profile Cotton Twill Visor	\$ 6.10	N/A	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 3.25	N/A	\$ 32.90	See Notes
32	Acrylic Knit Beanie	\$ 6.42	N/A	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 1.99	N/A	\$ 2.27	See Notes
33	Sun Hat	\$ 13.00	N/A	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 12.81	N/A	\$ 12.16	See Notes
34	Twill Relaxed Fit Work Pants	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 32.31	N/A	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 49.09	See Notes
35	Carpenter Pants	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 55.95	See Notes
36	Men's Tactical Pants	\$ 60.00	N/A	\$ 39.85	N/A	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 46.01	See Notes
37	Men's Industrial Work Pants	\$ 16.00	N/A	\$ 16.05	N/A	\$ 16.25	\$ 3.00	\$ 15.34	See Notes

Bid Tabulation: Preliminary		Weatherford Office & Janitorial Supply		Galls, LLC		Elaborate Images		Express Press	
Item #	Description	Bid Price	4XL-5XL Extra	Bid Price	4XL-5XL Price	Bid Price	4XL-5XL Extra	Bid Price	4XL-5XL Extra
38	Men's Pleated Work Pants	\$ 26.50	N/A	\$ 20.06	N/A	\$ 27.52	\$ 3.00	\$ 25.69	See Notes
39	Women's Long Sleeve Industrial Button-Up Work Shirt	\$ 16.50	\$ 12.00	\$ 13.17	\$ 15.80	\$ 19.00	\$ 3.00	\$ 17.30	See Notes
40	Women's Short Sleeve Industrial Button-Up Work Shirt	\$ 14.00	N/A	\$ 11.53	\$ 17.68	\$ 16.00	\$ 3.00	\$ 14.46	See Notes
41	Women's Blended Polo	\$ 9.50	\$ 1.00	\$ 15.37	\$ 21.53	\$ 9.89	\$ 3.00	\$ 9.02	See Notes
42	Women's 100% Polyester Polo	\$ 12.75	\$ 1.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 12.98	\$ 3.00	\$ 11.87	See Notes
43	Women's Fleece Vest	\$ 15.00	\$ 1.00	\$ 18.45	\$ 24.60	\$ 15.49	\$ 3.00	\$ 14.76	See Notes
44	Women's Fleece Jacket	\$ 18.00	\$ 1.00	\$ 21.53	\$ 27.68	\$ 17.99	\$ 3.00	\$ 17.04	See Notes
45	Women's Cardigan	\$ 26.50	N/A	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 25.49	\$ 3.00	\$ 23.31	See Notes
46	Women's Industrial Pants	\$ 25.00	N/A	\$ 19.02	\$ 22.82	\$ 19.00	\$ 3.00	\$ 21.43	See Notes
47	Women's Tactical Pants	\$ 60.00	N/A	\$ 37.70	\$ 41.39	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
48	One-Color Embroidery per Garment	\$ 4.50	N/A	\$ 3.50	N/A	\$ 2.04	N/A	\$ 2.00	N/A
49	Two-Color Embroidery per Garment	\$ 4.50	N/A	\$ 5.00	N/A	\$ 2.04	N/A	\$ 2.00	N/A
50	One-Color Screen-Printing per Garment	\$ 3.50	N/A	\$ 4.75	N/A	\$ 0.46	N/A	\$ 0.75	N/A
51	Two-Color Screen-Printing per Garment	\$ 4.00	N/A	\$ 5.75	N/A	\$ 0.52	N/A	\$ 1.25	N/A
<b>NOTES</b>		Local Bidder - Qualifies for 5% Local Bidder Preference. Some price variances for 2XL & above.		Some price variances for 2XL & above. Bid submissions for 4X-5X are total price, not additional amount.		No Specification or Website Info Included with Bid		Bid prices are for S-XL. 2XL - \$2.00 more, 3XL - \$3.00 more, 4XL & 5XL - \$5.00 more	