

Bid Tabulation: Preliminary			Vendor A		Vendor B		Vendor C	
			Temple, Inc.		Southern Lighting & Traffic Systems		Inline Electric Supply Co.	
Item #	Qty	Product Item #	Cost Each	Total Price	Cost Each	Total Price	Cost Each	Total Price
<b>Traffic Signal Poles</b>								
1	5	Metal Traffic Signal Pole with 20 Foot Mast Arm	NO BID		\$ 9,040.00	\$ 45,200.00	\$ 8,953.00	\$ 44,765.00
2	3	Metal Traffic Signal Pole with 25 Foot Mast Arm	NO BID		\$ 9,180.00	\$ 27,540.00	\$ 9,399.00	\$ 28,197.00
3	2	Metal Traffic Signal Pole with 30 Foot Mast Arm	NO BID		\$ 9,830.00	\$ 19,660.00	\$ 9,910.00	\$ 19,820.00
4	4	Metal Traffic Signal Pole with 35 Foot Mast Arm	NO BID		\$ 10,850.00	\$ 43,400.00	\$ 10,918.00	\$ 43,672.00
5	1	Metal Traffic Signal Pole with 40 Foot Mast Arm	NO BID		\$ 10,245.00	\$ 10,245.00	\$ 10,464.00	\$ 10,464.00
6	2	Metal Traffic Signal Pole with 50 Foot Mast Arm	NO BID		\$ 12,715.00	\$ 25,430.00	\$ 14,310.00	\$ 28,620.00
7	1	Metal Traffic Signal Pole with 30 Foot and 50 Foot Mast Arm	NO BID		\$ 15,510.00	\$ 15,510.00	\$ 15,097.00	\$ 15,097.00
8	1	Metal Traffic Signal Pole with 30 Foot and 55 Foot Mast Arm	NO BID		\$ 16,775.00	\$ 16,775.00	\$ 17,970.50	\$ 17,970.50
9	1	Metal Traffic Signal Pole with 30 Foot and 60 Foot Mast Arm	NO BID		\$ 17,025.00	\$ 17,025.00	\$ 16,484.00	\$ 16,484.00
10	1	Metal Traffic Signal Pole with 35 Foot and 40 Foot Mast Arm	NO BID		\$ 12,885.00	\$ 12,885.00	\$ 15,430.00	\$ 15,430.00
11	3	Metal Traffic Signal Pole with 35 Foot and 45 Foot Mast Arm	NO BID		\$ 13,885.00	\$ 41,655.00	\$ 15,448.00	\$ 46,344.00
12	1	Metal Traffic Signal Pole with 35 Foot and 50 Foot Mast Arm	NO BID		\$ 14,515.00	\$ 14,515.00	\$ 15,456.00	\$ 15,456.00
13	1	Metal Traffic Signal Pole with 40 Foot and 45 Foot Mast Arm	NO BID		\$ 13,945.00	\$ 13,945.00	\$ 15,642.00	\$ 15,642.00
14	1	Metal Traffic Signal Pole with 40 Foot and 50 Foot Mast Arm	NO BID		\$ 14,760.00	\$ 14,760.00	\$ 17,778.00	\$ 17,778.00
15	1	Metal Traffic Signal Pole with 40 Foot and 55 Foot Mast Arm	NO BID		\$ 16,860.00	\$ 16,860.00	\$ 18,113.00	\$ 18,113.00
16	2	Metal Traffic Signal Pole with 45 Foot and 45 Foot Mast Arm	NO BID		\$ 14,150.00	\$ 28,300.00	\$ 18,592.00	\$ 37,184.00
17	1	Metal Traffic Signal Pole with 50 Foot and 50 Foot Mast Arm	NO BID		\$ 16,800.00	\$ 16,800.00	\$ 20,330.00	\$ 20,330.00
18	1	Metal Traffic Signal Pole with 50 Foot and 55 Foot Mast Arm	NO BID		\$ 16,455.00	\$ 16,455.00	\$ 20,383.00	\$ 20,383.00
19	32	6' Luminaire Extension (Fixture "T")	NO BID		\$ 205.00	\$ 6,560.00	\$ 220.00	\$ 7,040.00
20	32	Luminaire Assembly	NO BID		\$ 1,250.00	\$ 40,000.00	\$ 1,292.50	\$ 41,360.00
		<b>Traffic Signal Poles Subtotal</b>	N/A		\$	443,520.00	\$	480,149.50
<b>Street Light Poles</b>								
21	42	Metal 30 Foot Pole with 6 Foot and 3 Foot Luminaire Extension Arms (Fixture "A")	NO BID		\$ 4,700.00	\$ 197,400.00	\$ 3,232.00	\$ 135,744.00
22	72	Metal 16 Foot Pole with 3 Foot Luminaire Extension Arm (Fixture "B")	NO BID		\$ 3,940.00	\$ 283,680.00	\$ 2,715.00	\$ 195,480.00
23	4	Metal 20 Foot Pole with 6 Foot Luminaire Extension Arm (Fixture "D")	NO BID		\$ 3,975.00	\$ 15,900.00	\$ 3,064.00	\$ 12,256.00
24	1	Metal 20 Foot Pole with Dual 6 Foot Luminaire Extension Arm (Fixture "F")	NO BID		\$ 4,110.00	\$ 4,110.00	\$ 3,286.00	\$ 3,286.00
25	162	Luminaire Assembly	NO BID		\$ 1,250.00	\$ 202,500.00	\$ 1,129.50	\$ 182,979.00

		<b>Street Light Poles Subtotal</b>	N/A	\$	703,590.00	\$	529,745.00
<b>Pedestrian Light Poles</b>							
26	11	Metal 4 Foot Pedestrian Push Button Pole	NO BID	\$	2,595.00	\$	28,545.00
27	73	Metal 10 Foot Pedestrian Signal Pole	NO BID	\$	3,165.00	\$	231,045.00
		<b>Pedestrian Poles Subtotal</b>	N/A	\$	259,590.00	\$	95,052.00
<b>Street Signs</b>							
28	2	12th Street LED Sign	\$ 1,157.00	\$ 2,314.00	\$ 1,300.00	\$ 1,300.00	NO BID
29	2	11th Street LED Sign	\$ 1,157.00	\$ 2,314.00	\$ 1,300.00	\$ 2,600.00	NO BID
30	2	Paul W. Bryant Drive LED Sign	\$ 1,556.00	\$ 3,112.00	\$ 1,620.00	\$ 3,240.00	NO BID
31	2	Stillman Boulevard LED Sign	\$ 1,250.00	\$ 2,500.00	\$ 1,515.00	\$ 3,030.00	NO BID
32	2	8th Street LED Sign	\$ 1,157.00	\$ 2,314.00	\$ 1,300.00	\$ 2,600.00	NO BID
33	2	7th Street LED Sign	\$ 1,157.00	\$ 2,314.00	\$ 1,300.00	\$ 2,600.00	NO BID
34	2	6th Street LED Sign	\$ 1,157.00	\$ 2,314.00	\$ 1,300.00	\$ 2,600.00	NO BID
35	2	University Boulevard LED Sign	\$ 1,436.00	\$ 2,872.00	\$ 1,515.00	\$ 3,030.00	NO BID
36	16	Lurleen Wallace Boulevard N LED Sign	\$ 1,595.00	\$ 25,520.00	\$ 1,725.00	\$ 27,600.00	NO BID
37	16	Lurleen Wallace Boulevard S LED Sign	\$ 1,595.00	\$ 25,520.00	\$ 1,725.00	\$ 27,600.00	NO BID
		<b>Street Signs Subtotal</b>	\$ 71,094.00	\$	76,200.00		N/A
		<b>Total</b>	N/A	\$	<b>1,482,900.00</b>		N/A
		<b>Notes</b>					