

| Bid Tabulation: Preliminary | | Vendor A | Vendor B | Vendor C | Vendor D | Vendor E | Vendor F | Vendor G |
|---|--|----------------------------|-----------------|---------------------------|-------------|----------------------|------------------------|-------------------|
| | | Consolidated Pipe & Supply | Keeling Company | Walter A. Wood Supply Co. | Core & Main | Ferguson Enterprises | Southern Pipe & Supply | J&G Culverts Inc. |
| Item # | Description | Bid Price | Bid Price | Bid Price | Bid Price | Bid Price | Bid Price | Bid Price |
| SCHEDULE 1 - COPPER PIPE | | | | | | | | |
| 1 | 3/4" COPPER PIPE TYPE K SOFT | \$ 2.78 | No Bid | \$ 2.54 | No Bid | \$ 3.10 | \$ 3.57 | |
| 2 | 1" COPPER PIPE TYPE K SOFT | \$ 3.62 | No Bid | \$ 3.30 | No Bid | \$ 4.05 | \$ 4.64 | |
| | | SCHEDULE TOTAL | \$ - | \$ 5.84 | \$ - | \$ 7.15 | \$ 8.21 | \$ - |
| SCHEDULE 2 - DUCTILE IRON PIPE | | | | | | | | |
| 3 | 12" CLASS 50 - D. I. PIPE | \$ 26.50 | No Bid | \$ 27.62 | No Bid | \$ 27.24 | \$ 26.03 | |
| 4 | 24" CLASS 50 - D. I. PIPE | \$ 64.96 | No Bid | \$ 67.63 | No Bid | \$ 66.59 | \$ 63.21 | |
| 5 | 4" CLASS 52 - D. I. PIPE | \$ 17.36 | No Bid | \$ 18.07 | No Bid | \$ 18.16 | \$ 17.62 | |
| 6 | 6" CLASS 52 - D. I. PIPE | \$ 13.43 | No Bid | \$ 13.98 | No Bid | \$ 13.76 | \$ 13.23 | |
| 7 | 8" CLASS 52 - D. I. PIPE | \$ 18.95 | No Bid | \$ 19.64 | No Bid | \$ 19.45 | \$ 18.64 | |
| 8 | 12" STEEL CASING PIPE .375 WALL THICKNESS - 20 FT. LONG | \$ 18.00 | No Bid | \$ 17.54 | No Bid | \$ 30.50 | \$ 35.90 | |
| | | SCHEDULE TOTAL | \$ - | \$ 164.48 | \$ - | \$ 175.70 | \$ 174.63 | \$ - |
| SCHEDULE 3 - HDPE PIPE | | | | | | | | |
| 9 | 15" HDPE Pipe | \$ 6.19 | No Bid | \$ 6.19 | No Bid | \$ 8.60 | \$ 6.58 | \$ 7.26 |
| 10 | 18" HDPE Pipe | \$ 7.79 | No Bid | \$ 7.80 | No Bid | \$ 11.65 | \$ 8.28 | \$ 8.90 |
| 11 | 24" HDPE Pipe | \$ 13.59 | No Bid | \$ 13.58 | No Bid | \$ 17.85 | \$ 14.41 | \$ 15.24 |
| 12 | 30" HDPE Pipe | \$ 19.35 | No Bid | \$ 19.35 | No Bid | \$ 26.15 | \$ 20.54 | \$ 21.43 |
| 13 | 36" HDPE Pipe | \$ 26.09 | No Bid | \$ 26.09 | No Bid | \$ 32.65 | \$ 25.58 | \$ 27.95 |
| | | SCHEDULE TOTAL | \$ - | \$ 73.01 | \$ - | \$ 96.90 | \$ 75.39 | \$ 80.78 |
| SCHEDULE 4 - GALVANIZED PIPE | | | | | | | | |
| 14 | 3/4" GALV. PIPE (T & C) (10 FT. Long) | \$ 30.00 | No Bid | 1.14/ft=\$11.40 | No Bid | \$ 48.00 | 2.32/ft=\$23.20 | |
| 15 | 1" GALV. PIPE (T & C) (10 FT. LONG) | \$ 34.00 | No Bid | 1.28/ft=\$12.80 | No Bid | \$ 54.00 | 3.69/ft=\$36.90 | |
| 16 | 1 1/2" GALV. PIPE (T & C) (10 FT. LONG) | \$ 67.00 | No Bid | 1.71/ft=\$17.10 | No Bid | \$ 70.00 | 6.11/ft=61.10 | |
| | | SCHEDULE TOTAL | \$ - | \$ 41.30 | \$ - | \$ 172.00 | \$ 121.20 | \$ - |
| SCHEDULE 5 - FIRE HYDRANTS & ACCESSORIES | | | | | | | | |
| 17 | FIRE HYDRANTS (SPECIFY BRAND AND MODEL) M. J. 3 FT. BURY | \$ 1,274.24 | No Bid | \$ 1,525.13 | \$ 1,450.00 | \$ 1,285.00 | \$ 1,277.91 | |
| 18 | FIRE HYDRANTS (SPECIFY BRAND AND MODEL) M. J. 4 FT. BURY | \$ 1,323.05 | No Bid | \$ 1,584.38 | \$ 1,515.00 | \$ 1,334.00 | \$ 1,327.49 | |
| 19 | 12" FIRE HYDRANT EXTENSION FOR 4 1/2 AMERICAN HYDRANT | \$ 245.00 | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | \$ 174.00 | \$ 196.76 | |
| 20 | 24" FIRE HYDRANT EXT. FOR 4 1/2" AMERICAN HYDRANT | \$ 310.00 | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | \$ 223.00 | \$ 218.43 | |
| 21 | FIRE HYDRANT SAFETY FLANGE REPAIR KITS FOR AM. HYDRANT | \$ 145.00 | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | \$ 68.00 | \$ 91.55 | |

| Bid Tabulation: Preliminary | | Vendor A | Vendor B | Vendor C | Vendor D | Vendor E | Vendor F | Vendor G |
|--|---|-------------------------------|--------------------|---------------------------------|-------------|-------------------------|---------------------------|----------------------|
| | | Consolidated Pipe & Supply | Keeling Company | Walter A. Wood Supply Co. | Core & Main | Ferguson Enterprises | Southern Pipe & Supply | J&G Culverts Inc. |
| Item # | Description | Bid Price | Bid Price | Bid Price | Bid Price | Bid Price | Bid Price | Bid Price |
| 22 | FIRE HYDRANT SHOE REPAIR KITS FOR AMERICAN HYDRANT | \$ 128.00 | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | \$ 128.00 | \$ 69.79 | |
| 23 | FIRE HYDRANT SAFETY FLANGE REPAIR KITS FOR MUELLER HYDRANTS | \$ 219.00 | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | \$ 90.00 | \$ 107.56 | |
| 24 | FIRE HYDRANTS (SPECIFY BRAND AND MODEL) M. J. 3 FT 6 IN BURY | \$ 1,298.62 | No Bid | \$ 1,554.60 | \$ 1,477.00 | \$ 1,309.00 | \$ 1,302.54 | |
| 25 | 6" M. J. Run x 6" Split Gland Hydrant Tees | \$ 81.00 | No Bid | \$ 80.62 | No Bid | \$ 75.50 | \$ 73.34 | |
| 26 | 6" FIRE HYDRANT EXT. FOR 4 1/2" AMERICAN HYDRANT | \$ 225.00 | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | \$ 149.00 | \$ 146.49 | |
| | SCHEDULE TOTAL | \$ 5,248.91 | \$ - | N/A | N/A | \$ 4,835.50 | \$ 4,811.86 | \$ - |
| SCHEDULE 6 - MANHOLE RINGS, COVERS, RISERS, ACCESSORIES | | | | | | | | |
| 27 | MANHOLE RING & COVER, STANDARD | \$ 244.00 | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | \$ 275.00 | \$ 237.79 | |
| 28 | MANHOLE ADJUSTMENT RING 3" | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | \$ 65.00 | \$ 47.37 | |
| 29 | MANHOLE ADJUSTMENT RING 4" | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | \$ 85.00 | \$ 47.37 | |
| 30 | MANHOLE ECCENTRIC CONE TOP 48" X 36" | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | \$ 490.00 | \$ 198.98 | |
| 31 | MANHOLE BAR (KEN-TOOL#33223) | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | \$ 38.00 | \$ 30.68 | |
| 32 | 1" ORLANDO RISER RING (23-2-1) | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | \$ 222.23 | |
| | SCHEDULE TOTAL | N/A | \$ - | \$ - | \$ - | N/A | \$ 784.42 | \$ - |
| SCHEDULE 7 - METER ACCESSORIES | | | | | | | | |
| 33 | 1 1/2" BRONZE METER FLANGES WITH BOLTS & GASKETS | \$ 52.00 | No Bid | \$ 50.55 | No Bid | \$ 32.35 | \$ 49.65 | |
| 34 | 3/4" COMP X FIP CURB STOP MCDONALD 6102WT OR EQUAL | \$ 37.70 | No Bid | \$ 53.37 | No Bid | \$ 39.97 | \$ 43.87 | |
| 35 | 3/4" CORPORATION STOPS MCDONALD 4701T OR EQUAL | \$ 30.67 | No Bid | \$ 42.85 | No Bid | \$ 21.81 | \$ 36.44 | |
| 36 | 3/4" METER COUPLINGS 2" LONG | \$ 6.49 | No Bid | \$ 4.39 | No Bid | \$ 6.96 | \$ 7.33 | |
| 37 | 1" METER COUPLINGS 2 1/2" LONG | \$ 24.49 | No Bid | \$ 5.74 | No Bid | \$ 10.72 | \$ 12.85 | |
| 38 | 3/4" X 1/16" FIBER METER WASHERS | \$ 0.07 | No Bid | \$ 0.22 | No Bid | \$ 0.72 | \$ 0.08 | |
| 39 | 3/4" X 1/32" FIBER METER WASHERS | \$ 0.07 | No Bid | \$ 0.17 | No Bid | \$ 0.21 | \$ 0.08 | |
| 40 | 3 X 5 X 36" METER VAULT | \$ 1,674.00 | No Bid | \$ 1,000.00 | No Bid | \$ 1,386.00 | \$ 1,389.37 | |
| 41 | 4 X 6 X 48" METER VAULT (927 lb body,391 lb for lids) | \$ 2,475.00 | No Bid | \$ 2,000.00 | No Bid | \$ 2,345.00 | \$ 2,388.30 | |
| 42 | STANDARD PLASTIC METER BOX (10"X15"X10") (WITH SOLID C. I. LID) | \$ 18.00 | No Bid | \$ 18.95 | No Bid | \$ 23.00 | \$ 146.81 | |
| 43 | JUMBO PLASTIC METER BOX (13"X20"X12") WITH | \$ 39.00 | No Bid | \$ 37.00 | No Bid | \$ 60.00 | \$ 43.61 | |
| 44 | 3/4" WILKINS #700 (FIP X FIP) BACKFLOW PREVENTERS OR EQUAL | \$ 18.25 | \$ 18.64 | \$ 26.55 | \$ 20.00 | \$ 17.89 | \$ 18.60 | |
| 45 | 1" WILKINS #700 (FIP X FIP) BACKFLOW PREVENTERS OR EQUAL | \$ 20.40 | \$ 20.81 | \$ 29.67 | \$ 22.00 | \$ 19.97 | \$ 20.76 | |
| 46 | 2" WILKINS #950 BACKFLOW PREVENTERS OR EQUAL (19 1/2" long) | \$ 283.00 | \$ 282.10 | \$ 351.90 | \$ 297.00 | \$ 270.68 | \$ 281.37 | |
| 47 | 1 1/2" BACKFLOW PREVENTER(WATTS 007QT 16 3/4" long) | \$ 249.00 | \$ 243.15 | \$ 401.87 | \$ 265.00 | \$ 234.07 | \$ 236.48 | |

| Bid Tabulation: Preliminary | | Vendor A | Vendor B | Vendor C | Vendor D | Vendor E | Vendor F | Vendor G |
|--------------------------------------|---|----------------------------|-----------------|---------------------------|-------------|----------------------|------------------------|-------------------|
| | | Consolidated Pipe & Supply | Keeling Company | Walter A. Wood Supply Co. | Core & Main | Ferguson Enterprises | Southern Pipe & Supply | J&G Culverts Inc. |
| Item # | Description | Bid Price | Bid Price | Bid Price | Bid Price | Bid Price | Bid Price | Bid Price |
| 48 | MSP STANDARD 11" X 18" X 12" Meter Box & Lid | \$ 134.00 | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | \$ 115.00 | \$ 107.72 | |
| 49 | 3/4" X 1/8" Thick Rubber Meter Washer | \$ 0.08 | No Bid | \$ 0.43 | No Bid | \$ 0.08 | \$ 0.10 | |
| 50 | 1-1/2" Full Face Meter Gasket | \$ 0.70 | No Bid | \$ 1.52 | No Bid | \$ 2.10 | \$ 0.75 | |
| 51 | 2" Full Face Meter Gasket | \$ 0.79 | No Bid | \$ 1.66 | No Bid | \$ 2.80 | \$ 0.88 | |
| 52 | HAND PUMP (METER BOX) | \$ 30.00 | No Bid | \$ 24.00 | No Bid | \$ 29.00 | \$ 26.69 | |
| 53 | 3/4" X 1/32" Rubber Meter Washers | \$ 0.07 | No Bid | \$ 0.17 | No Bid | \$ 0.08 | \$ 0.08 | |
| SCHEDULE TOTAL | | \$ 5,093.78 | N/A | N/A | N/A | \$ 4,618.41 | \$ 4,811.82 | \$ - |
| SCHEDULE 8 - WATER METERS | | | | | | | | |
| 54 | 3/4" i PERL S METER | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | \$ 112.09 | No Bid | No Bid | |
| 55 | 3/4" iPERL L METER | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | \$ 124.82 | No Bid | No Bid | |
| 56 | 1" iPERL (METER) | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | \$ 160.26 | No Bid | No Bid | |
| 57 | 1 1/2" SENSUS WATER METERS, OMNI R2, CU. FT. | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | \$ 411.40 | No Bid | No Bid | |
| 58 | 1 1/2" SENSUS WATER METERS, OMNI C2, CU. FT. (13" long) | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | \$ 1,040.00 | No Bid | No Bid | |
| 59 | 2" SENSUS WATER METERS, OMNI C2, CU. FT. (15 1/4" long) | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | \$ 1,265.18 | No Bid | No Bid | |
| 60 | 2" SENSUS WATER METERS OMNI R2, CU. FT. | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | \$ 577.22 | No Bid | No Bid | |
| 61 | 3" SENSUS WATER METERS, OMNI C2, CU. FT. (17" long) | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | \$ 1,512.13 | No Bid | No Bid | |
| 62 | 4" SENSUS WATER METERS, OMNI C2, CU. FT. (20" long) | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | \$ 2,521.31 | No Bid | No Bid | |
| SCHEDULE TOTAL | | \$ - | \$ - | \$ - | \$ 7,724.41 | \$ - | \$ - | \$ - |
| SCHEDULE 9 - PIPE ACCESSORIES | | | | | | | | |
| 63 | 2" RED BRASS PIPE (SEAMLESS) (12 FT. LONG) | \$ 24.00 | No Bid | \$ 28.00 | No Bid | \$ 23.12 | \$ 20.52 | |
| 64 | 2" GALV. PIPE (T & C) (10 FT. LONG) | \$ 75.00 | No Bid | \$ 3.72 | No Bid | \$ 124.00 | \$ 5.76 | |
| 65 | 6" Run x 4" Branch M. J. Tees | \$ 65.25 | No Bid | \$ 64.97 | \$ 77.00 | \$ 77.95 | \$ 59.10 | |
| 66 | 6" Run x 6" Branch M. J. Tees | \$ 70.15 | No Bid | \$ 69.96 | \$ 83.00 | \$ 83.95 | \$ 63.64 | |
| 67 | 8" Run x 6" Branch M. J. Tees | \$ 87.38 | No Bid | \$ 86.95 | \$ 103.00 | \$ 104.33 | \$ 79.10 | |
| 68 | 8" x 6" Concentric M. J. Reducers | \$ 40.90 | No Bid | \$ 40.98 | \$ 49.00 | \$ 49.17 | \$ 37.28 | |
| 69 | 6" 90 Degree Mechanical Joint Bend | \$ 48.38 | No Bid | \$ 48.31 | \$ 58.00 | \$ 57.96 | \$ 43.94 | |
| 70 | 8" 90 Degree Mechanical Joint Bend | \$ 70.50 | No Bid | \$ 70.30 | \$ 84.00 | \$ 84.35 | \$ 63.94 | |
| 71 | 4" 45 Degree Mechanical Joint Bend | \$ 24.38 | No Bid | \$ 24.32 | \$ 29.00 | \$ 29.18 | \$ 22.13 | |
| 72 | 6" 45 Degree Mechanical Joint Bend | \$ 39.38 | No Bid | \$ 39.31 | \$ 47.00 | \$ 47.36 | \$ 35.76 | |
| 73 | 6" 22 1/2 Degree Mechanical Joint Bend | \$ 36.00 | No Bid | \$ 35.98 | \$ 43.00 | \$ 43.17 | \$ 32.73 | |

| Bid Tabulation: Preliminary | | Vendor A | Vendor B | Vendor C | Vendor D | Vendor E | Vendor F | Vendor G |
|-----------------------------|---|-------------------------------|--------------------|---------------------------------|-------------|-------------------------|---------------------------|----------------------|
| | | Consolidated Pipe & Supply | Keeling Company | Walter A. Wood Supply Co. | Core & Main | Ferguson Enterprises | Southern Pipe & Supply | J&G Culverts Inc. |
| Item # | Description | Bid Price | Bid Price | Bid Price | Bid Price | Bid Price | Bid Price | Bid Price |
| 74 | 8" 22 1/2 Degree Mechanical Joint Bend | \$ 56.25 | No Bid | \$ 55.97 | \$ 67.00 | \$ 67.16 | \$ 50.91 | |
| 75 | 8" 11 1/4 Degree Mechanical Joint Bend | \$ 51.00 | No Bid | \$ 50.97 | \$ 61.00 | \$ 61.16 | \$ 46.37 | |
| 76 | 6" X 12" ANCHOR COUPLINGS, DUCTILE IRON | \$ 79.90 | No Bid | \$ 79.63 | \$ 95.00 | \$ 95.54 | \$ 72.43 | |
| 77 | 8" X 12" ANCHOR COUPLINGS, DUCTILE IRON | \$ 102.38 | No Bid | \$ 101.95 | \$ 121.00 | \$ 122.32 | \$ 92.73 | |
| 78 | 4" MJ Plug with 2" IPT Tap | \$ 25.25 | No Bid | \$ 25.32 | \$ 30.00 | \$ 30.38 | \$ 23.04 | |
| 79 | 8" MJ Plug with 2" IPT Tap | \$ 50.25 | No Bid | \$ 50.31 | \$ 60.00 | \$ 60.36 | \$ 45.76 | |
| 80 | 4" Run x 4" Branch Flanged Tees | \$ 100.15 | No Bid | \$ 99.95 | \$ 113.00 | \$ 119.93 | \$ 35.46 | |
| 81 | 4" 90 Degree Flanged Bend | \$ 54.75 | No Bid | \$ 54.64 | \$ 62.00 | \$ 65.56 | \$ 49.70 | |
| 82 | 4" MEGALUG RESTRAINED GLAND, DUCTILE IRON | \$ 16.84 | No Bid | \$ 14.19 | \$ 28.00 | \$ 15.72 | \$ 13.79 | |
| 83 | 6" MEGALUG RESTRAINED GLAND, DUCTILE IRON | \$ 19.80 | No Bid | \$ 16.69 | \$ 35.00 | \$ 18.49 | \$ 16.22 | |
| 84 | 8" MEGALUG RESTRAINED GLAND, DUCTILE IRON | \$ 29.80 | No Bid | \$ 25.08 | \$ 47.00 | \$ 27.80 | \$ 24.38 | |
| 85 | 12" MEGALUG RESTRAINED GLAND, DUCTILE IRON | \$ 64.30 | No Bid | \$ 54.16 | \$ 90.00 | \$ 60.03 | \$ 52.63 | |
| 86 | 16" MEGALUG RESTRAINED GLAND, DUCTILE IRON | \$ 121.75 | No Bid | \$ 102.59 | \$ 162.00 | \$ 113.70 | \$ 99.70 | |
| 87 | 4" FLANGE PACK (BOLTS, NUTS, GASKET) | \$ 6.75 | No Bid | \$ 5.99 | No Bid | \$ 8.25 | \$ 6.77 | |
| 88 | 3/4" x 3 1/2" Long T-Head Bolt with heavy hex nut | \$ 1.26 | No Bid | \$ 0.98 | No Bid | \$ 1.04 | \$ 0.90 | |
| 89 | 3/4" x 4" Long T-Head Bolt with heavy hex nut | \$ 1.26 | No Bid | \$ 0.98 | No Bid | \$ 1.11 | \$ 0.90 | |
| 90 | 3/4" x 4 1/2" Long T-Head Bolt with heavy hex nut | \$ 1.40 | No Bid | \$ 1.08 | No Bid | \$ 1.16 | \$ 0.99 | |
| 91 | DUCTILE LUGS DUCTILE IRON (MEETING ASTM A536-80) | \$ 1.80 | No Bid | \$ 1.41 | No Bid | \$ 1.46 | \$ 1.52 | |
| 92 | 3/4" HEAVY HEX NUTS | \$ 0.48 | No Bid | \$ 0.25 | No Bid | \$ 1.48 | \$ 0.76 | |
| 93 | 4" MJ Gasket for 4" Nominal Diameter Fittings | \$ 3.00 | No Bid | \$ 2.33 | No Bid | \$ 2.59 | \$ 2.13 | |
| 94 | 6" MJ Gasket for 6" Nominal Diameter Fittings | \$ 3.00 | No Bid | \$ 2.33 | No Bid | \$ 2.59 | \$ 2.13 | |
| 95 | 8" MJ Gasket for 8" Nominal Diameter Fittings | \$ 3.50 | No Bid | \$ 2.67 | No Bid | \$ 3.22 | \$ 2.43 | |
| 96 | 12" MJ Gasket for 12" Nominal Diameter Fittings | \$ 6.00 | No Bid | \$ 4.33 | No Bid | \$ 5.21 | \$ 3.94 | |
| 97 | 6" Transition Gaskets | \$ 3.90 | No Bid | \$ 2.99 | No Bid | \$ 3.76 | \$ 2.73 | |
| 98 | 2" BRONZE METER FLANGES WITH BOLTS & GASKETS | \$ 65.00 | No Bid | \$ 53.83 | No Bid | \$ 35.94 | \$ 58.86 | |
| 99 | 6" DRESSER COUPLINGS (C.I.) (12" M. RING) | \$ 210.00 | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | \$ 169.40 | \$ 151.44 | |
| 100 | 8" DRESSER COUPLINGS (C.I.) (12" M. RING) | \$ 232.00 | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | \$ 227.52 | \$ 192.64 | |
| 101 | 6" X 6" FULL CIRCLE REPAIR CLAMPS - CI PIPE | \$ 45.75 | No Bid | \$ 54.14 | No Bid | \$ 54.08 | \$ 42.50 | |
| 102 | 6" X 12" FULL CIRCLE REPAIR CLAMPS - CI PIPE | \$ 81.55 | No Bid | \$ 90.58 | No Bid | \$ 90.48 | \$ 67.99 | |
| 103 | 8" X 12" FULL CIRCLE REPAIR CLAMPS - CI PIPE | \$ 97.70 | No Bid | \$ 107.24 | No Bid | \$ 107.12 | \$ 79.85 | |

| Bid Tabulation: Preliminary | | Vendor A | Vendor B | Vendor C | Vendor D | Vendor E | Vendor F | Vendor G |
|-----------------------------|--|----------------------------|-----------------|---------------------------|-------------|----------------------|------------------------|-------------------|
| | | Consolidated Pipe & Supply | Keeling Company | Walter A. Wood Supply Co. | Core & Main | Ferguson Enterprises | Southern Pipe & Supply | J&G Culverts Inc. |
| Item # | Description | Bid Price | Bid Price | Bid Price | Bid Price | Bid Price | Bid Price | Bid Price |
| 104 | 3/4" X 3" HANDIBAND REPAIR CLAMP FOR STEEL | \$ 4.35 | No Bid | \$ 3.12 | No Bid | \$ 3.12 | \$ 3.10 | |
| 105 | 3/4" X 6" HANDIBAND REPAIR CLAMP FOR STEEL | \$ 7.75 | No Bid | \$ 7.29 | No Bid | \$ 7.28 | \$ 7.22 | |
| 106 | 1" X 3" HANDIBAND REPAIR CLAMP FOR STEEL | \$ 4.38 | No Bid | \$ 4.16 | No Bid | \$ 4.16 | \$ 4.13 | |
| 107 | 2" X 3" HANDIBAND REPAIR CLAMP | \$ 6.05 | No Bid | \$ 5.21 | No Bid | \$ 5.20 | \$ 5.16 | |
| 108 | 2" X 6" HANDIBAND REPAIR CLAMP | \$ 11.20 | No Bid | \$ 9.37 | No Bid | \$ 9.36 | \$ 9.28 | |
| 109 | 6" FLANGED COUPLING ADAPTER | \$ 102.25 | No Bid | \$ 114.52 | No Bid | \$ 160.00 | \$ 87.99 | |
| 110 | 1/2" GALV COMPRESSION COUPLING | \$ 9.05 | No Bid | \$ 5.21 | No Bid | \$ 9.89 | \$ 9.72 | |
| 111 | 3/4" GALV COMPRESSION COUPLING | \$ 9.38 | No Bid | \$ 5.21 | No Bid | \$ 10.87 | \$ 10.78 | |
| 112 | 1" GALV COMPRESSION COUPLING | \$ 10.65 | No Bid | \$ 7.29 | No Bid | \$ 12.25 | \$ 12.26 | |
| 113 | 1 1/2" GALV COMPRESSION COUPLING | \$ 16.10 | No Bid | \$ 11.45 | No Bid | \$ 18.83 | \$ 18.49 | |
| 114 | 2" GALV COMPRESSION COUPLING (LONG) | \$ 20.80 | No Bid | \$ 20.48 | No Bid | \$ 23.87 | \$ 23.89 | |
| 115 | 2" BRASS PLUGS | \$ 8.75 | No Bid | \$ 6.44 | No Bid | \$ 6.27 | \$ 6.22 | |
| 116 | 2" BRASS CAPS | \$ 13.35 | No Bid | \$ 9.84 | No Bid | \$ 9.58 | \$ 9.49 | |
| 117 | 3/4" X 1/2" BRASS BUSHINGS | \$ 2.00 | No Bid | \$ 1.49 | No Bid | \$ 1.45 | \$ 1.44 | |
| 118 | 1" X 3/4" BRASS BUSHINGS | \$ 3.05 | No Bid | \$ 2.26 | No Bid | \$ 2.19 | \$ 2.18 | |
| 119 | 1" X 3/4" BRASS REDUCERS | \$ 6.14 | No Bid | \$ 4.52 | No Bid | \$ 4.40 | \$ 4.36 | |
| 120 | 1/2" X 2" BRASS NIPPLES | \$ 1.59 | No Bid | \$ 1.20 | No Bid | \$ 1.12 | \$ 1.12 | |
| 121 | 1/2" X 4" BRASS NIPPLES | \$ 2.89 | No Bid | \$ 2.18 | No Bid | \$ 2.05 | \$ 2.04 | |
| 122 | 1/2" X 6" BRASS NIPPLES | \$ 4.20 | No Bid | \$ 3.18 | No Bid | \$ 2.99 | \$ 2.96 | |
| 123 | 3/4" X 2" BRASS NIPPLES | \$ 2.10 | No Bid | \$ 1.59 | No Bid | \$ 1.50 | \$ 1.49 | |
| 124 | 3/4" X 4" BRASS NIPPLES | \$ 3.65 | No Bid | \$ 2.78 | No Bid | \$ 2.62 | \$ 2.60 | |
| 125 | 3/4" X 6" BRASS NIPPLES | \$ 5.35 | No Bid | \$ 4.06 | No Bid | \$ 3.82 | \$ 3.80 | |
| 126 | 1" X 2" BRASS NIPPLES | \$ 3.05 | No Bid | \$ 2.30 | No Bid | \$ 2.17 | \$ 2.16 | |
| 127 | 1" X 4" BRASS NIPPLES | \$ 5.35 | No Bid | \$ 4.03 | No Bid | \$ 3.79 | \$ 3.76 | |
| 128 | 1" X 6" BRASS NIPPLES | \$ 7.85 | No Bid | \$ 5.92 | No Bid | \$ 5.58 | \$ 5.54 | |
| 129 | 2" X 2 1/2" BRASS NIPPLES | \$ 7.99 | No Bid | \$ 6.02 | No Bid | \$ 5.68 | \$ 5.63 | |
| 130 | 2" X 4" BRASS NIPPLES | \$ 12.00 | No Bid | \$ 9.09 | No Bid | \$ 8.56 | \$ 8.48 | |
| 131 | 2" X 6" BRASS NIPPLES | \$ 17.80 | No Bid | \$ 13.41 | No Bid | \$ 12.64 | \$ 12.53 | |
| 132 | 2" X 12" BRASS NIPPLES | \$ 35.00 | No Bid | \$ 26.43 | No Bid | \$ 24.91 | \$ 24.68 | |
| 133 | 3/4" BRASS 90 DEGREE ELLS | \$ 3.75 | No Bid | \$ 2.79 | No Bid | \$ 2.72 | \$ 2.70 | |

| Bid Tabulation: Preliminary | | Vendor A | Vendor B | Vendor C | Vendor D | Vendor E | Vendor F | Vendor G |
|-----------------------------|---|-------------------------------|--------------------|---------------------------------|-------------|-------------------------|---------------------------|----------------------|
| | | Consolidated Pipe & Supply | Keeling Company | Walter A. Wood Supply Co. | Core & Main | Ferguson Enterprises | Southern Pipe & Supply | J&G Culverts Inc. |
| Item # | Description | Bid Price | Bid Price | Bid Price | Bid Price | Bid Price | Bid Price | Bid Price |
| 134 | 1" BRASS 90 DEGREE ELLS | \$ 5.85 | No Bid | \$ 4.31 | No Bid | \$ 4.19 | \$ 4.16 | |
| 135 | 1 1/2" BRASS 90 DEGREE ELLS | \$ 11.60 | No Bid | \$ 8.55 | No Bid | \$ 11.58 | \$ 11.47 | |
| 136 | 2" BRASS 90 DEGREE ELLS | \$ 18.90 | No Bid | \$ 13.92 | No Bid | \$ 13.54 | \$ 13.42 | |
| 137 | 2" BRASS 45 DEGREE ELLS | \$ 20.80 | No Bid | \$ 15.31 | No Bid | \$ 14.90 | \$ 14.77 | |
| 138 | 3/4" BRASS TEES | \$ 4.65 | No Bid | \$ 3.44 | No Bid | \$ 3.34 | \$ 3.31 | |
| 139 | 2" X 1" BRASS TEES | \$ 32.40 | No Bid | \$ 23.81 | No Bid | \$ 23.18 | \$ 22.96 | |
| 140 | 2" X 2" BRASS TEES | \$ 26.20 | No Bid | \$ 19.27 | No Bid | \$ 18.76 | \$ 18.59 | |
| 141 | 1/2" BRASS COUPLINGS | \$ 2.30 | No Bid | \$ 1.71 | No Bid | \$ 1.67 | \$ 1.66 | |
| 142 | 3/4" BRASS COUPLINGS | \$ 3.05 | No Bid | \$ 2.26 | No Bid | \$ 2.19 | \$ 2.18 | |
| 143 | 1" BRASS COUPLINGS | \$ 4.65 | No Bid | \$ 3.44 | No Bid | \$ 3.34 | \$ 3.31 | |
| 144 | 1 1/2" BRASS COUPLINGS | \$ 9.90 | No Bid | \$ 7.29 | No Bid | \$ 7.10 | \$ 6.89 | |
| 145 | 2" BRASS COUPLINGS | \$ 16.30 | No Bid | \$ 11.99 | No Bid | \$ 11.67 | \$ 11.34 | |
| 146 | 2" BRASS UNION | \$ 34.95 | No Bid | \$ 25.68 | No Bid | \$ 25.00 | \$ 24.77 | |
| 147 | 2" X 3/4" BRONZE SADDLES, CC THREAD FOR PVC PIPE (MCDONALD 3892) | \$ 14.80 | No Bid | \$ 17.57 | No Bid | \$ 15.53 | \$ 16.10 | |
| 148 | 2" X 1" BRONZE SADDLES, CC THREAD FOR PVC PIPE (McDONALD 3892) | \$ 14.80 | No Bid | \$ 17.57 | No Bid | \$ 15.53 | \$ 16.10 | |
| 149 | 4" X 2" TAP SADDLES, I.P.T. DOUBLE STRAP FOR C.I. PIPE | \$ 22.25 | No Bid | \$ 23.95 | No Bid | \$ 23.92 | \$ 23.47 | |
| 150 | 6" X 2" TAP SADDLES, I.P.T. DOUBLE STRAP, FOR C.I. PIPE | \$ 23.60 | No Bid | \$ 28.11 | No Bid | \$ 28.08 | \$ 26.50 | |
| 151 | 8" X 2" TAP SADDLES, I.P.T. DOUBLE STRAP, FOR C.I. PIPE | \$ 28.50 | No Bid | \$ 31.23 | No Bid | \$ 31.20 | \$ 30.62 | |
| 152 | 1" FIP X FIP CURB STOPS MCDONALD 6101W OR EQUAL | \$ 57.15 | No Bid | \$ 72.71 | No Bid | \$ 53.92 | \$ 59.17 | |
| 153 | 3/4" SPIGOTS, ARROWHEAD OR EQUAL | \$ 7.50 | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | \$ 6.75 | \$ 7.10 | |
| 154 | 3/4" MALE ADAPTERS MCDONALD 4753T OR EQUAL | \$ 9.56 | No Bid | \$ 13.27 | No Bid | \$ 9.98 | \$ 11.18 | |
| 155 | 3/4" FEMALE ADAPTERS MCDONALD 4754T OR EQUAL | \$ 10.03 | No Bid | \$ 13.96 | No Bid | \$ 10.50 | \$ 11.76 | |
| 156 | 3/4" METER COUPLINGS 2 1/2" LONG | \$ 5.98 | No Bid | \$ 4.39 | No Bid | \$ 6.89 | \$ 7.26 | |
| 157 | 3/4" METER COUPLING 2 3/4" LONG | \$ 14.59 | No Bid | \$ 4.39 | No Bid | \$ 7.66 | \$ 8.09 | |
| 158 | 1" METER COUPLINGS 1 1/2" LONG | \$ 12.05 | No Bid | \$ 5.74 | No Bid | \$ 10.32 | \$ 10.86 | |
| 159 | 1" MALE ADAPTERS MCDONALD 4753T OR EQUAL | \$ 11.27 | No Bid | \$ 15.73 | No Bid | \$ 11.83 | \$ 13.24 | |
| 160 | 1" FEMALE ADAPTERS MCDONALD 4754T OR EQUAL | \$ 13.55 | No Bid | \$ 18.96 | No Bid | \$ 14.25 | \$ 15.95 | |
| 161 | 3/4" 3-PART UNIONS MCDONALD 4758T OR EQUAL | \$ 11.58 | No Bid | \$ 16.17 | No Bid | \$ 12.16 | \$ 13.62 | |
| 162 | 1" 3-PART UNIONS MCDONALD 4758T OR EQUAL | \$ 13.25 | No Bid | \$ 18.50 | No Bid | \$ 13.90 | \$ 15.57 | |
| 163 | 1" X 1" X 1" COPPER COMPRESSION TEES MCDONALD 4760T OR EQUAL | \$ 31.75 | No Bid | \$ 41.88 | No Bid | \$ 33.46 | \$ 35.24 | |

| Bid Tabulation: Preliminary | | Vendor A | Vendor B | Vendor C | Vendor D | Vendor E | Vendor F | Vendor G |
|-----------------------------|--|-------------------------------|--------------------|---------------------------------|-------------|-------------------------|---------------------------|----------------------|
| | | Consolidated Pipe & Supply | Keeling Company | Walter A. Wood Supply Co. | Core & Main | Ferguson Enterprises | Southern Pipe & Supply | J&G Culverts Inc. |
| Item # | Description | Bid Price | Bid Price | Bid Price | Bid Price | Bid Price | Bid Price | Bid Price |
| 164 | 1" X 3/4" X 3/4" U-BRANCH MCDONALD 708UQM | \$ 36.40 | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | \$ 30.42 | \$ 35.09 | |
| 165 | 1" X 3/4" BRASS COMPRESSION WYES MCDONALD 4768T OR EQUAL | \$ 25.48 | No Bid | \$ 33.46 | No Bid | \$ 29.62 | \$ 28.17 | |
| 166 | 3/4" COMP. X M.I.P. 90 DEGREE BENDS MCDONALD 4779MT OR EQUAL | \$ 11.05 | No Bid | \$ 14.54 | No Bid | \$ 11.63 | \$ 12.24 | |
| 167 | 1" COMP. X M.I.P. 90 DEGREE BENDS MCDONALD 4779MT OR EQUAL | \$ 18.38 | No Bid | \$ 24.20 | No Bid | \$ 19.34 | \$ 20.36 | |
| 168 | 3/4" COPPER FLARE X F.I.P. CURB STOPS MCDONALD 6102 OR EQUAL | \$ 39.40 | No Bid | \$ 53.89 | No Bid | \$ 40.17 | \$ 46.91 | |
| 169 | 3/4" BRASS COMPRESSION TEES MCDONALD 4760T OR EQUAL | \$ 26.49 | No Bid | \$ 39.14 | No Bid | \$ 31.27 | \$ 32.93 | |
| 170 | 3/4" STAINLESS STEEL INSERTS (SEE SPECIFICATIONS) | \$ 1.65 | No Bid | \$ 1.26 | No Bid | \$ 1.85 | \$ 0.73 | |
| 171 | 1" STAINLESS STEEL INSERTS (SEE SPECIFICATIONS) | \$ 1.95 | No Bid | \$ 1.33 | No Bid | \$ 2.65 | \$ 0.84 | |
| 172 | FIRE HYDRANTS (SPECIFY BRAND AND MODEL) M. J. 5 FT. BURY | \$ 1,371.00 | No Bid | \$ 1,671.83 | \$ 1,650.00 | \$ 1,485.00 | \$ 1,377.96 | |
| 173 | PIPE LUBRICANT - 1 QUART CONTAINERS | \$ 3.50 | No Bid | \$ 3.12 | No Bid | \$ 9.80 | \$ 3.16 | |
| 174 | PIPE LUBRICANT - 1 GALLON CONTAINERS | \$ 11.00 | No Bid | \$ 9.11 | No Bid | \$ 3.00 | \$ 9.48 | |
| 175 | JOMAR PIPE LUBRICANT (GREEN STUFF) - PINT CONTAINERS | \$ 12.00 | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | \$ 11.00 | \$ 16.85 | |
| 176 | WATER LINE MARKERS (6x2 1/2") CARSONITE OR EQUAL | \$ 18.00 | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | \$ 17.25 | \$ 16.96 | |
| 177 | 3/4" TAP BIT (DT75) | \$ 156.00 | No Bid | \$ 127.74 | No Bid | \$ 168.00 | \$ 125.99 | |
| 178 | 1" TAP BIT(DT100) | \$ 179.00 | No Bid | \$ 169.59 | No Bid | \$ 205.00 | \$ 167.28 | |
| 179 | 3/4" ALL THREAD ROD | \$ 1.25 | No Bid | \$ 1.30 | No Bid | \$ 1.15 | \$ 1.06 | |
| 180 | 3/4" BRASS HAYES NUTS | No Bid | No Bid | \$ 6.96 | No Bid | \$ 8.85 | \$ 2.98 | |
| 181 | 1" BRASS HAYES NUTS | No Bid | No Bid | \$ 8.97 | No Bid | \$ 10.40 | \$ 4.92 | |
| 182 | 6" X 36" LONG FLANGE X FLANGE SPOOL | \$ 194.25 | No Bid | \$ 173.53 | No Bid | \$ 184.74 | \$ 165.36 | |
| 183 | 2" UNIFLANGE 1300-S (RESTRAINT DEVICE) | \$ 26.50 | No Bid | \$ 14.67 | No Bid | \$ 24.04 | \$ 17.41 | |
| 184 | 4" UNIFLANGE 1300-C (RESTRAINT DEVICE) | \$ 29.75 | No Bid | \$ 17.74 | No Bid | \$ 25.25 | \$ 26.43 | |
| 185 | 6" UNIFLANGE 1300-C (RESTRAINT DEVICE) | \$ 38.00 | No Bid | \$ 21.78 | No Bid | \$ 18.18 | \$ 28.47 | |
| 186 | 8" UNIFLANGE 1300-C (RESTRAINT DEVICE) | \$ 63.50 | No Bid | \$ 36.31 | No Bid | \$ 23.23 | \$ 39.55 | |
| 187 | 12" UNIFLANGE 1300-C (RESTRAINT DEVICE) | \$ 121.00 | No Bid | \$ 65.25 | No Bid | \$ 47.47 | \$ 82.84 | |
| 188 | 2" x 7.50" COLLAR LEAK REPAIR CLAMP | \$ 42.50 | No Bid | \$ 40.60 | No Bid | \$ 39.78 | \$ 38.78 | |
| 189 | 3/4" X 6" Bolts For Universal Pipe | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | \$ 11.85 | \$ 2.27 | |
| 190 | 12" X 6 " CASING SPACER | \$ 44.00 | No Bid | \$ 38.11 | No Bid | \$ 65.50 | \$ 16.74 | |
| 191 | LOCATING WIRE (14 GUAGE SOLID COPPER) | \$ 0.11 | No Bid | \$ 0.11 | No Bid | \$ 0.10 | \$ 0.09 | |
| 192 | 4" X 24" Flange x Flange Spool | \$ 135.00 | No Bid | \$ 118.06 | No Bid | \$ 125.69 | \$ 112.50 | |
| 193 | 1" X CLOSE BRASS NIPPLE | \$ 2.45 | No Bid | \$ 1.86 | No Bid | \$ 1.76 | \$ 1.75 | |

| Bid Tabulation: Preliminary | | Vendor A | Vendor B | Vendor C | Vendor D | Vendor E | Vendor F | Vendor G |
|-----------------------------|--|-------------------------------|--------------------|---------------------------------|-------------|-------------------------|---------------------------|----------------------|
| | | Consolidated Pipe & Supply | Keeling Company | Walter A. Wood Supply Co. | Core & Main | Ferguson Enterprises | Southern Pipe & Supply | J&G Culverts Inc. |
| Item # | Description | Bid Price | Bid Price | Bid Price | Bid Price | Bid Price | Bid Price | Bid Price |
| 194 | 3/4"-1 1/4" Chinese Fingers Grip (Part # 185-903) | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | \$ 89.00 | \$ 75.55 | |
| 195 | 10 " MEGALUG RESTRAINED GLAND, DUCTILE IRON | \$ 44.15 | No Bid | \$ 37.18 | No Bid | \$ 38.63 | \$ 36.13 | |
| 196 | 3/4" CLOSE BRASS NIPPLE | \$ 1.60 | No Bid | \$ 1.27 | No Bid | \$ 1.19 | \$ 1.19 | |
| 197 | 4" X 36" FLANGE X FLANGE SPOOL | \$ 158.00 | No Bid | \$ 139.05 | No Bid | \$ 148.03 | \$ 132.50 | |
| 198 | 1 1/2" McDonald By Pass Assembly | \$ 625.00 | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | \$ 538.40 | \$ 679.17 | |
| 199 | 2" McDONALD METER BYPASS (36" Long) | \$ 795.00 | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | \$ 758.92 | \$ 943.21 | |
| 200 | 6" Full Circle Repair Clamp w/ 1" Tap (Ext. Range) | \$ 81.55 | No Bid | \$ 82.25 | No Bid | \$ 80.58 | \$ 43.70 | |
| 201 | 2" X 7-1/2" Full Circle Repair Clamp (F1-263-75) | \$ 33.95 | No Bid | \$ 36.44 | No Bid | \$ 35.70 | \$ 35.72 | |
| 202 | 6" Foster ADPT & ACCESS | \$ 105.00 | No Bid | \$ 74.91 | No Bid | \$ 88.00 | \$ 82.23 | |
| 203 | 8" X 8" SS TAP SLEEVE (JCM #432 or equal) (OD 8.98-9.37) | \$ 665.00 | No Bid | \$ 641.33 | No Bid | \$ 628.32 | \$ 458.30 | |
| 204 | 3" 90 Degree Flanged Bend | \$ 35.25 | No Bid | \$ 35.31 | \$ 42.00 | \$ 42.37 | \$ 32.13 | |
| 205 | 3" Run x 3" Branched Flanged Tee | \$ 50.65 | No Bid | \$ 50.64 | \$ 60.00 | \$ 60.76 | \$ 46.07 | |
| 206 | 3" Flange Packs (Nuts, Bolts, Gaskets) | \$ 3.50 | No Bid | \$ 3.12 | No Bid | \$ 5.30 | \$ 4.15 | |
| 207 | 4" M.J. x 3" Flanged Reducer | \$ 99.75 | No Bid | \$ 37.31 | No Bid | \$ 48.87 | \$ 50.91 | |
| 208 | 3" FFCA-388 Flange Adapter | \$ 88.00 | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | \$ 127.00 | \$ 64.54 | |
| 209 | 3" X 12" FLANGE X PE SPOOL | \$ 85.00 | No Bid | \$ 75.71 | No Bid | \$ 80.60 | \$ 72.15 | |
| 210 | 3" X 24" FLANGE X FLANGE SPOOL | \$ 173.00 | No Bid | \$ 154.42 | No Bid | \$ 164.39 | \$ 147.15 | |
| 211 | 3" X 36" FLANGE X FLANGE SPOOL | \$ 224.00 | No Bid | \$ 198.65 | No Bid | \$ 211.47 | \$ 189.29 | |
| 212 | 3" X 7" Repair Clamp (For Steel) O.D.3.46-3.70 | \$ 33.98 | No Bid | \$ 45.81 | No Bid | \$ 44.88 | \$ 39.17 | |
| 213 | 3" Hymax Dresser Coupling Copper Part# 2000-0433-260 | \$ 119.00 | No Bid | \$ 113.03 | No Bid | \$ 109.63 | \$ 107.57 | |
| 214 | 2" Hymax Dresser Coupling For 2" Or 2 1/2" Copper (PART # 2000-0303-260) | \$ 89.00 | No Bid | \$ 85.68 | No Bid | \$ 83.10 | \$ 81.54 | |
| 215 | 1 1/2" X 12" Brass Nipples | \$ 27.20 | No Bid | \$ 20.48 | No Bid | \$ 19.29 | \$ 19.12 | |
| 216 | 4" X 48" Flanged X Flanged Spool | \$ 182.00 | No Bid | \$ 160.04 | No Bid | \$ 170.37 | \$ 152.50 | |
| 217 | 4" HyMax Dresser Coupling Range (4.25-5.63) | \$ 152.00 | No Bid | \$ 144.83 | No Bid | \$ 140.46 | \$ 137.82 | |
| 218 | 8" HYMAX DRESSER COUPLING (OD 8.54-9.84) | \$ 225.00 | No Bid | \$ 216.56 | No Bid | \$ 210.02 | \$ 206.07 | |
| 219 | 6" Hymax Dresser Coupling (O.D. 6.42-7.68) | \$ 200.00 | No Bid | \$ 191.82 | No Bid | \$ 186.02 | \$ 182.53 | |
| 220 | 1 1/2" X 3" WRAP CLAMP REPAIR CLAMP (FSC-190-3R) | \$ 5.95 | No Bid | \$ 11.45 | No Bid | \$ 11.44 | \$ 11.23 | |
| 221 | 1 1/4" X 3" WRAP CLAMP Repair Clamp | \$ 5.85 | No Bid | \$ 11.45 | No Bid | \$ 11.44 | \$ 11.23 | |
| 222 | 2" X 3" Wrap Repair Clamp | \$ 6.25 | No Bid | \$ 12.49 | No Bid | \$ 12.48 | \$ 12.25 | |
| 223 | 2" X 6" Wrap Repair Clamp | \$ 11.27 | No Bid | \$ 23.95 | No Bid | \$ 23.92 | \$ 23.47 | |

| Bid Tabulation: Preliminary | | Vendor A | Vendor B | Vendor C | Vendor D | Vendor E | Vendor F | Vendor G |
|---|--|----------------------------|-----------------|---------------------------|-------------|----------------------|------------------------|-------------------|
| | | Consolidated Pipe & Supply | Keeling Company | Walter A. Wood Supply Co. | Core & Main | Ferguson Enterprises | Southern Pipe & Supply | J&G Culverts Inc. |
| Item # | Description | Bid Price | Bid Price | Bid Price | Bid Price | Bid Price | Bid Price | Bid Price |
| 224 | 34" X 3/4" XS LEAD X MALE COMP COUP (M74753-67) | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | \$ 22.35 | \$ 24.26 | |
| 225 | 2" Galvanized Style 65 Dresser Coupling (Short) | \$ 20.80 | No Bid | \$ 16.66 | No Bid | \$ 23.35 | \$ 22.82 | |
| 226 | 3/4" ZINC ROD COUPLING | \$ 2.25 | No Bid | \$ 1.56 | No Bid | \$ 1.40 | \$ 1.64 | |
| 227 | Water Plug (50 LB Pails) | \$ 24.00 | No Bid | \$ 41.58 | No Bid | \$ 26.85 | \$ 23.47 | |
| 228 | 4" PVC SEWER SOLVENT WELD END CAP (SDR-35) | \$ 1.15 | No Bid | \$ 6.49 | No Bid | \$ 1.45 | \$ 1.32 | |
| 229 | 4" CLAY TO PVC FERNCO SHEAR COUPLING | \$ 17.00 | No Bid | \$ 25.00 | No Bid | \$ 21.83 | \$ 12.50 | |
| 230 | 6" CLAY TO PVC FERNCO SHEAR COUPLING | \$ 28.00 | No Bid | \$ 42.39 | No Bid | \$ 37.02 | \$ 20.82 | |
| 231 | 4" PVC TO PVC FERNCO SHEAR COUPLING | \$ 11.00 | No Bid | \$ 17.05 | No Bid | \$ 14.89 | \$ 8.32 | |
| 232 | 8" PVC TO PVC FERNCO SHEAR COUPLING | \$ 32.00 | No Bid | \$ 48.22 | No Bid | \$ 42.11 | \$ 24.04 | |
| 233 | WASHER, 1/2id x 7/8OD X 1/32THK (PN: HW267) | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | \$ 0.08 | |
| | SCHEDULE TOTAL | N/A | \$ - | N/A | N/A | \$ 10,130.13 | \$ 9,115.32 | \$ - |
| SCHEDULE 10 - PVC PIPE | | | | | | | | |
| 234 | 2" PVC PIPE, CLASS 200 | \$ 0.45 | \$ 0.70 | \$ 0.49 | No Bid | \$ 0.48 | \$ 0.56 | |
| 235 | 6" PVC PIPE, CLASS 200 | \$ 3.16 | \$ 5.50 | \$ 3.35 | No Bid | \$ 3.33 | \$ 3.83 | |
| 236 | 4" Schedule 40 PVC Pipe | \$ 1.60 | \$ 2.70 | \$ 1.79 | No Bid | \$ 2.35 | \$ 2.15 | |
| 237 | 12" Schedule 40 PVC Pipe | \$ 7.67 | \$ 13.42 | \$ 9.15 | No Bid | \$ 11.50 | \$ 14.09 | |
| 238 | 12" PVC HW Sewer Pipe 14LF | \$ 9.73 | No Bid | \$ 9.70 | No Bid | \$ 10.25 | \$ 13.27 | |
| | SCHEDULE TOTAL | \$ 22.61 | N/A | \$ 24.48 | \$ - | \$ 27.91 | \$ 33.90 | \$ - |
| SCHEDULE 11 - SEWER PIPE ACCESSORIES & RELATED ITEMS | | | | | | | | |
| 239 | Sewer Manhole Markers | \$ 18.00 | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | \$ 17.85 | \$ 16.96 | |
| 240 | Full Range 3M Marker Waste Water | \$ 16.00 | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | \$ 16.75 | \$ 22.79 | |
| 241 | 4" SDR-26 HW SEWER PIPE 14LF | \$ 1.12 | No Bid | \$ 1.17 | No Bid | \$ 1.18 | \$ 1.58 | |
| 242 | 6" SDR-26 HW SEWER PIPE 14LF | \$ 2.41 | No Bid | \$ 2.36 | No Bid | \$ 2.55 | \$ 4.16 | |
| 243 | 8" SDR-26 HW SEWER PIPE 14LF | \$ 4.35 | No Bid | \$ 4.30 | No Bid | \$ 4.59 | \$ 4.32 | |
| 244 | 10" SDR-26 HW SEWER PIPE 14LF | \$ 6.83 | No Bid | \$ 6.75 | No Bid | \$ 7.19 | \$ 4.43 | |
| 245 | 2" SEWER AIR RELEASE VALVE (ARV) APCO MN:402WA.1 | \$ 1,125.00 | No Bid | \$ 790.21 | No Bid | \$ 1,125.00 | \$ 1,078.95 | |
| 246 | 4" PVC HW Sewer SXG ST 22 Deg Bend | \$ 12.25 | No Bid | \$ 5.26 | No Bid | \$ 17.15 | \$ 15.70 | |
| 247 | 10" CL-350 Permax Lined DI Pipe | \$ 31.87 | No Bid | \$ 34.93 | No Bid | \$ 32.54 | \$ 33.14 | |
| 248 | 16" DI Pipe w/PERMOX Lining | \$ 63.77 | No Bid | \$ 65.30 | No Bid | \$ 58.51 | \$ 61.76 | |
| 249 | 1" x 10' Leader Hose | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | \$ 5.89 | |

| Bid Tabulation: Preliminary | | Vendor A | Vendor B | Vendor C | Vendor D | Vendor E | Vendor F | Vendor G |
|--|--|----------------------------|-----------------|---------------------------|-------------|----------------------|------------------------|-------------------|
| | | Consolidated Pipe & Supply | Keeling Company | Walter A. Wood Supply Co. | Core & Main | Ferguson Enterprises | Southern Pipe & Supply | J&G Culverts Inc. |
| Item # | Description | Bid Price | Bid Price | Bid Price | Bid Price | Bid Price | Bid Price | Bid Price |
| 250 | TIGER TAIL 3" x 36" | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | \$ 61.12 | |
| 251 | 2" Sewer ARV (Crispin MN: SL20) w/backflush valve | \$ 939.00 | No Bid | \$ 842.27 | No Bid | \$ 1,515.00 | \$ 894.74 | |
| 252 | 4" Gripper Plug (Wing Nut) | \$ 12.55 | No Bid | \$ 5.48 | No Bid | \$ 9.85 | \$ 15.22 | |
| 253 | 16" MJ Solid Sleeve Permax Lined | \$ 798.00 | No Bid | \$ 601.02 | No Bid | \$ 588.83 | \$ 546.67 | |
| 254 | 8" CL-350 DI PERMOX LINED | \$ 25.89 | No Bid | \$ 27.43 | No Bid | \$ 26.46 | \$ 26.62 | |
| SCHEDULE TOTAL | | N/A | \$ - | N/A | \$ - | N/A | \$ 2,794.05 | \$ - |
| SCHEDULE 12 - TAP SLEEVES & SADDLES | | | | | | | | |
| 255 | 12" MJ Cap with 2" IPT Tap | \$ 72.40 | No Bid | \$ 72.30 | \$ 85.00 | \$ 86.75 | \$ 65.76 | |
| 256 | 6" Solid M.J. Sleeves | \$ 43.90 | No Bid | \$ 43.98 | \$ 55.00 | \$ 52.77 | \$ 40.00 | |
| 257 | 12" Solid M.J. Sleeves | \$ 115.25 | No Bid | \$ 114.61 | \$ 135.00 | \$ 137.51 | \$ 104.25 | |
| 258 | 12" X 8" TAP SLEEVE (American #AFC-2800 or equal) | \$ 1,425.00 | No Bid | \$ 909.23 | No Bid | \$ 1,810.00 | \$ 1,476.58 | |
| 259 | 12" X 2" TAP SADDLES, I.P.T. DOUBLE STRAP, FOR C.I. PIPE | \$ 40.50 | No Bid | \$ 101.52 | No Bid | \$ 48.88 | \$ 47.96 | |
| 260 | 16" X 2" TAP SADDLES, I.P.T. DOUBLE STRAP, FOR C.I. PIPE | \$ 74.50 | No Bid | \$ 138.84 | No Bid | \$ 74.88 | \$ 73.47 | |
| 261 | 6" X 1" TAP SADDLES, CC THREAD, DOUBLE STRAP FOR PVC | \$ 19.61 | No Bid | \$ 57.98 | No Bid | \$ 21.84 | \$ 20.77 | |
| 262 | 6" X 6" SS TAP SLEEVE (JCM #432 or equal)(OD 7.05 -7.40) | \$ 480.00 | No Bid | \$ 525.11 | No Bid | \$ 468.18 | \$ 351.88 | |
| 263 | 6" X 6" SS TAP SLEEVE DI (JCM #432 or equal)(O.D. 6.83-7.16) | \$ 480.00 | No Bid | \$ 525.11 | No Bid | \$ 468.18 | \$ 351.88 | |
| 264 | 8" Solid M.J. Sleeves | \$ 71.65 | No Bid | \$ 71.30 | No Bid | \$ 85.55 | \$ 64.85 | |
| 265 | 3" X 3/4" Bronze Tap Saddle for PVC | \$ 19.30 | No Bid | \$ 23.19 | No Bid | \$ 20.74 | \$ 21.23 | |
| SCHEDULE TOTAL | | \$ 2,842.11 | \$ - | \$ 2,583.17 | N/A | \$ 3,275.28 | \$ 2,618.63 | \$ - |
| SCHEDULE 13 - VALVES & ACCESSORIES | | | | | | | | |
| 266 | 4" TAPPING VALVES (American 2500 RS or equal) | \$ 384.30 | No Bid | \$ 466.11 | \$ 430.00 | \$ 392.37 | \$ 391.60 | |
| 267 | 2" VALVE BOX RISERS FOR 7" VALVE BOX | No Bid | No Bid | \$ 11.45 | No Bid | \$ 18.85 | \$ 3.75 | |
| 268 | 2" STOCKHAM B-319 CHECK VALVE OR EQUAL | No Bid | No Bid | \$ 418.79 | No Bid | No Bid | \$ 34.69 | |
| 269 | 4" GATE VALVES - (M.J.) (American 2500 RS or equal) | \$ 304.65 | No Bid | \$ 369.47 | \$ 340.00 | \$ 311.21 | \$ 309.62 | |
| 270 | 6" GATE VALVES - (M.J.) (American 2500 RS or equal) | \$ 388.55 | No Bid | \$ 471.47 | \$ 435.00 | \$ 397.34 | \$ 395.10 | |
| 271 | 8" GATE VALVES - (M.J.) (American 2500 RS or equal) | \$ 618.85 | No Bid | \$ 750.95 | \$ 690.00 | \$ 632.34 | \$ 629.30 | |
| 272 | 4" GATE VALVES (FLANGED) (American 2500 RS or equal) | \$ 304.65 | No Bid | \$ 366.32 | \$ 426.00 | \$ 308.38 | \$ 306.98 | |
| 273 | 6" TAPPING VALVES (American 2500 RS or equal) | \$ 542.60 | No Bid | \$ 658.42 | \$ 600.00 | \$ 554.00 | \$ 551.76 | |
| 274 | 8" TAPPING VALVES (American 2500 RS or equal) | \$ 812.50 | No Bid | \$ 977.37 | \$ 900.00 | \$ 817.71 | \$ 819.04 | |
| 275 | VALVE BOX, 18" X 24" SCREW TYPE W/LID (5-1/4" DIA.) | \$ 72.50 | No Bid | \$ 27.37 | No Bid | \$ 78.00 | \$ 37.76 | |

| Bid Tabulation: Preliminary | | Vendor A | Vendor B | Vendor C | Vendor D | Vendor E | Vendor F | Vendor G |
|-----------------------------|--|----------------------------|-----------------|---------------------------|-------------|----------------------|------------------------|-------------------|
| | | Consolidated Pipe & Supply | Keeling Company | Walter A. Wood Supply Co. | Core & Main | Ferguson Enterprises | Southern Pipe & Supply | J&G Culverts Inc. |
| Item # | Description | Bid Price | Bid Price | Bid Price | Bid Price | Bid Price | Bid Price | Bid Price |
| 276 | 1" ADAPTERS FOR 5 1/4" VALVE BOXES | \$ 7.00 | No Bid | \$ 9.37 | No Bid | \$ 4.40 | \$ 8.68 | |
| 277 | 1 1/2" ADAPTERS FOR 5 1/4" VALVE BOXES | \$ 9.00 | No Bid | \$ 10.41 | No Bid | \$ 7.25 | \$ 9.70 | |
| 278 | 2" STOCKHAM B103 GATE VALVES OR EQUAL | No Bid | No Bid | \$ 233.37 | No Bid | No Bid | \$ 26.26 | |
| 279 | 1" PRESSURE REDUCER VALVES WILKINS #600 OR EQUAL | \$ 61.85 | \$ 61.80 | \$ 85.37 | \$ 66.00 | \$ 59.88 | \$ 59.91 | |
| 280 | 2" PRESSURE REDUCER VALVES WILKINS #600 OR EQUAL | \$ 298.25 | \$ 298.15 | \$ 286.31 | \$ 300.00 | \$ 288.92 | \$ 289.04 | |
| 281 | 6" 774 DOUBLE CHECK DETECTOR ASSEMBLY (38" long) | \$ 2,025.00 | No Bid | \$ 3,176.47 | \$ 2,150.00 | \$ 1,964.52 | \$ 1,965.31 | |
| 282 | 2" Det Check 007-DCDA-OSY-2 | \$ 2,010.00 | No Bid | \$ 1,965.64 | \$ 2,015.00 | \$ 1,986.40 | \$ 1,948.98 | |
| 283 | 3" GATE VALVES (FLANGED) (AMERICAN 865 RS OR EQUAL) | \$ 272.80 | No Bid | \$ 327.79 | \$ 300.00 | \$ 276.11 | \$ 274.69 | |
| 284 | 6" X 5 1/4" Valve Box Riser | \$ 25.00 | No Bid | \$ 19.26 | No Bid | \$ 27.10 | \$ 18.37 | |
| 285 | 5 1/4" Valve Box Water Lid Only | \$ 9.50 | No Bid | \$ 8.33 | No Bid | \$ 12.00 | \$ 9.19 | |
| 286 | 3/4" PRESSURE REDUCER VALVES WILKINS #600 OR EQUAL | \$ 51.05 | \$ 51.05 | \$ 61.43 | \$ 55.00 | \$ 49.96 | \$ 49.49 | |
| 287 | 1 1/2" PRESSURE REDUCER VALVES WILKINS #600 OR EQUAL | \$ 211.75 | \$ 211.57 | \$ 245.71 | \$ 225.00 | \$ 209.04 | \$ 205.11 | |
| 288 | 2" RS THREADED GATE VALVE | \$ 185.75 | No Bid | \$ 248.02 | \$ 210.00 | \$ 192.00 | \$ 189.43 | |
| 289 | 7" PLASTIC ROUND VB W/LID | \$ 8.00 | No Bid | \$ 4.00 | No Bid | \$ 3.85 | \$ 7.06 | |
| SCHEDULE TOTAL | | N/A | N/A | \$ 10,733.09 | N/A | N/A | \$ 8,540.82 | \$ - |
| | | | | | | | | |
| | | | | | | | | |