

| Bid Tabulation: Preliminary | | | Vendor A | | Vendor B | | Vendor C | | Vendor D | | Vendor E | |
|-----------------------------|------------|--------------|--------------------|------------|-----------------|------------|------------------------------|------------|------------------------------|------------|-----------------------|------------|
| | | | Advance Auto Parts | | NAPA Auto Parts | | O'Reilly Auto Parts (Bid #1) | | O'Reilly Auto Parts (Bid #2) | | Northport Auto Supply | |
| Item # | Brand | Part Number | Bid Brand | Unit Price | Bid Brand | Unit Price | Bid Brand | Unit Price | Bid Brand | Unit Price | Bid Brand | Unit Price |
| 1 | Raybestos | 580279P | Wearever | \$ 43.99 | NB | \$ 44.89 | BBR | \$ 46.39 | Brake Best | \$ 46.39 | Raybestos | \$ 67.84 |
| 2 | Raybestos | 580422P | Wearever | \$ 57.19 | NB | \$ 54.89 | BBR | \$ 58.39 | Brake Best | \$ 58.39 | Raybestos | \$ 60.37 |
| 3 | Raybestos | 581032P | Wearever | \$ 57.19 | NB | \$ 59.89 | NO BID | NO BID | Bosch | \$ 49.57 | Raybestos | \$ 71.81 |
| 4 | Raybestos | 680982P | Wearever | \$ 63.24 | NB | \$ 64.89 | BBR | \$ 66.39 | Brake Best | \$ 66.39 | Raybestos | \$ 74.55 |
| 5 | Raybestos | 680983P | Wearever | \$ 38.49 | NB | \$ 39.89 | BBR | \$ 48.79 | Brake Best | \$ 48.79 | Raybestos | \$ 50.67 |
| 6 | Raybestos | 680507P | Wearever | \$ 58.84 | NB | \$ 59.89 | BBR | \$ 64.79 | Brake Best | \$ 64.79 | Raybestos | \$ 62.69 |
| 7 | Raybestos | 680508P | Wearever | \$ 63.24 | NB | \$ 64.89 | BBR | \$ 64.79 | Brake Best | \$ 64.79 | Raybestos | \$ 73.81 |
| 8 | Raybestos | 681951PER | Wearever | \$ 54.99 | UP | \$ 104.89 | BBR | \$ 47.19 | BHH | \$ 48.44 | Raybestos | \$ 97.90 |
| 9 | Raybestos | 580721 | Wearever | \$ 43.99 | NB | \$ 44.89 | BBR | \$ 43.99 | BBR | \$ 43.99 | Raybestos | \$ 68.04 |
| 10 | Raybestos | RC12031P | Wearever | \$ 48.09 | CAL | \$ 78.49 | NO BID | NO BID | BHH | \$ 48.44 | Raybestos | \$ 76.21 |
| 11 | Raybestos | RC12032P | Wearever | \$ 48.09 | CAL | \$ 78.49 | NO BID | NO BID | BHH | \$ 48.44 | Raybestos | \$ 76.21 |
| 12 | Raybestos | RC11382P | Wearever | \$ 42.89 | CAL | \$ 79.89 | NO BID | NO BID | BHH | \$ 50.99 | Raybestos | \$ 74.61 |
| 13 | Raybestos | RC11381P | Wearever | \$ 42.89 | CAL | \$ 79.89 | NO BID | NO BID | BHH | \$ 50.99 | Raybestos | \$ 74.61 |
| 14 | Raybestos | RC12562P | Wearever | \$ 70.84 | CAL | \$ 84.89 | NO BID | NO BID | BHH | \$ 52.69 | Raybestos | \$ 75.57 |
| 15 | Raybestos | RC12561P | Wearever | \$ 63.37 | CAL | \$ 84.89 | NO BID | NO BID | BHH | \$ 52.69 | Raybestos | \$ 75.57 |
| 16 | Raybestos | SP931PPH | Wearever | \$ 38.99 | FLT | \$ 59.89 | PFC | \$ 71.39 | Wagner | \$ 33.68 | Raybestos | \$ 41.61 |
| 17 | Raybestos | SP932PPH | Wearever | \$ 38.99 | FLT | \$ 59.89 | PFC | \$ 62.89 | Wagner | \$ 41.18 | Raybestos | \$ 41.29 |
| 18 | Raybestos | SP1194PPH | Wearever | \$ 47.44 | FLT | \$ 49.89 | PFC | \$ 76.34 | Wagner | \$ 56.72 | Raybestos | \$ 44.69 |
| 19 | Raybestos | SP1367PPH | Wearever | \$ 48.74 | FLT | \$ 64.89 | NO BID | NO BID | Wagner | \$ 46.68 | Raybestos | \$ 48.96 |
| 20 | Raybestos | SP1414PSH | Wearever | \$ 45.49 | FLT | \$ 64.89 | PFC | \$ 67.99 | Wagner | \$ 58.25 | Raybestos | \$ 55.35 |
| 21 | Raybestos | SP1602TRH | Wearever | \$ 40.94 | FLT | \$ 64.89 | NO BID | NO BID | Wagner | \$ 58.25 | Raybestos | \$ 43.53 |
| 22 | Raybestos | SP1611APPH | Wearever | \$ 51.99 | FLT | \$ 59.89 | PFC | \$ 72.24 | Wagner | \$ 42.99 | Raybestos | \$ 48.88 |
| 23 | Raybestos | SP1612PPH | Wearever | \$ 49.39 | FLT | \$ 59.89 | PFC | \$ 74.76 | Wagner | \$ 52.58 | Raybestos | \$ 37.43 |
| 24 | TYC | 2852 | ToughOne | \$ 169.27 | NR | \$ 139.89 | MHT | \$ 124.22 | Murray | \$ 86.74 | TYC | \$ 66.33 |
| 25 | TYC | 2921 | ToughOne | \$ 182.74 | NR | \$ 159.89 | MHT | \$ 185.27 | Murray | \$ 179.59 | TYC | \$ 99.51 |
| 26 | TYC | 13226 | ToughOne | \$ 144.49 | NR | \$ 253.80 | NO BID | NO BID | Murray | \$ 171.89 | TYC | \$ 112.44 |
| 27 | TYC | 13510 | ToughOne | \$ 277.94 | TYC | \$ 103.79 | NO BID | NO BID | Murray | \$ 292.99 | TYC | \$ 113.27 |
| 28 | TYC | 3557 | ToughOne | \$ 219.29 | MO | \$ 144.89 | MRY | \$ 146.38 | Murray | \$ 146.38 | TYC | \$ 78.33 |
| 29 | TYC | 3788 | ToughOne | \$ 133.44 | MO | \$ 197.64 | MRY | \$ 166.36 | Motorcraft | \$ 217.99 | TYC | \$ 111.80 |
| 30 | TYC | 4689 | ToughOne | \$ 127.49 | MO | \$ 94.89 | NO BID | NO BID | Murray | \$ 85.99 | TYC | \$ 98.85 |
| 31 | AC Delco | 15-63666 | ToughOne | \$ 122.39 | MO | \$ 114.89 | MRY | \$ 97.71 | Murray | \$ 97.71 | AC Delco | \$ 50.00 |
| 32 | AC Delco | 15-63787 | ToughOne | \$ 169.99 | MO | \$ 124.89 | MRY | \$ 127.82 | Murray | \$ 127.82 | AC Delco | \$ 102.53 |
| 33 | Motorcraft | DG1Z-19712-B | ToughOne | \$ 169.99 | MO | \$ 68.28 | NO BID | NO BID | Murray | \$ 157.99 | Spectra | \$ 142.56 |
| 34 | Motorcraft | HL3Z-19712-A | ToughOne | \$ 127.49 | MO | \$ 94.89 | NO BID | NO BID | Murray | \$ 85.99 | TYC | \$ 98.85 |
| 35 | Motorcraft | DA8Z-19703-C | ToughOne | \$ 287.09 | TEM | \$ 194.89 | NO BID | NO BID | Murray | \$ 85.99 | Four Season | \$ 294.15 |

| Bid Tabulation: Preliminary | | | Vendor A | | Vendor B | | Vendor C | | Vendor D | | Vendor E | |
|-----------------------------|------------|--------------|--------------------|------------|-----------------|------------|------------------------------|------------|------------------------------|------------|-----------------------|------------|
| | | | Advance Auto Parts | | NAPA Auto Parts | | O'Reilly Auto Parts (Bid #1) | | O'Reilly Auto Parts (Bid #2) | | Northport Auto Supply | |
| Item # | Brand | Part Number | Bid Brand | Unit Price | Bid Brand | Unit Price | Bid Brand | Unit Price | Bid Brand | Unit Price | Bid Brand | Unit Price |
| 36 | Motorcraft | HL3Z-19703-C | NO BID | NO BID | TEM | \$ 290.78 | NO BID | NO BID | Motorcraft | \$ 351.99 | Motorcraft | \$ 359.00 |
| 37 | AC Delco | 15-22303 | ToughOne | \$ 521.99 | TEM | \$ 395.01 | NO BID | NO BID | NO BID | NO BID | AC Delco | \$ 327.25 |
| 38 | AC Delco | 15-51267 | NO BID | NO BID | AC | \$ 12.48 | NO BID | NO BID | AC | \$ 396.62 | AC Delco | \$ 22.10 |
| 39 | AC Delco | M100095 | Delphi | \$ 223.54 | DFP | \$ 233.01 | NO BID | NO BID | Precision | \$ 216.29 | Delphi | \$ 228.83 |
| 40 | AC Delco | M1000235 | NO BID | NO BID | AC | \$ 143.79 | NO BID | NO BID | AC | \$ 275.03 | AC Delco | \$ 259.67 |
| 41 | AC Delco | HPM1035 | Delphi | \$ 477.78 | AC | \$ 147.99 | NO BID | NO BID | Precision | \$ 216.29 | AC Delco | \$ 194.69 |
| 42 | Motorcraft | BW1Z-9H307A | Delphi | \$ 373.99 | WNP | \$ 199.69 | PFP | \$ 344.46 | Precision | \$ 344.46 | Delphi | \$ 279.33 |
| 43 | Motorcraft | FL3Z-9A299C | Delphi | \$ 194.64 | MC | \$ 29.58 | NO BID | NO BID | Precision | \$ 325.99 | Motorcraft | \$ 43.61 |
| 44 | Motorcraft | FL3Z-9H307A | Delphi | \$ 214.19 | MC | \$ 100.79 | NO BID | NO BID | Precision | \$ 331.99 | Motorcraft | \$ 147.57 |
| 45 | Motorcraft | DG1Z-9H307P | Delphi | \$ 244.79 | MC | \$ 261.29 | NO BID | NO BID | NO BID | NO BID | Motorcraft | \$ 297.69 |
| 46 | Motorcraft | JL3Z-9H307G | Delphi | \$ 352.15 | NO BID | NO BID | NO BID | NO BID | Precision | \$ 206.00 | Motorcraft | \$ 159.24 |
| 47 | Moog | RK620218 | Moog | \$ 229.07 | NCP | \$ 200.21 | PRE | \$ 144.95 | Precision | \$ 144.95 | Moog | \$ 149.17 |
| 48 | Moog | RK620219 | Moog | \$ 135.28 | NCP | \$ 200.21 | PRE | \$ 144.95 | Precision | \$ 144.95 | Moog | \$ 149.17 |
| 49 | Moog | CK80038 | Moog | \$ 75.52 | NCP | \$ 49.89 | PRE | \$ 67.19 | Precision | \$ 67.19 | TRW | \$ 38.88 |
| 50 | Moog | CK80040 | Moog | \$ 75.52 | NCP | \$ 49.89 | MOO | \$ 67.19 | Precision | \$ 67.19 | TRW | \$ 38.88 |
| 51 | Moog | EV455 | Moog | \$ 40.69 | NCP | \$ 34.89 | MOO | \$ 44.29 | Moog | \$ 44.29 | TRW | \$ 23.83 |
| 52 | Moog | ES3693 | Moog | \$ 40.69 | NCP | \$ 44.89 | MOO | \$ 45.59 | Moog | \$ 46.40 | TRW | \$ 32.04 |
| 53 | Moog | ES3694 | Moog | \$ 41.43 | NCP | \$ 44.89 | MOO | \$ 46.40 | Moog | \$ 46.40 | TRW | \$ 32.04 |
| 54 | Moog | K200168 | Moog | \$ 11.51 | NCP | \$ 14.89 | PRE | \$ 13.83 | Moog | \$ 13.83 | TRW | \$ 9.37 |
| 55 | Moog | RK641799 | Moog | \$ 46.47 | NCP | \$ 39.89 | PRE | \$ 5.09 | Precision | \$ 50.87 | Moog | \$ 31.47 |
| 56 | Moog | RK641800 | Moog | \$ 38.17 | NCP | \$ 34.89 | PRE | \$ 41.27 | Precision | \$ 42.99 | Moog | \$ 26.07 |
| 57 | Moog | CK620955 | Moog | \$ 181.76 | NCP | \$ 74.89 | PRE | \$ 105.59 | Precision | \$ 105.99 | Moog | \$ 152.11 |
| 58 | Moog | CK620956 | Moog | \$ 181.76 | NCP | \$ 74.89 | PRE | \$ 105.59 | Precision | \$ 105.99 | Moog | \$ 152.11 |
| 59 | Moog | CK80669 | Moog | \$ 127.81 | NCP | \$ 84.89 | PRE | \$ 144.35 | Precision | \$ 144.35 | TRW | \$ 72.72 |
| 60 | Moog | CK80670 | Moog | \$ 127.81 | NCP | \$ 84.89 | PRE | \$ 144.35 | Precision | \$ 144.35 | TRW | \$ 72.72 |
| 61 | Moog | K200222 | Moog | \$ 5.75 | NCP | \$ 6.67 | MOO | \$ 7.60 | Moog | \$ 7.60 | TRW | \$ 4.64 |
| 62 | Moog | ES800621 | Moog | \$ 37.16 | NCP | \$ 34.89 | MOO | \$ 42.33 | Moog | \$ 42.33 | Moog | \$ 34.42 |
| 63 | Moog | CK80306 | Moog | \$ 110.38 | NCP | \$ 67.54 | PRE | \$ 81.13 | Precision | \$ 81.13 | TRW | \$ 59.33 |
| 64 | Moog | CK80308 | Moog | \$ 110.38 | NCP | \$ 67.54 | PRE | \$ 81.13 | Precision | \$ 81.13 | TRW | \$ 59.33 |
| 65 | Moog | RK621266 | Moog | \$ 118.68 | NCP | \$ 109.89 | PRE | \$ 150.88 | Precision | \$ 150.88 | Moog | \$ 140.77 |
| 66 | Moog | RK621267 | Moog | \$ 118.68 | NCP | \$ 109.89 | PRE | \$ 150.88 | Precision | \$ 150.88 | Moog | \$ 140.77 |
| 67 | Moog | ES800514 | Moog | \$ 84.35 | NCP | \$ 89.89 | MOO | \$ 93.63 | Moog | \$ 93.93 | TRW | \$ 71.08 |
| 68 | Moog | ES800515 | Moog | \$ 84.35 | NCP | \$ 89.89 | MOO | \$ 93.63 | Moog | \$ 93.63 | TRW | \$ 71.08 |
| 69 | Moog | EV800457 | Moog | \$ 28.11 | NCP | \$ 34.89 | MOO | \$ 31.74 | Moog | \$ 31.74 | TRW | \$ 22.55 |
| 70 | SKF | BR930506 | Moog | \$ 133.50 | PGB | \$ 59.96 | PRE | \$ 97.59 | Precision | \$ 97.59 | SKF | \$ 93.20 |

| Bid Tabulation: Preliminary | | | Vendor A | | Vendor B | | Vendor C | | Vendor D | | Vendor E | |
|-----------------------------|--------|--------------|--------------------|------------|-----------------|------------|------------------------------|------------|------------------------------|------------|-----------------------|------------|
| | | | Advance Auto Parts | | NAPA Auto Parts | | O'Reilly Auto Parts (Bid #1) | | O'Reilly Auto Parts (Bid #2) | | Northport Auto Supply | |
| Item # | Brand | Part Number | Bid Brand | Unit Price | Bid Brand | Unit Price | Bid Brand | Unit Price | Bid Brand | Unit Price | Bid Brand | Unit Price |
| 71 | SKF | BR930693 | Moog | \$ 206.18 | PGB | \$ 119.89 | PRE | \$ 204.79 | Precision | \$ 204.79 | SKF | \$ 187.15 |
| 72 | SKF | BR930742 | Moog | \$ 150.09 | PGB | \$ 104.89 | PRE | \$ 151.99 | Precision | \$ 151.99 | SKF | \$ 120.09 |
| 73 | SKF | BR930790 | Moog | \$ 165.89 | PGB | \$ 109.89 | PRE | \$ 232.79 | Precision | \$ 232.79 | SKF | \$ 193.28 |
| 74 | SKF | BR930915 | Moog | \$ 202.43 | BRG | \$ 213.80 | NO BID | NO BID | Precision | \$ 204.79 | SKF | \$ 172.00 |
| 75 | Anchor | 3024 | Anchor | \$ 71.37 | BK | \$ 64.89 | PTQ | \$ 34.98 | PTQ | \$ 34.48 | Anchor | \$ 45.01 |
| 76 | Anchor | 3025 | Anchor | \$ 68.79 | BK | \$ 64.89 | PTQ | \$ 40.93 | PTQ | \$ 40.93 | Anchor | \$ 45.01 |
| 77 | Anchor | 3180 | Anchor | \$ 116.09 | BK | \$ 14.89 | PTQ | \$ 116.77 | PTQ | \$ 71.99 | Anchor | \$ 71.24 |
| 78 | Anchor | 3211 | Anchor | \$ 78.25 | BK | \$ 66.36 | PTQ | \$ 52.61 | PTQ | \$ 52.61 | Anchor | \$ 48.50 |
| 79 | Anchor | 3218 | Anchor | \$ 28.80 | BK | \$ 49.89 | PTQ | \$ 44.39 | PTQ | \$ 44.39 | Anchor | \$ 58.44 |
| 80 | Anchor | 3219 | Anchor | \$ 56.75 | BK | \$ 64.89 | PTQ | \$ 52.26 | PTQ | \$ 52.26 | Anchor | \$ 77.94 |
| 81 | Anchor | 3275 | Anchor | \$ 130.71 | AR | \$ 40.79 | NO BID | NO BID | NO BID | NO BID | Anchor | \$ 89.04 |
| 82 | Anchor | 3276 | Anchor | \$ 128.99 | BK | \$ 34.89 | NO BID | NO BID | NO BID | NO BID | Anchor | \$ 89.04 |
| 83 | Anchor | 3371 | NO BID | NO BID | AR | \$ 80.99 | PTQ | \$ 82.79 | PTQ | \$ 82.79 | Anchor | \$ 59.89 |
| 84 | Anchor | 3372 | NO BID | NO BID | AR | \$ 91.99 | NO BID | NO BID | PTQ | \$ 82.79 | Anchor | \$ 79.64 |
| 85 | Dorman | 741-390 | Carquest | \$ 84.63 | NOE | \$ 79.89 | DOR | \$ 75.37 | Dorman | \$ 75.37 | ACI | \$ 64.03 |
| 86 | Dorman | 741-391 | Carquest | \$ 86.47 | NOE | \$ 79.89 | DOR | \$ 75.37 | Dorman | \$ 75.37 | ACI | \$ 64.03 |
| 87 | Dorman | 741-442 | Carquest | \$ 68.99 | NOE | \$ 79.89 | DOR | \$ 76.39 | Dorman | \$ 76.39 | ACI | \$ 67.51 |
| 88 | Dorman | 741-443 | Carquest | \$ 117.75 | NOE | \$ 79.89 | DOR | \$ 76.39 | Dorman | \$ 76.39 | ACI | \$ 67.51 |
| 89 | Dorman | 741-664 | Carquest | \$ 66.23 | NOE | \$ 74.89 | DOR | \$ 68.73 | Dorman | \$ 68.73 | ACI | \$ 60.86 |
| 90 | Dorman | 741-665 | Carquest | \$ 121.43 | NOE | \$ 74.89 | DOR | \$ 72.57 | Dorman | \$ 72.57 | ACI | \$ 60.86 |
| 91 | Dorman | 741-678 | Carquest | \$ 109.47 | NOE | \$ 79.89 | DOR | \$ 73.22 | Dorman | \$ 73.22 | ACI | \$ 60.86 |
| 92 | Dorman | 741-679 | Carquest | \$ 103.95 | NOE | \$ 79.89 | DOR | \$ 73.22 | Dorman | \$ 73.22 | ACI | \$ 60.86 |
| 93 | Dorman | 751-224 | Dorman | \$ 143.51 | NOE | \$ 94.89 | NO BID | NO BID | Dorman | \$ 163.14 | Dorman | \$ 104.92 |
| 94 | Dorman | 751-225 | Dorman | \$ 143.51 | NOE | \$ 94.89 | NO BID | NO BID | Dorman | \$ 163.14 | Dorman | \$ 104.92 |
| 95 | Dorman | 751-775 | Dorman | \$ 127.87 | NOE | \$ 84.89 | DOR | \$ 121.39 | Dorman | \$ 121.39 | Dorman | \$ 93.27 |
| 96 | Dorman | 931-140 | Dorman | \$ 162.68 | NOE | \$ 149.89 | DOR | \$ 179.51 | Dorman | \$ 179.51 | Dorman | \$ 131.80 |
| 97 | Dorman | 931-300 | Dorman | \$ 156.59 | NOE | \$ 174.89 | DOR | \$ 172.79 | Dorman | \$ 172.79 | Dorman | \$ 165.03 |
| 98 | Dorman | 931-301 | Dorman | \$ 100.04 | NOE | \$ 99.89 | DOR | \$ 110.39 | Dorman | \$ 110.39 | Dorman | \$ 89.33 |
| 99 | Dorman | 931-305 | Dorman | \$ 144.41 | NOE | \$ 154.89 | DOR | \$ 191.99 | Dorman | \$ 191.99 | Dorman | \$ 142.77 |
| 100 | Dorman | 931-332 | Dorman | \$ 194.87 | NOE | \$ 169.89 | BWD | \$ 166.59 | Dorman | \$ 212.23 | Dorman | \$ 156.28 |
| 101 | Dorman | 931-333 | Dorman | \$ 173.99 | NOE | \$ 129.89 | DOR | \$ 191.99 | Dorman | \$ 191.99 | Dorman | \$ 140.72 |
| 102 | TYC | 11-6787-00-9 | NO BID | NO BID | TYC | \$ 23.15 | NO BID | NO BID | NO BID | NO BID | TYC | \$ 78.69 |
| 103 | TYC | 11-6788-00-9 | NO BID | NO BID | TYC | \$ 23.15 | NO BID | NO BID | NO BID | NO BID | TYC | \$ 78.69 |
| 104 | TYC | 20-5233-90 | Dorman | \$ 56.54 | BK | \$ 59.89 | TYC | \$ 42.56 | TYC | \$ 42.56 | TYC | \$ 39.71 |
| 105 | TYC | 20-5234-90 | Dorman | \$ 53.93 | BK | \$ 59.89 | TYC | \$ 42.56 | TYC | \$ 42.56 | TYC | \$ 39.71 |

| Bid Tabulation: Preliminary | | | Vendor A | | Vendor B | | Vendor C | | Vendor D | | Vendor E | |
|-----------------------------|----------|-------------|--------------------|------------|-----------------|------------|------------------------------|------------|------------------------------|------------|-----------------------|------------|
| | | | Advance Auto Parts | | NAPA Auto Parts | | O'Reilly Auto Parts (Bid #1) | | O'Reilly Auto Parts (Bid #2) | | Northport Auto Supply | |
| Item # | Brand | Part Number | Bid Brand | Unit Price | Bid Brand | Unit Price | Bid Brand | Unit Price | Bid Brand | Unit Price | Bid Brand | Unit Price |
| 106 | TYC | 20-6755-00 | Dorman | \$ 129.62 | BK | \$ 109.89 | TYC | \$ 92.22 | TYC | \$ 92.22 | TYC | \$ 91.80 |
| 107 | TYC | 20-6756-00 | Dorman | \$ 129.62 | BK | \$ 109.89 | TYC | \$ 92.22 | TYC | \$ 92.22 | TYC | \$ 91.80 |
| 108 | AC Delco | 41-110 | AC Delco | \$ 7.19 | AC | \$ 6.48 | AC | \$ 7.99 | AC | \$ 7.99 | AC Delco | \$ 7.32 |
| 109 | AC Delco | 41-114 | AC Delco | \$ 10.25 | AC | \$ 6.48 | AC | \$ 7.99 | AC | \$ 7.99 | AC Delco | \$ 7.32 |
| 110 | AC Delco | 41-810 | Champion | \$ 4.67 | AC | \$ 5.44 | AC | \$ 6.20 | AC | \$ 6.20 | AC Delco | \$ 6.55 |
| 111 | AC Delco | 41-814 | Champion | \$ 4.67 | AC | \$ 5.44 | AC | \$ 6.74 | AC | \$ 6.74 | AC Delco | \$ 6.55 |
| 112 | AC Delco | 748UU | Driveworks | \$ 43.60 | NGW | \$ 59.89 | DEL | \$ 105.91 | AC | \$ 105.91 | AC Delco | \$ 76.00 |
| 113 | AC Delco | 9718Q | AC Delco | \$ 78.39 | BEL | \$ 29.89 | DEL | \$ 87.06 | AC | \$ 87.06 | AC Delco | \$ 61.07 |
| 114 | Denso | 673-6000 | BWD | \$ 43.45 | DEM | \$ 34.89 | BWD | \$ 45.97 | BWD | \$ 45.97 | Denso | \$ 28.99 |
| 115 | Denso | 673-6013 | BWD | \$ 63.95 | DEM | \$ 66.60 | BWD | \$ 64.53 | BWD | \$ 64.53 | Denso | \$ 73.21 |
| 116 | Denso | 673-6300 | BWD | \$ 51.65 | DEM | \$ 49.89 | BWD | \$ 49.36 | BWD | \$ 49.36 | Denso | \$ 64.35 |
| 117 | Denso | 673-6303 | BWD | \$ 63.95 | DEM | \$ 49.89 | BWD | \$ 66.08 | BWD | \$ 66.08 | Denso | \$ 48.87 |
| 118 | Denso | 673-6304 | BWD | \$ 40.99 | DEM | \$ 39.89 | BWD | \$ 42.67 | BWD | \$ 42.67 | Denso | \$ 48.92 |
| 119 | Denso | 673-7002 | BWD | \$ 78.71 | DEM | \$ 44.89 | BWD | \$ 67.28 | BWD | \$ 67.28 | Denso | \$ 77.61 |
| 120 | Denso | 673-7104 | BWD | \$ 72.15 | DEM | \$ 44.89 | BWD | \$ 41.26 | BWD | \$ 41.26 | Denso | \$ 79.53 |
| 121 | Gates | K040533 | Carquest | \$ 20.39 | NBH | \$ 5.69 | GAT | \$ 5.85 | GAT | \$ 5.85 | Gates | \$ 5.09 |
| 122 | Gates | K060448 | Gates | \$ 23.75 | NBH | \$ 14.89 | GAT | \$ 15.27 | GAT | \$ 15.27 | Gates | \$ 13.44 |
| 123 | Gates | K060535 | Carquest | \$ 14.27 | NBH | \$ 19.89 | GAT | \$ 18.67 | GAT | \$ 18.67 | Gates | \$ 16.60 |
| 124 | Gates | K060640 | Carquest | \$ 15.91 | NBH | \$ 19.89 | GAT | \$ 19.92 | GAT | \$ 19.92 | Gates | \$ 17.67 |
| 125 | Gates | K060714 | Carquest | \$ 18.01 | NBH | \$ 19.89 | GAT | \$ 17.16 | GAT | \$ 17.16 | Gates | \$ 15.91 |
| 126 | Gates | K060910 | Gates | \$ 22.76 | NBH | \$ 24.89 | GAT | \$ 21.70 | GAT | \$ 21.70 | Gates | \$ 19.83 |
| 127 | Gates | K060923 | Gates | \$ 34.31 | NBH | \$ 29.89 | GAT | \$ 29.05 | GAT | \$ 29.05 | Gates | \$ 26.87 |
| 128 | Gates | K060935 | Gates | \$ 27.71 | NBH | \$ 24.89 | GAT | \$ 23.85 | GAT | \$ 23.85 | Gates | \$ 22.14 |
| 129 | Gates | K030293SF | Carquest | \$ 16.99 | NBH | \$ 39.89 | GAT | \$ 35.55 | GAT | \$ 35.95 | Gates | \$ 33.21 |
| 130 | Gates | K040337SF | Carquest | \$ 10.06 | NBH | \$ 39.89 | GAT | \$ 22.88 | GAT | \$ 22.88 | Gates | \$ 33.37 |
| 131 | Gates | K040357SF | Carquest | \$ 14.95 | NBH | \$ 14.89 | GAT | \$ 14.27 | GAT | \$ 14.27 | Gates | \$ 11.69 |
| 132 | Gates | 38485 | Litens | \$ 55.99 | NBH | \$ 59.89 | GAT | \$ 61.43 | GAT | \$ 61.43 | Gates | \$ 55.38 |
| 133 | Gates | 39083 | Litens | \$ 40.79 | NBH | \$ 49.89 | GAT | \$ 46.70 | GAT | \$ 46.70 | Gates | \$ 48.74 |
| 134 | Gates | 39298 | Carquest | \$ 69.29 | NBH | \$ 59.89 | GAT | \$ 63.97 | GAT | \$ 25.16 | Gates | \$ 60.50 |
| 135 | Gates | 39299 | NO BID | NO BID | NBH | \$ 49.89 | GAT | \$ 51.99 | GAT | \$ 51.99 | Gates | \$ 47.76 |
| 136 | Gates | 39364 | NO BID | NO BID | NBH | \$ 29.89 | NO BID | NO BID | GAT | \$ 76.22 | Gates | \$ 28.94 |
| 137 | Gates | 39371 | NO BID | NO BID | NBH | \$ 34.89 | GAT | \$ 39.64 | GAT | \$ 39.64 | Gates | \$ 32.67 |
| 138 | Gates | 41118 | Carquest | \$ 43.06 | TFW | \$ 34.89 | MTC | \$ 40.12 | MTC | \$ 40.12 | Gates | \$ 26.37 |
| 139 | Gates | 42586 | Carquest | \$ 57.42 | TFW | \$ 44.89 | MTC | \$ 52.67 | MTC | \$ 52.67 | Gates | \$ 34.36 |
| 140 | Gates | 43016 | Carquest | \$ 89.83 | TFW | \$ 54.89 | NO BID | NO BID | GAT | \$ 81.99 | Gates | \$ 36.60 |

| Bid Tabulation: Preliminary | | | Vendor A | | Vendor B | | Vendor C | | Vendor D | | Vendor E | |
|-----------------------------|---------|-------------|--------------------|------------|-----------------|------------|------------------------------|------------|------------------------------|------------|-----------------------|------------|
| | | | Advance Auto Parts | | NAPA Auto Parts | | O'Reilly Auto Parts (Bid #1) | | O'Reilly Auto Parts (Bid #2) | | Northport Auto Supply | |
| Item # | Brand | Part Number | Bid Brand | Unit Price | Bid Brand | Unit Price | Bid Brand | Unit Price | Bid Brand | Unit Price | Bid Brand | Unit Price |
| 141 | Gates | 43318 | Carquest | \$ 65.44 | TFW | \$ 39.89 | NO BID | NO BID | MTC | \$ 86.11 | Gates | \$ 25.87 |
| 142 | Gates | 43504 | Carquest | \$ 39.35 | TFW | \$ 29.89 | MTC | \$ 28.41 | MTC | \$ 40.12 | Gates | \$ 23.59 |
| 143 | Gates | 45010 | Carquest | \$ 150.96 | TFW | \$ 109.89 | MTC | \$ 136.28 | MTC | \$ 136.28 | Gates | \$ 87.96 |
| 144 | Gates | 22437 | Carquest | \$ 17.75 | NBH | \$ 19.89 | GAT | \$ 19.14 | GAT | \$ 19.14 | Gates | \$ 16.14 |
| 145 | Gates | 23184 | Carquest | \$ 30.34 | NBH | \$ 34.89 | GAT | \$ 31.24 | GAT | \$ 31.24 | Gates | \$ 27.16 |
| 146 | Gates | 23544 | Carquest | \$ 24.78 | NBH | \$ 29.89 | GAT | \$ 26.96 | GAT | \$ 26.96 | Gates | \$ 23.19 |
| 147 | Gates | 23643 | Carquest | \$ 12.25 | NBH | \$ 14.89 | GAT | \$ 12.28 | GAT | \$ 12.28 | Gates | \$ 10.12 |
| 148 | Gates | 24338 | NO BID | NO BID | NBH | \$ 59.89 | GAT | \$ 58.64 | GAT | \$ 19.56 | Gates | \$ 54.28 |
| 149 | Gates | 24342 | NO BID | NO BID | NBH | \$ 19.89 | GAT | \$ 18.69 | GAT | \$ 19.56 | Gates | \$ 16.87 |
| 150 | Gates | 24381 | Carquest | \$ 24.78 | NBH | \$ 24.89 | GAT | \$ 22.76 | GAT | \$ 22.76 | Gates | \$ 20.65 |
| 151 | Gates | 24409 | NO BID | NO BID | NBH | \$ 34.89 | GAT | \$ 34.60 | GAT | \$ 34.60 | Gates | \$ 30.81 |
| 152 | Gates | 24418 | Carquest | \$ 12.25 | NBH | \$ 34.89 | NO BID | NO BID | GAT | \$ 79.24 | Gates | \$ 28.89 |
| 153 | Gates | 24423 | NO BID | NO BID | NBH | \$ 49.89 | NO BID | NO BID | GAT | \$ 79.26 | Gates | \$ 39.46 |
| 154 | Gates | 24451 | NO BID | NO BID | NBH | \$ 49.89 | GAT | \$ 48.81 | GAT | \$ 48.81 | Gates | \$ 43.43 |
| 155 | Trico | 19-140 | Trico | \$ 10.79 | OWI | \$ 8.17 | TRI | \$ 14.34 | Trico | \$ 3.59 | Trico | \$ 4.69 |
| 156 | Trico | 19-150 | Xtraclear | \$ 9.78 | OWI | \$ 8.17 | TRI | \$ 9.99 | Trico | \$ 3.59 | Trico | \$ 4.69 |
| 157 | Trico | 19-160 | Xtraclear | \$ 9.78 | OWI | \$ 8.37 | TRI | \$ 9.99 | Trico | \$ 3.59 | Trico | \$ 4.69 |
| 158 | Trico | 19-180 | Xtraclear | \$ 10.79 | OWI | \$ 8.64 | TRI | \$ 9.99 | Trico | \$ 3.59 | Trico | \$ 4.69 |
| 159 | Trico | 19-200 | Xtraclear | \$ 12.23 | OWI | \$ 9.03 | TRI | \$ 9.99 | Trico | \$ 3.59 | Trico | \$ 4.69 |
| 160 | Trico | 19-220 | Xtraclear | \$ 12.95 | OWI | \$ 9.22 | TRI | \$ 9.99 | Trico | \$ 3.59 | Trico | \$ 4.69 |
| 161 | Trico | 19-260 | Xtraclear | \$ 13.67 | OWI | \$ 10.17 | TRI | \$ 9.99 | Trico | \$ 5.59 | Trico | \$ 5.53 |
| 162 | Trico | 12-E | Trico | \$ 7.91 | OWI | \$ 3.48 | BOS | \$ 7.49 | Trico | \$ 9.99 | Trico | \$ 4.33 |
| 163 | Trico | 13-1 | Trico | \$ 6.47 | OWI | \$ 3.48 | TRI | \$ 3.29 | Trico | \$ 7.19 | Trico | \$ 3.31 |
| 164 | Trico | 16-J | Trico | \$ 7.19 | OWI | \$ 3.48 | TRI | \$ 7.99 | Trico | \$ 7.99 | Trico | \$ 4.33 |
| 165 | Baldwin | B2 | Carquest | \$ 3.15 | FIL | \$ 2.13 | WIX | \$ 3.76 | WIX | \$ 3.76 | Baldwin | \$ 2.44 |
| 166 | Baldwin | B6 | Carquest | \$ 3.50 | FIL | \$ 2.42 | WIX | \$ 4.27 | WIX | \$ 4.27 | Baldwin | \$ 2.86 |
| 167 | Baldwin | B31 | Carquest | \$ 3.01 | FIL | \$ 2.31 | WIX | \$ 4.07 | WIX | \$ 3.34 | Baldwin | \$ 3.40 |
| 168 | Baldwin | B34 | Carquest | \$ 3.50 | FIL | \$ 2.25 | WIX | \$ 3.98 | WIX | \$ 3.98 | Baldwin | \$ 2.76 |
| 169 | Baldwin | B160 | Carquest | \$ 3.15 | FIL | \$ 2.15 | WIX | \$ 3.79 | WIX | \$ 16.05 | Baldwin | \$ 2.44 |
| 170 | Baldwin | B329 | Carquest | \$ 2.87 | FIL | \$ 2.28 | WIX | \$ 4.02 | WIX | \$ 4.02 | Baldwin | \$ 2.91 |
| 171 | Baldwin | P7406 | Carquest | \$ 3.50 | FIL | \$ 2.32 | WIX | \$ 3.72 | WIX | \$ 3.72 | Baldwin | \$ 2.65 |
| 172 | Baldwin | B7449 | Carquest | \$ 3.50 | FIL | \$ 2.30 | WIX | \$ 4.05 | WIX | \$ 4.05 | Baldwin | \$ 2.76 |
| 173 | Baldwin | PA2152 | Carquest | \$ 4.20 | FIL | \$ 3.41 | WIX | \$ 5.47 | WIX | \$ 5.47 | Baldwin | \$ 4.24 |
| 174 | Baldwin | PA4113 | Carquest | \$ 8.05 | FIL | \$ 7.51 | WIX | \$ 12.07 | WIX | \$ 12.07 | Baldwin | \$ 8.11 |
| 175 | Baldwin | PA4321 | Carquest | \$ 5.95 | FIL | \$ 4.89 | WIX | \$ 7.85 | WIX | \$ 7.85 | Baldwin | \$ 5.71 |

| Bid Tabulation: Preliminary | | | Vendor A | | Vendor B | | Vendor C | | Vendor D | | Vendor E | |
|-----------------------------|---------|-------------|--------------------|------------|---------------------------------|------------|-----------------------------------|------------|----------------------------------|------------|-----------------------|------------|
| | | | Advance Auto Parts | | NAPA Auto Parts | | O'Reilly Auto Parts (Bid #1) | | O'Reilly Auto Parts (Bid #2) | | Northport Auto Supply | |
| Item # | Brand | Part Number | Bid Brand | Unit Price | Bid Brand | Unit Price | Bid Brand | Unit Price | Bid Brand | Unit Price | Bid Brand | Unit Price |
| 176 | Baldwin | PA4322 | Carquest | \$ 13.02 | FIL | \$ 10.65 | WIX | \$ 17.10 | WIX | \$ 17.10 | Baldwin | \$ 11.56 |
| 177 | Baldwin | PA4323 | Carquest | \$ 8.60 | FIL | \$ 7.04 | WIX | \$ 11.30 | WIX | \$ 11.30 | Baldwin | \$ 7.72 |
| 178 | Baldwin | BF7668 | Carquest | \$ 3.67 | FIL | \$ 3.32 | WIX | \$ 6.51 | WIX | \$ 6.51 | Baldwin | \$ 4.51 |
| Notes | | | No Bid on 15 Items | | Local Bidder. No Bid on 1 Item. | | Local Bidder. No Bid on 38 Items. | | Local Bidder. No Bid on 6 Items. | | | |