

Bid Tabulation: Preliminary		Vendor A		Vendor B		Vendor C		Vendor D		Vendor E		Vendor F		Vendor G			
		International Promotional Ideas		Brown & Bigelow		Working Persons Enterprises		Ervin's		Uniforms Manufacturing Inc.		Pro-Tuff Decals		ServiceWear Apparel			
Item #	Description	Size	Brand	Unit Price	Brand	Unit Price	Brand	Unit Price	Brand	Unit Price	Brand	Unit Price	Brand	Unit Price	Brand	Unit Price	
1	Crewneck Sweatshirt	S-XL	Gildan	\$ 7.19	Not Specified	Gildan	\$ 8.61	Gildan	\$ 9.45	Gildan	\$ 14.75	Gildan	\$ 8.13	Gildan	\$ 11.99	Gildan	\$ 16.93
		2X		\$ 12.08			\$ 10.99		\$ 11.38		\$ 18.56		\$ 9.84		\$ 13.99		\$ 16.93
		3X		\$ 12.52			\$ 11.43		\$ 12.07		\$ 19.47		\$ 10.46		\$ 14.99		\$ 16.93
		4X		\$ 12.52			\$ 13.67		\$ 12.07		No Bid		\$ 10.59		\$ 15.99		\$ 16.93
2	Full Zip Hooded Sweatshirt	S-XL	Gildan	\$ 14.37	Not Specified	Gildan	\$ 18.65	Gildan	\$ 22.22	Gildan	\$ 24.23	Gildan	\$ 14.36	Gildan	\$ 20.99	Gildan	\$ 42.60
		2X		\$ 18.06			\$ 22.63		\$ 25.77		\$ 27.41		\$ 16.97		\$ 22.99		\$ 42.60
		3X		\$ 22.59			\$ 24.16		\$ 26.47		\$ 29.48		\$ 17.23		\$ 23.99		\$ 42.60
		4X		\$ 22.59			\$ 25.77		\$ 28.07		No Bid		\$ 17.65		\$ 24.99		\$ 42.60
3	Hooded Sweatshirt	S-XL	Gildan	\$ 11.61	Not Specified	Gildan	\$ 12.81	Gildan	\$ 15.78	Gildan	\$ 19.55	Gildan	\$ 13.48	Gildan	\$ 17.99	Gildan	\$ 28.15
		2X		\$ 17.08			\$ 14.73		\$ 18.65		\$ 26.32		\$ 15.40		\$ 19.99		\$ 28.15
		3X		\$ 20.82			\$ 17.05		\$ 18.94		\$ 28.24		\$ 16.12		\$ 20.99		\$ 28.15
		4X		\$ 20.82			\$ 18.90		\$ 19.40		No Bid		\$ 17.05		\$ 21.99		\$ 28.15
4	Short Sleeve T-Shirt (no pocket)	S-XL	Gildan	\$ 3.35	Not Specified	Gildan	\$ 2.79	Gildan	\$ 4.31	Gildan	\$ 8.28	Gildan	\$ 3.92	Gildan	\$ 4.24	Gildan	\$ 9.25
		2X		\$ 4.91			\$ 3.49		\$ 6.44		\$ 10.19		\$ 5.86		\$ 6.24		\$ 9.25
		3X		\$ 6.27			\$ 5.99		\$ 7.70		\$ 12.29		\$ 7.00		\$ 7.24		\$ 9.25
		4X		\$ 6.27			\$ 6.99		\$ 7.70		\$ 12.29		\$ 7.00		\$ 8.24		\$ 9.25
5	Short Sleeve Pocket T-Shirt	S-XL	Gildan	\$ 6.34	Not Specified	Gildan	\$ 5.97	Gildan	\$ 5.92	Gildan	\$ 11.63	Gildan	\$ 6.25	Gildan	\$ 5.73	Gildan	\$ 14.81
		2X		\$ 8.22			\$ 7.96		\$ 8.38		\$ 14.05		\$ 8.78		\$ 7.73		\$ 14.81
		3X		\$ 10.16			\$ 10.55		\$ 8.54		\$ 14.80		\$ 9.76		\$ 8.73		\$ 14.81
		4X		\$ 10.16			\$ 10.55		\$ 8.71		\$ 14.80		\$ 9.76		\$ 9.73		\$ 14.81
6	Long Sleeve T-Shirt (no pocket)	S-XL	Gildan	\$ 5.22	Not Specified	Gildan	\$ 4.73	Gildan	\$ 6.14	Gildan	\$ 10.39	Gildan	\$ 5.59	Gildan	\$ 5.99	Gildan	\$ 13.85
		2X		\$ 6.71			\$ 6.33		\$ 8.61		\$ 12.85		\$ 7.83		\$ 7.99		\$ 13.85
		3X		\$ 9.97			\$ 7.99		\$ 9.32		\$ 13.65		\$ 8.48		\$ 8.99		\$ 13.85
		4X		\$ 9.97			\$ 7.99		\$ 9.44		\$ 13.65		\$ 8.59		\$ 9.99		\$ 13.85
7	Long Sleeve Pocket T-Shirt	S-XL	Gildan	\$ 7.63	Not Specified	Gildan	\$ 8.42	Gildan	\$ 9.85	Gildan	\$ 13.89	Gildan	\$ 8.97	Gildan	\$ 7.73	Gildan	\$ 16.61
		2X		\$ 8.66			\$ 9.81		\$ 11.51		\$ 15.32		\$ 10.47		\$ 9.73		\$ 16.61
		3X		\$ 10.69			\$ 10.88		\$ 12.34		\$ 17.04		\$ 11.23		\$ 10.73		\$ 16.61
		4X		\$ 10.69			\$ 10.88		\$ 12.58		\$ 17.04		\$ 11.31		\$ 11.73		\$ 16.61
8	Short Sleeve Dry-Blend T-Shirt	S-XL	Gildan	\$ 3.36	Not Specified	Gildan	\$ 2.79	Gildan	\$ 4.05	Gildan	\$ 8.28	Gildan	\$ 3.69	Gildan	\$ 3.99	Gildan	\$ 9.25
		2X		\$ 4.91			\$ 4.25		\$ 6.55		\$ 10.19		\$ 5.96		\$ 5.99		\$ 9.25
		3X		\$ 6.27			\$ 5.76		\$ 7.70		\$ 12.29		\$ 7.00		\$ 6.99		\$ 9.25
		4X		\$ 6.27			\$ 5.99		\$ 7.70		\$ 12.29		\$ 7.00		\$ 7.99		\$ 9.25
9	Long Sleeve Dry-Blend T-Shirt	S-XL	Gildan	\$ 5.50	Not Specified	Gildan	\$ 4.92	Gildan	\$ 6.72	Gildan	\$ 11.63	Gildan	\$ 5.57	Gildan	\$ 5.99	Gildan	\$ 15.20
		2X		\$ 6.50			\$ 5.70		\$ 8.61		\$ 14.05		\$ 7.09		\$ 7.99		\$ 15.20
		3X		\$ 7.81			\$ 6.93		\$ 8.89		\$ 14.80		\$ 7.33		\$ 8.99		\$ 15.20
		4X		\$ 7.81			\$ 7.99		\$ 9.31		\$ 14.80		\$ 7.72		\$ 9.99		\$ 15.20
10A	One-Color Screenprinting	1-12		\$ 1.00			No Bid		\$ 5.00	Included in bid price			\$ 4.43		\$ 3.50		No Bid
		13-24		\$ 1.00			\$ 1.50		\$ 4.38				\$ 4.43		\$ 2.80		No Bid
		25-36		\$ 1.00			\$ 1.25		\$ 3.31				\$ 4.43		\$ 2.00		No Bid
		37-48		\$ 1.00			\$ 1.00		\$ 3.31				\$ 4.43		\$ 1.00		No Bid
		49+		\$ 0.75			\$ 0.90		\$ 2.63				\$ 4.43		\$ 0.25		No Bid
10B	Two-Color Screenprinting	1-12		\$ 2.00			No Bid		No Bid	Included in bid price			No Bid		\$ 4.40		No Bid
		13-24		\$ 2.00			\$ 2.00		\$ 4.38				No Bid		\$ 3.55		No Bid
		25-36		\$ 2.00			\$ 7.75		No Bid				No Bid		\$ 2.60		No Bid
		37-48		\$ 2.00			\$ 1.25		No Bid				No Bid		\$ 1.50		No Bid
		49+		\$ 1.50			\$ 1.10		No Bid				No Bid		\$ 0.65		No Bid
Addendum Acknowledged?		Yes		Yes		Yes *		No *		No		Yes		No			
Notes						* Did not use replacement form		* Did use replacement form									

Bid Tabulation: Preliminary		Vendor H		Vendor I		Vendor J		Vendor K		Vendor L		Vendor M		Vendor N		
		Summit Uniforms		Elaborate Images		Tuscaloosa Blueprinting		Thomas Business Management Group		Alabama Industries for the Blind		Wells Printing & Promotional		Cintas		
Item #	Description	Size	Brand	Unit Price	Brand	Unit Price	Brand	Unit Price	Brand	Unit Price	Brand	Unit Price	Brand	Unit Price	Brand	Unit Price
1	Crewneck Sweatshirt	S-XL	Gildan	\$ 9.41	Gildan and/or P&C	\$ 9.31	Gildan	\$ 9.96	Gildan	\$ 10.99	Gildan	\$ 7.36	Gildan	\$ 7.15	P&C	\$ 11.00
		2X		\$ 12.69		\$ 12.73		\$ 11.96		\$ 13.99		\$ 10.86		\$ 11.25		
		3X		No Bid		\$ 14.49		\$ 12.96		\$ 13.99		\$ 12.13		\$ 11.25		
		4X		No Bid		\$ 15.42		\$ 12.96		No Bid		No Bid		\$ 11.25		
2	Full Zip Hooded Sweatshirt	S-XL	Gildan	\$ 14.89	Gildan and/or P&C	\$ 19.73	Gildan	\$ 23.00	Gildan	\$ 22.99	Gildan	\$ 16.83	Gildan	\$ 13.85	P&C	\$ 21.75
		2X		\$ 17.62		\$ 21.73		\$ 27.00		\$ 24.99		\$ 18.36		\$ 23.65		
		3X		\$ 19.50		\$ 22.73		\$ 28.00		\$ 24.99		\$ 23.16		\$ 23.65		
		4X		\$ 19.50		\$ 25.63		\$ 29.50		No Bid		No Bid		\$ 23.65		
3	Hooded Sweatshirt	S-XL	Gildan	\$ 14.89	Gildan and/or P&C	\$ 13.11	Gildan	\$ 16.50	Gildan	\$ 18.99	Gildan	\$ 12.53	Gildan	\$ 12.05	P&C	\$ 17.50
		2X		\$ 17.86		\$ 21.84		\$ 19.50		\$ 23.99		\$ 15.58		\$ 18.30		
		3X		No Bid		\$ 21.84		\$ 19.50		\$ 23.99		\$ 19.53		\$ 18.30		
		4X		No Bid		\$ 22.13		\$ 20.50		No Bid		No Bid		\$ 18.30		
4	Short Sleeve T-Shirt (no pocket)	S-XL	Gildan	\$ 2.84	Gildan and/or P&C	\$ 3.23	Gildan	\$ 4.50	Gildan	\$ 4.00	Gildan	\$ 2.81	Gildan	\$ 2.75	P&C	\$ 3.10
		2X		\$ 5.34		\$ 5.64		\$ 7.00		\$ 6.99		\$ 4.78		\$ 4.86		
		3X		\$ 7.41		\$ 6.74		\$ 8.00		\$ 7.99		\$ 6.34		\$ 7.25		
		4X		\$ 7.41		\$ 6.74		\$ 8.00		\$ 7.99		\$ 6.34		\$ 7.25		
5	Short Sleeve Pocket T-Shirt	S-XL	Gildan	\$ 6.97	Gildan and/or P&C	\$ 6.01	Gildan	\$ 7.25	Gildan	\$ 6.99	Gildan	\$ 5.59	Gildan	\$ 6.45	P&C	\$ 5.80
		2X		\$ 9.80		\$ 8.45		\$ 10.00		\$ 9.25		\$ 7.91		\$ 10.55		
		3X		\$ 10.89		\$ 9.39		\$ 11.00		\$ 10.99		\$ 9.60		\$ 10.55		
		4X		\$ 10.89		\$ 9.39		\$ 11.00		\$ 10.99		\$ 9.60		\$ 10.55		
6	Long Sleeve T-Shirt (no pocket)	S-XL	Gildan	\$ 4.61	Gildan and/or P&C	\$ 5.38	Gildan	\$ 8.25	Gildan	\$ 7.99	Gildan	\$ 5.19	Gildan	\$ 5.25	P&C	\$ 6.15
		2X		\$ 6.60		\$ 7.54		\$ 11.00		\$ 9.50		\$ 7.62		\$ 8.25		
		3X		\$ 8.87		\$ 8.16		\$ 11.50		\$ 10.99		\$ 9.38		\$ 10.30		
		4X		\$ 8.87		\$ 8.26		\$ 11.50		\$ 10.99		\$ 9.38		\$ 10.30		
7	Long Sleeve Pocket T-Shirt	S-XL	Gildan	\$ 10.01	Gildan and/or P&C	\$ 8.45	Gildan	\$ 10.50	Gildan	\$ 8.99	Gildan	\$ 7.21	Gildan	\$ 8.45	P&C	\$ 6.80
		2X		\$ 11.69		\$ 10.08		\$ 12.00		\$ 10.25		\$ 8.42		\$ 9.80		
		3X		\$ 12.53		\$ 10.80		\$ 13.00		\$ 11.99		\$ 10.22		\$ 11.40		
		4X		\$ 12.62		\$ 10.88		\$ 13.50		\$ 11.99		\$ 10.22		\$ 11.40		
8	Short Sleeve Dry-Blend T-Shirt	S-XL	Gildan	\$ 2.84	Gildan and/or P&C	\$ 3.15	Gildan	\$ 4.50	Gildan	\$ 4.00	Gildan	\$ 2.92	Gildan	\$ 2.75	P&C	\$ 4.15
		2X		\$ 5.34		\$ 5.74		\$ 6.50		\$ 6.25		\$ 4.92		\$ 4.86		
		3X		\$ 7.51		\$ 6.74		\$ 8.00		\$ 7.99		\$ 6.38		\$ 7.25		
		4X		\$ 7.51		\$ 6.74		\$ 8.00		\$ 7.99		\$ 6.38		\$ 7.25		
9	Long Sleeve Dry-Blend T-Shirt	S-XL	Gildan	\$ 6.12	Gildan and/or P&C	\$ 6.15	Gildan	\$ 7.50	Gildan	\$ 6.50	Gildan	\$ 5.25	Gildan	\$ 4.95	P&C	\$ 6.55
		2X		\$ 7.28		\$ 6.91		\$ 9.00		\$ 8.50		\$ 5.89		\$ 6.85		
		3X		No Bid		\$ 8.44		No Bid		\$ 8.50		\$ 7.42		\$ 8.35		
		4X		No Bid		\$ 8.15		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		
10A	One-Color Screenprinting	1-12		\$ 6.95		\$ 2.05		\$ 5.39		\$ 3.99		\$ 13.00		\$ 0.65		\$ 7.25
		13-24		\$ 5.95		\$ 1.74		\$ 4.35		\$ 3.50		\$ 7.80		\$ 0.65		
		25-36		\$ 4.95		\$ 1.24		\$ 4.00		\$ 3.25		\$ 2.88		\$ 0.65		
		37-48		\$ 3.95		\$ 0.79		\$ 3.82		\$ 2.40		\$ 2.18		\$ 0.65		
		49+		\$ 2.95		\$ 0.69		\$ 3.80		\$ 2.40		\$ 1.48		\$ 0.65		
10B	Two-Color Screenprinting	1-12		\$ 8.95		\$ 3.45		\$ 8.32		No Bid		\$ 14.51		\$ 0.70		\$ 8.40
		13-24		\$ 7.95		\$ 2.52		\$ 6.25		No Bid		\$ 8.27		\$ 0.70		
		25-36		\$ 6.95		\$ 1.80		\$ 5.50		No Bid		\$ 3.79		\$ 0.70		
		37-48		\$ 5.95		\$ 1.10		\$ 5.25		No Bid		\$ 2.96		\$ 0.70		
		49+		\$ 4.95		\$ 0.79		\$ 5.15		No Bid		\$ 1.92		\$ 0.70		
Addendum Acknowledged?		Yes		Yes		Yes		No		Yes		Yes		Yes		
Notes				Different Prices for Item #2 Kelly Green		Local Bidder								Local Bidder		

Bid Tabulation: Preliminary		Vendor P		Vendor Q		Vendor R		Vendor S		Vendor T		Vendor U		Vendor V			
		American Eagle Imagewear		Wagner's Team Sports		NAFECO, Inc.		Ad-Wear & Specialty of Texas		Municipal & Commercial Uniform		Premier Spirit Brands		McStitches Embellished Goods			
Item #	Description	Size	Brand	Unit Price	Brand	Unit Price	Brand	Unit Price	Brand	Unit Price	Brand	Unit Price	Brand	Unit Price	Brand	Unit Price	
1	Crewneck Sweatshirt	S-XL	Gildan	\$ 9.81	Not Specified	\$ 7.10	Gildan	\$ 12.00	Gildan	\$ 6.83	Port & Co.	\$ 9.15	Gildan	\$ 6.19	Gildan	\$ 9.75	
		2X		\$ 13.71		\$ 10.25		\$ 15.75		\$ 11.03		\$ 13.85		\$ 10.08		\$ 11.75	
		3X		\$ 15.55		\$ 10.80		No Bid		\$ 11.39		\$ 14.25		\$ 10.52		\$ 12.75	
		4X		\$ 15.20		\$ 11.15		No Bid		\$ 8.79		\$ 14.95		\$ 13.52		\$ 13.75	
2	Full Zip Hooded Sweatshirt	S-XL	Gildan	\$ 21.51	Not Specified	\$ 12.50	Gildan	\$ 22.50	Gildan	\$ 13.47	Port & Co.	\$ 25.05	Gildan	\$ 12.37	Gildan	\$ 15.00	
		2X		\$ 23.31		\$ 14.50		\$ 25.75		\$ 17.53		\$ 27.00		\$ 16.06		\$ 17.00	
		3X		\$ 28.49		\$ 16.25		\$ 26.50		\$ 21.59		\$ 30.90		\$ 19.59		\$ 18.00	
		4X		\$ 30.50		\$ 16.25		\$ 28.00		\$ 16.83		\$ 32.80		\$ 22.59		\$ 19.00	
3	Hooded Sweatshirt	S-XL	Gildan	\$ 14.37	Not Specified	\$ 11.24	Gildan	\$ 20.50	Gildan	\$ 10.59	Port & Co.	\$ 20.15	Gildan	\$ 9.61	Gildan	\$ 14.25	
		2X		\$ 17.53		\$ 14.35		\$ 25.00		\$ 16.63		\$ 25.05		\$ 15.08		\$ 16.25	
		3X		\$ 22.21		\$ 17.50		No Bid		\$ 19.67		\$ 26.35		\$ 17.82		\$ 17.25	
		4X		\$ 25.55		\$ 17.55		No Bid		\$ 13.33		\$ 28.30		\$ 20.82		\$ 18.25	
4	Short Sleeve T-Shirt (no pocket)	S-XL	Gildan	\$ 3.35	Not Specified	\$ 2.30	Gildan	\$ 3.10	Gildan	\$ 1.91	Port & Co.	\$ 4.90	Gildan	\$ 1.78	Gildan	\$ 4.25	
		2X		\$ 5.58		\$ 4.35		\$ 6.00		\$ 3.61		\$ 7.15		\$ 3.39		\$ 6.25	
		3X		\$ 7.25		\$ 5.70		\$ 7.70		\$ 4.79		\$ 7.85		\$ 4.52		\$ 7.25	
		4X		\$ 7.25		\$ 5.70		\$ 7.70		\$ 4.79		\$ 8.00		\$ 4.52		\$ 8.25	
5	Short Sleeve Pocket T-Shirt	S-XL	Gildan	\$ 6.36	Not Specified	\$ 5.10	Gildan	\$ 6.80	Gildan	\$ 3.40	Port & Co.	\$ 7.20	Gildan	\$ 4.84	Gildan	\$ 7.25	
		2X		\$ 8.88		\$ 7.20		\$ 9.60		\$ 5.11		\$ 10.30		\$ 6.72		\$ 9.25	
		3X		\$ 10.41		\$ 8.65		\$ 10.80		\$ 6.33		\$ 10.60		\$ 8.16		\$ 10.25	
		4X		\$ 10.41		\$ 8.65		\$ 10.80		\$ 6.33		\$ 10.80		\$ 8.16		\$ 11.25	
6	Long Sleeve T-Shirt (no pocket)	S-XL	Gildan	\$ 5.70	Not Specified	\$ 4.50	Gildan	\$ 6.10	Gildan	\$ 3.63	Port & Co.	\$ 9.05	Gildan	\$ 4.10	Gildan	\$ 6.50	
		2X		\$ 7.30		\$ 6.95		\$ 8.60		\$ 5.07		\$ 11.55		\$ 6.28		\$ 8.50	
		3X		\$ 9.17		\$ 8.71		\$ 9.30		\$ 6.43		\$ 12.05		\$ 7.97		\$ 9.50	
		4X		\$ 9.17		\$ 8.71		\$ 9.45		\$ 6.53		\$ 12.20		\$ 7.97		\$ 10.50	
7	Long Sleeve Pocket T-Shirt	S-XL	Gildan	\$ 8.19	Not Specified	\$ 6.60	Gildan	\$ 9.85	Gildan	\$ 6.13	Port & Co.	\$ 11.05	Gildan	\$ 6.13	Gildan	\$ 10.50	
		2X		\$ 9.98		\$ 8.10		\$ 11.50		\$ 7.16		\$ 12.90		\$ 7.16		\$ 12.50	
		3X		\$ 12.15		\$ 9.50		\$ 12.00		\$ 8.69		\$ 13.80		\$ 8.69		\$ 13.50	
		4X		\$ 12.15		\$ 9.65		\$ 12.50		\$ 8.69		\$ 13.90		\$ 8.69		\$ 14.50	
8	Short Sleeve Dry-Blend T-Shirt	S-XL	Gildan	\$ 3.38	Not Specified	\$ 2.25	Gildan	\$ 4.50	Gildan	\$ 1.91	Port & Co.	\$ 4.65	Gildan	\$ 2.27	Gildan	\$ 4.25	
		2X		\$ 5.58		\$ 4.40		\$ 7.00		\$ 3.61		\$ 7.20		\$ 4.05		\$ 6.25	
		3X		\$ 7.25		\$ 6.10		\$ 8.00		\$ 4.79		\$ 7.80		\$ 5.48		\$ 7.25	
		4X		\$ 7.25		\$ 6.10		\$ 8.00		\$ 4.79		\$ 7.95		\$ 5.48		\$ 8.25	
9	Long Sleeve Dry-Blend T-Shirt	S-XL	Gildan	\$ 5.69	Not Specified	\$ 5.00	Gildan	\$ 7.50	Gildan	\$ 3.67	Port & Co.	\$ 7.55	Gildan	\$ 4.47	Gildan	\$ 7.50	
		2X		\$ 6.31		\$ 6.10		\$ 9.25		\$ 4.07		\$ 9.65		\$ 5.01		\$ 9.50	
		3X		\$ 8.61		\$ 7.25		No Bid		\$ 5.47		\$ 9.99		\$ 6.31		\$ 10.50	
		4X		\$ 9.74		No Bid		No Bid		\$ 5.47		\$ 10.45		\$ 8.31		\$ 11.50	
10A	One-Color Screenprinting	1-12		\$ 1.35		\$ 4.00		No Bid	Additional \$25.00 for orders under 72 pieces	\$ 0.90		\$ 2.00		\$ 1.35		\$ 2.25	
		13-24		\$ 0.95		\$ 2.50		No Bid		\$ 0.90		\$ 2.00		\$ 1.05		\$ 2.00	
		25-36		\$ 0.80		\$ 2.05		\$ 5.00		\$ 0.90		\$ 1.75		\$ 0.87		\$ 1.50	
		37-48		\$ 0.65		\$ 1.60		\$ 5.00		\$ 0.90		\$ 1.75		\$ 0.75		\$ 1.35	
		49+		\$ 0.50		\$ 1.50		\$ 5.00		\$ 0.90		\$ 1.50		\$ 0.63		\$ 1.25	
10B	Two-Color Screenprinting	1-12		\$ 1.65		\$ 6.00		No Bid	Additional \$25.00 for orders under 72 pieces	\$ 0.90		\$ 2.00		\$ 2.03		\$ 3.75	
		13-24		\$ 1.25		\$ 4.50		No Bid		\$ 0.90		\$ 2.00		\$ 1.69		\$ 3.50	
		25-36		\$ 1.10		\$ 3.25		\$ 7.00		\$ 0.90		\$ 1.75		\$ 1.37		\$ 3.00	
		37-48		\$ 0.95		\$ 2.40		\$ 7.00		\$ 0.90		\$ 1.75		\$ 1.17		\$ 2.85	
		49+		\$ 0.80		\$ 2.25		\$ 7.00		\$ 0.90		\$ 1.50		\$ 0.97		\$ 2.75	
Addendum Acknowledged?		Yes		Yes		Yes		Yes		Yes		Yes		Yes		Yes	
Notes												Local Bidder		Local Bidder			