



Bulk Water Treatment Chemicals - Bid No. 9045-090926-1

Issue Date: 08/24/26

Open Date: 09/09/26

Bid Tabulation: Preliminary			Vendor	Vendor	Vendor	Vendor	Vendor	Vendor	Vendor	Vendor	Vendor	Vendor	Vendor	Vendor	Vendor	Vendor	
			Allied Universal Corp	Brenntag Mid-South LLC	CedarChem LLC	Chemrite Inc	Chemstream	Colonial Chemical Solutions Inc	Hawkins Inc	Mississippi Lime Co	Pencco Inc	Polydyne Inc	PVS DX Inc	Shannon Chemical LLC	The Dycho Company Inc	Thornton, Musso & Bellemin	Univar Solutions USA LLC
Item #	UOM	Description	Bid Price	Bid Price	Bid Price	Bid Price	Bid Price	Bid Price	Bid Price	Bid Price	Bid Price	Bid Price	Bid Price	Bid Price	Bid Price	Bid Price	
1	Per Ton Wet	Fluorosilicic Acid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$2,128.05	No Bid	No Bid	\$5,679.77	No Bid	No Bid	\$1,500.00
2	Per Ton Dry	Liquid Sodium Hydroxide - 50%	No Bid	\$829.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$1,156.00	\$958.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$1,052.27	No Bid	\$765.00
3	Per Gallon as Delivered	Liquid Sodium Hypochlorite	\$1.65	\$1.92	No Bid	No Bid	\$2.04	No Bid	\$1.75	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$1.98	No Bid	\$1.90	No Bid	No Bid
4	Per 55 Gallon Drum	Liquid Sodium Permanganate	No Bid	\$799.95	No Bid	\$683.40	\$1,143.48	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$803.84	\$795.00	No Bid	No Bid
5	Per 50lb Bag	Anionic Polyacrylamide Polymer	No Bid	No Bid	\$106.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$81.40	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
6	Per Ton Wet	Liquid Lime	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$0.089	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
7	Per Gallon as Delivered	50% Citric Acid	No Bid	\$10.15	No Bid	\$10.43	\$11.20	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$11.47	\$10.25	\$11.23	\$7.6275
8	Per Gallon as Delivered	Sodium Thiosulfate	No Bid	\$4.22	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$5.27	No Bid	No Bid
9	Per Ton Dry	Liquid Sodium Hydroxide - 25%	No Bid	\$1,088.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$644.00	\$1,292.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$1,302.27	No Bid	\$935.00