



AGGREGATES, GRAVEL, ROCK, AND STONE - BID NO. 9046-090226-3

Issue Date: 08/19/2026

Open Date: 09/02/2026

Bid Tabulation: Preliminary		Vendor			Vendor			Vendor		
Bid # 9046-090226-3		Bunn Brothers Materials			Martin Marietta			Vulcan Materials		
Item #	Description	Source Quarry/Mine Address	Price Per Ton Picked up	Price Per Ton Delivered	Source Quarry/Mine Address	Price Per Ton Picked up	Price Per Ton Delivered	Source Quarry/Mine Address	Price Per Ton Picked up	Price Per Ton Delivered
	Schedule A - Limestone Base									
1	Gravel #57 ALDOT Spec Section 801 Limestone Base	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	10445 Frog Lady Rd. Vance, AL 35490	\$29.00	\$35.00	11707 Vulcan Rd. Vance, AL 35490	\$33.00	\$43.30
2	Screenings AHD #8910 ALDOT Spec Section 801 Limestone Base	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	10445 Frog Lady Rd. Vance, AL 35490	\$23.00	\$29.00	11707 Vulcan Rd. Vance, AL 35490	\$27.00	\$37.30
3	Crushed Aggregate Base, 825B ALDOT Spec Section 825 Limestone Base	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	10445 Frog Lady Rd. Vance, AL 35490	\$25.00	\$31.80	11707 Vulcan Rd. Vance, AL 35490	\$26.00	\$36.30
4	Class I, per Ton ALDOT Spec Section 814 Limestone Base	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	10445 Frog Lady Rd. Vance, AL 35490	\$33.75	\$40.55	11707 Vulcan Rd. Vance, AL 35490	\$37.50	\$48.80
5	Class II, per Ton ALDOT Spec section 814 Limestone Base	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	10445 Frog Lady Rd. Vance, AL 35490	\$33.75	\$40.55	11707 Vulcan Rd. Vance, AL 35490	\$37.50	\$48.80
Item #	Description	Source Quarry/Mine Address	Price Per Ton Picked up	Price Per Ton Delivered	Source Quarry/Mine Address	Price Per Ton Picked up	Price Per Ton Delivered	Source Quarry/Mine Address	Price Per Ton Picked up	Price Per Ton Delivered
	Schedule B - Sandstone Base									
6	Gravel #57 ALDOT Spec Section 801 Sandstone Base	15040 Howton Loop Rd. Brookwood, AL 35444	\$23.00	\$30.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid



AGGREGATES, GRAVEL, ROCK, AND STONE - BID NO. 9046-090226-3

Issue Date: 08/19/2026

Open Date: 09/02/2026

Bid Tabulation: Preliminary		Vendor			Vendor			Vendor		
Bid # 9046-090226-3		Bunn Brothers Materials			Martin Marietta			Vulcan Materials		
Item #	Description	Source Quarry/Mine Address	Price Per Ton Picked up	Price Per Ton Delivered	Source Quarry/Mine Address	Price Per Ton Picked up	Price Per Ton Delivered	Source Quarry/Mine Address	Price Per Ton Picked up	Price Per Ton Delivered
7	Screenings AHD #8910 ALDOT Spec Section 801 Sandstone Base	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
8	Crushed Aggregate Base, 825B ALDOT Spec Section 825 Sandstone Base	15040 Howton Loop Rd. Brookwood, AL 35444	\$18.00	\$25.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
9	Class I, per Ton ALDOT Spec Section 814 Sandstone Base	15040 Howton Loop Rd. Brookwood, AL 35444	\$27.00	\$34.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
10	Class II, per Ton ALDOT Spec Section 814 Sandstone Base	15040 Howton Loop Rd. Brookwood, AL 35444	\$27.00	\$34.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid