



Emergency Lighting & Equipment for Public Safety Vehicles (rebid)

Bid No. 5010-080726-1

Issue Date: 07/27/2026

Open Date: 08/14/2026

Preliminary Bid Tab

			Vendor	Vendor	Vendor	Vendor	Vendor
			Dana Safety	Lehr Upfitters	Richardson Communications	Alabama Upfitters	Pro-fit Outfitters
Schedule	Line	Manufacturer/Brand	Discount % off MSRP / Unit Price	Discount % off MSRP / Unit Price	Discount % off MSRP / Unit Price	Discount % off MSRP / Unit Price	Discount % off MSRP / Unit Price
A	1	Blac-Rac	32.00%	10.00%	No Bid		
	Core Evaluation Items		Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price
	2	1082 - Gun Rack	\$525.00	\$516.29	\$491.44		
	3	1077 - Gun Rack	\$174.00	\$203.87	\$182.13		
	4	1088 - Gun Rack	\$574.00	\$575.92	\$535.16		
	Core Evaluation Total		\$1,273.00	\$1,296.08	\$1,208.73		
	Delivery Days ARO		14 days	16 days	15 days		
Schedule	Line	Manufacturer/Brand	Discount % off MSRP / Unit Price	Discount % off MSRP / Unit Price	Discount % off MSRP / Unit Price	Discount % off MSRP / Unit Price	Discount % off MSRP / Unit Price
B	1	Code-3	40.00%	No Bid	48.00%		
	Core Evaluation Items		Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price
	2	CD3794BW - Light Head	\$89.00	No Bid	\$79.18		
	3	CD3794RBW - Light Head	\$118.00	No Bid	\$107.00		
	4	CD3793BW - Light Head	\$76.00	No Bid	\$69.39		
	Core Evaluation Total		\$283.00	No Bid	\$255.57		
	Delivery Days ARO		14 days	No Bid	30 days		
Schedule	Line	Manufacturer/Brand	Discount % off MSRP / Unit Price	Discount % off MSRP / Unit Price	Discount % off MSRP / Unit Price	Discount % off MSRP / Unit Price	Discount % off MSRP / Unit Price
C	1	Federal Signal	No Bid	49.00%	No Bid		
	Core Evaluation Items		Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price
	2	VALR51JPF3AL - Light Bar	No Bid	\$2,512.35	No Bid		
	3	MPS63U-RBW - Micropulse Light	No Bid	\$102.47	No Bid		



Emergency Lighting & Equipment for Public Safety Vehicles (rebid)

Bid No. 5010-080726-1

Issue Date: 07/27/2026

Open Date: 08/14/2026

Preliminary Bid Tab			Vendor	Vendor	Vendor	Vendor	Vendor
			Dana Safety	Lehr Upfitters	Richardson Communications	Alabama Upfitters	Pro-fit Outfitters
	4	MPS123U-RBW - Micropulse Light	No Bid	\$129.63	No Bid		
	Core Evaluation Total		No Bid	\$2,744.45	No Bid		
	Delivery Days ARO		No Bid	56 days	No Bid		
Schedule	Line	Manufacturer/Brand	Discount % off MSRP / Unit Price	Discount % off MSRP / Unit Price	Discount % off MSRP / Unit Price	Discount % off MSRP / Unit Price	Discount % off MSRP / Unit Price
D	1	Feniex	40.00%	No Bid	No Bid		
		Core Evaluation Items	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price
	2	QT 6020S - Light Bar	\$1,798.00	No Bid	No Bid		
	3	QT4420S - Light Bar	\$1,558.00	No Bid	No Bid		
	4	S-2009 - Speaker	\$154.00	No Bid	No Bid		
	Core Evaluation Total		\$3,510.00	No Bid	No Bid		
	Delivery Days ARO		30 days	No Bid	No Bid		
Schedule	Line	Manufacturer/Brand	Discount % off MSRP / Unit Price	Discount % off MSRP / Unit Price	Discount % off MSRP / Unit Price	Discount % off MSRP / Unit Price	Discount % off MSRP / Unit Price
E	1	Gambler Johnson	40.00%	15.00%	No Bid		
		Core Evaluation Items	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price
	2	7170-0883-03 - Console	\$1,224.00	\$1,165.53	No Bid		
	3	7160-2022-01 - Console	\$602.00	\$558.72	No Bid		
	4	7170-0885-01 - Console	\$827.00	\$755.02	No Bid		
	Core Evaluation Total		\$2,653.00	\$2,479.27	No Bid		
	Delivery Days ARO		28 days	14 days	No Bid		

Emergency Lighting & Equipment for Public Safety Vehicles (rebid)

Bid No. 5010-080726-1

Issue Date: 07/27/2026

Open Date: 08/14/2026

Preliminary Bid Tab			Vendor	Vendor	Vendor	Vendor	Vendor
			Dana Safety	Lehr Upfitters	Richardson Communications	Alabama Upfitters	Pro-fit Outfitters
Schedule	Line	Manufacturer/Brand	Discount % off MSRP / Unit Price	Discount % off MSRP / Unit Price	Discount % off MSRP / Unit Price	Discount % off MSRP / Unit Price	Discount % off MSRP / Unit Price
F	1	Havis	35.00%	No Bid	No Bid		
		Core Evaluation Items	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price
	2	C-DMM-3024 - Dash Mount	\$351.00	No Bid	No Bid		
	3	DS-DELL-901 - Table Dock	\$694.00	No Bid	No Bid		
	4	C-DMM-3011 - Dash Mount	\$399.00	No Bid	No Bid		
	Core Evaluation Total		\$1,444.00	No Bid	No Bid		
	Delivery Days ARO		28 days	No Bid	No Bid		
Schedule	Line	Manufacturer/Brand	Discount % off MSRP / Unit Price	Discount % off MSRP / Unit Price	Discount % off MSRP / Unit Price	Discount % off MSRP / Unit Price	Discount % off MSRP / Unit Price
G	1	Jotto Public Safety	33.00%	32.00%	No Bid		
		Core Evaluation Items	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price
	2	425-6677 - Console	\$595.00	\$536.24	\$612.69		
	3	475-2408 - Gun Lock	\$481.00	\$447.67	\$520.81		
	4	475-2140 - Single Cell	\$1,998.00	\$1,992.50	\$2,159.70		
	Core Evaluation Total		\$3,074.00	\$2,976.41	\$3,293.20		
	Delivery Days ARO		25 days	28 days	30 days		
Schedule	Line	Manufacturer/Brand	Discount % off MSRP / Unit Price	Discount % off MSRP / Unit Price	Discount % off MSRP / Unit Price	Discount % off MSRP / Unit Price	Discount % off MSRP / Unit Price
	1	Pro-Guard	25.00%	No Bid	No Bid		
		Core Evaluation Items	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price

Emergency Lighting & Equipment for Public Safety Vehicles (rebid)

Bid No. 5010-080726-1

Issue Date: 07/27/2026

Open Date: 08/14/2026

Preliminary Bid Tab			Vendor	Vendor	Vendor	Vendor	Vendor
			Dana Safety	Lehr Upfitters	Richardson Communications	Alabama Upfitters	Pro-fit Outfitters
H	2	GMM - Motorcycle Gun Rack	\$422.35	No Bid	No Bid		
	3	GVM - Freestanding Gun Rack	\$589.00	No Bid	No Bid		
	4	GVPM - Freestanding Gun Rack	\$562.00	No Bid	No Bid		
	Core Evaluation Total		\$1,573.35	No Bid	No Bid		
	Delivery Days ARO		30 days	No Bid	No Bid		
Schedule	Line	Manufacturer/Brand	Discount % off MSRP / Unit Price	Discount % off MSRP / Unit Price	Discount % off MSRP / Unit Price	Discount % off MSRP / Unit Price	Discount % off MSRP / Unit Price
I	1	Setina	30.00%	No Bid	No Bid		
		Core Evaluation Items	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price
	2	BK2020DUR21 - Push Bumper	\$867.00	No Bid	No Bid		
	3	BK2020DRT192500 - Push Bumper	\$867.00	No Bid	No Bid		
	4	TK1460DUR11 - Cargo Storage	\$888.00	No Bid	No Bid		
	Core Evaluation Total		\$2,622.00	No Bid	No Bid		
	Delivery Days ARO		30 days	No Bid	No Bid		
Schedule	Line	Manufacturer/Brand	Discount % off MSRP / Unit Price	Discount % off MSRP / Unit Price	Discount % off MSRP / Unit Price	Discount % off MSRP / Unit Price	Discount % off MSRP / Unit Price
J	1	Troy Products	34.00%	No Bid	No Bid		
		Core Evaluation Items	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price
	2	CC-21DURPRTR-14 - Printer Console	\$608.00	No Bid	No Bid		
	3	KIT-TP-SL6-21DR-SS - Partition Kit	\$940.00	No Bid	No Bid		
	4	CP-21DUR-CG-MNT - Cargo Mount	\$579.00	No Bid	No Bid		



Emergency Lighting & Equipment for Public Safety Vehicles (rebid)

Bid No. 5010-080726-1

Issue Date: 07/27/2026

Open Date: 08/14/2026

Preliminary Bid Tab			Vendor	Vendor	Vendor	Vendor	Vendor
			Dana Safety	Lehr Upfitters	Richardson Communications	Alabama Upfitters	Pro-fit Outfitters
	Core Evaluation Total		\$2,127.00	No Bid	No Bid		
	Delivery Days ARO		30 days	No Bid	No Bid		
Schedule	Line	Manufacturer/Brand	Discount % off MSRP / Unit Price	Discount % off MSRP / Unit Price	Discount % off MSRP / Unit Price	Discount % off MSRP / Unit Price	Discount % off MSRP / Unit Price
K	1	Westin	40.00%	54.00%	No Bid		
		Core Evaluation Items	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price
	2	38-11011 - Gun Rack	\$398.00	\$360.66	\$370.57		
	3	38-11424 - Dual Gun rack	\$685.00	\$622.95	\$632.27		
	4	38-3004 - Suppressor Adapter	\$42.00	\$34.43	\$45.20		
	Core Evaluation Total		\$1,125.00	\$1,018.04	\$1,048.04		
	Delivery Days ARO		45 days	56 days	15-45 days		
NOTES						Not considered - submission referenced cancelled IFB 5010-080326-1.	Not considered - submission referenced cancelled IFB 5010-080326-1.