
Line Item Part Description Bid Price Bid Price Bid Price Bid Price Bid Price
Schedule 1 UOM LED Traffic Lamps

1.1 Ea. 12" LED Red Traffic lamp w/5yr Warranty 50.24$                    No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 55.00$                    48.00$                    40.00$                  
1.2 Ea. 12" LED Yellow Traffic lamp w/5yr Warranty 50.24$                    No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 55.00$                    48.00$                    40.00$                  
1.3 Ea. 12" LED Green Traffic lamp w/5yr Warranty 50.24$                    No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 55.00$                    48.00$                    40.00$                  
1.4 Ea. 12" LED Red Arrow Traffic lamp w/5yr Warranty 55.04$                    No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 55.00$                    56.00$                    48.00$                  
1.5 Ea. 12" LED Yellow Arrow Traffic lamp w/5yr Warranty 55.04$                    No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 55.00$                    56.00$                    48.00$                  
1.6 Ea. 12" LED Green Arrow Traffic lamp w/5yr Warranty 55.04$                    No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 55.00$                    56.00$                    48.00$                  

Schedule 1 Total 315.84$                  330.00$                  312.00$                  264.00$                
Schedule 2 Traficam System Components

2.1 Ea. Traficam Camera Narrow Angle 10-6091a 1,645.00$               No Bid No Bid 995.00$                  No Bid No Bid No Bid 1,795.00$             
2.2 Ea. Traficam Camera Wide Angle 10-6090a 1,645.00$               No Bid No Bid 1,095.00$               No Bid No Bid No Bid 1,795.00$             
2.3 1000' Reel Traficam Belden 9402 Cable 590.00$                  No Bid No Bid 995.00$                  No Bid No Bid No Bid 650.00$                
2.4 Ea. 4TI 4-Channel Termination Board p/n 725-176 1,200.00$               No Bid No Bid 495.00$                  No Bid No Bid No Bid 1,300.00$             

Schedule 2 Total 5,080.00$               3,580.00$               5,540.00$             
Schedule 3 Pedestrian Signals & Supplies 

3.1 Ea. 18" Pedestrian Signal LED w/Countdown Feature Clamshell mount 
included left or right 285.00$                  348.00$                  No Bid No Bid No Bid 420.00$                  488.00$                  435.00$                

3.2 Ea. 18" Pedestrian Signal Retrofit LED w/ Countdown feature 145.00$                  142.00$                  No Bid No Bid No Bid 150.00$                  418.00$                  145.00$                

3.3 Ea. BDL3-X Bulldog III Pedetrian Push Button Complete w/cup black or 
yellow 175.00$                  142.00$                  No Bid No Bid No Bid 160.00$                  121.00$                  No Bid

Schedule 3 Total 605.00$                  632.00$                  730.00$                  1,027.00$               
Schedule 4 Miscellaneous

4.1 Lin. Ft 12 Gauge USE Copper Stranded Wire No Bid No Bid 0.23$                      No Bid 0.57$                      No Bid No Bid No Bid
4.2 Lin. Ft Signal Cable, IMSA 20-1 #14 7 Conductor Stranded Copper No Bid No Bid 0.85$                      No Bid 2.43$                      No Bid No Bid 1.52$                    
4.3 Lin. Ft Signal Cable, IMSA 20-1 #14 10 Conductor Stranded Copper No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 3.68$                      No Bid No Bid No Bid
4.4 Lin. Ft 3/8" Guy Cable Galvanized No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 1.28$                      No Bid No Bid 0.95$                    
4.5 Lin. Ft Lead-in Cable IMSA 50-2 #14 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 1.05$                      No Bid No Bid 2.15$                    
4.6 Lin. Ft #6 THHN / THWN Stranded Copper No Bid No Bid 0.96$                      No Bid 1.80$                      No Bid No Bid No Bid
4.7 Lin. Ft #8 THHN / THWN Stranded Copper No Bid No Bid 0.63$                      No Bid 1.17$                      No Bid No Bid No Bid
4.8 Ea. T&B SLK-M 12-4AWG Mech Breakaway Inline Fuse Holder No Bid No Bid 34.11$                    No Bid 67.54$                    No Bid No Bid No Bid
4.9 Ea. Buss KTK 3 Amp 600 Volt Midget Fuses No Bid No Bid 10.27$                    No Bid 25.35$                    No Bid No Bid 75.00$                  

4.10 Ea. 18TG Orbit 2.0 Standard Unit Sign Hanger 2.0 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid  $95  or $110 in 
black 

4.11 Ea. Stellar Clamp Kit AS-3009-84-PNC w/AB-0512 Cable & AB-0256 V-
Bolt kits No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 130.00$                  230.00$                

4.12 Ea. EDI Oracle s1e Series - Single Channel Shelf Mount Detector, Must 
Meet Current ALDOT Specs No Bid No Bid No Bid 12,995.00$             No Bid 354.00$                  395.00$                

4.13 Ea. Card Rack EDI Oracle 4H Series - Quad Channel 1/2 Width No Bid No Bid No Bid  included with 4.12 No Bid 431.00$                  695.00$                
Schedule 4 Total
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