
Line Item Part Description Bid Price Bid Price Bid Price Bid Price Bid Price
Schedule 1 Fiber Optic Supplies

1.1 288 Count - 288ZU4-T4722D20 No Bid 3.28 & 1.70 No Bid No Bid 3.68$                     
1.2 144 Count - 144ZU4-T4722D20 No Bid 1.77 & 0.09 No Bid No Bid 1.92$                     
1.3 48 Count - 048ZU4-T4F22D20 No Bid 0.62 & 0.44 No Bid No Bid 0.75$                     
1.4 24 Count - 024ZU4-T4F22D20 No Bid 0.46 & 0.34 No Bid No Bid 0.58$                     
1.5 12 Count 012ZU4-T4F22D20 No Bid 0.35 & 0.29 No Bid No Bid 0.48$                     
1.6 6 Count 006E8F-31131-29 No Bid 0.59 & 0.86 No Bid No Bid 0.59$                     
1.7 144 Count - 144zZH4-Y4F40A20 No Bid 2.30 & 0.81 No Bid No Bid 2.38$                     

1.8 Corning 4 Unit Housing - CCH-04U No Bid 470.00 & 415.00 No Bid No Bid 439.00$                 
1.9 Corning 2 Unit Housing - CCH-02U No Bid 365.02 & 286.50 No Bid No Bid 344.00$                 

1.10 Corning 12 Fiber Cassette (sm) - CCH-CS12-A9-
P00RE No Bid 531.01 & 660.00 No Bid No Bid 444.00$                 

1.11 AFL 6 Fiber Cassette - PM-L-06-ULC-0-S-01 No Bid 148.75$                   No Bid No Bid 156.50$                 
1.12 AFL 12 Fiber Cassette - PM-L-12-ULC-0-S-01 No Bid 181.00$                   No Bid No Bid 189.75$                 
1.13 AFL Single Cassette Housing - WME01E No Bid 68.25$                     No Bid No Bid 75.00$                   
1.14 AFL DinRail Kit - FM003388 No Bid 6.35$                       No Bid No Bid 7.25$                     

1.15 Corning 144 Splice Case with Trays - SCF-6C28-01-
144 No Bid 613.00 & 315.00 No Bid No Bid 955.00$                 

1.16 Corning 72 Splice Case with Trays - SCF-6C22-01-
072 No Bid 510.00 & 315.00 No Bid No Bid 408.00$                 

1.17 Corning (SM) ST Unicam - 95-200-51 No Bid 20.60$                     No Bid No Bid 19.50$                   
1.18 Corning (SM) LC Unicam - 95-200-41 No Bid 18.75 & 13.75 No Bid No Bid 17.75$                   
1.19 Corning Heat Shrink 60 MM - 2806031-01 No Bid 65.50 & 11.50 No Bid No Bid 64.00$                   

Schedule 1 Total
Schedule 2 Junction Box  Encolsures

Corning Unicams 

Corning Splice Supplies 
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2.1
Quazite 24x36x24 with Communications or Fiber Optic 
Lid included (Tier 22) -
PG2436BA24

1,252.00$                697.00$                   No Bid No Bid 11,280.00$            

2.2
Quazite 13x24x12 with Communications or Fiber Optic 
Lid included (Tier 22) - PG
1324BA12

382.04$                   145.00 & 510.00 No Bid No Bid 425.00$                 

Schedule 2 Total 1,634.04$                
Schedule 3 NEMA Control Cabinets

3.1 TS2 Type 1 Eight Phase Base Mount Cabinet No Bid No Bid 17,945.00$              15,044.00$              No Bid
3.2 TS2 Type 1 Eight Phase Pole Mount Cabinet No Bid No Bid 15,965.00$              13,714.00$              No Bid

Schedule 3 Total
Schedule 4 Street Light Poles & Transformer Bases

4.1 Transformer Bases (replacement) per Specs TB1 724.71$                   No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

4.2 Transformer Bases (replacement) per Specs TB2 650.00$                   No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

4.3 Transformer Bases (replacement) per Specs TB3 921.20$                   No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Schedule 4 Total 2,295.91$                
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Schedule 5 Camera Supplies

5.1 Ubiquiti AP (Rocket) - NS-5AC No Bid 143.00$                   No Bid No Bid 145.00$                 
5.2 Ubiquiti Nanostation - LOCO5AC No Bid 56.00$                     No Bid No Bid 58.00$                   
5.3 Ubiquiti POE - POE-48-24W-G No Bid 17.85$                     No Bid No Bid 15.00$                   

5.4 Antaria 90w POE Output 12 Port switch - LMP-1204G-
SFP-T No Bid 1,765.00$                No Bid No Bid 1,375.00$              

5.5 Antaria 30w POE Output 18 Port switch - LMP-1802G-
SFP-T No Bid 2,691.96$                No Bid No Bid 2,090.00$              

5.6 Antaria Power Supply with DIN Rail Bracket SDR-240-
48 No Bid 302.01$                   No Bid No Bid 246.00$                 

5.7

Duraline 2 inch, SDR 13.5, Pinpoint with 18awg tracer 
wire , Silicore ULF lining, - n/a. Orange, Footage 
markers on pipe,
3000 feet on a spool.

No Bid 3,390.00$                No Bid No Bid  $1.19/ft   
$3570.00/spool   

5.8

Duraline 3 inch, SDR 13.5, Pinpoint with 18awg tracer 
wire , Silicore ULF lining, -
n/a. Orange, Footage markers on pipe, 1000 feet on a 
spool.

No Bid 2,350.00$                No Bid No Bid  $2.47/ft     
$2470.00/spool  

5.9
Duraline Futurepath 4 way 16/12mm with tracer wire, 
silicore lining, orange, footage markers on pipe, 5000 
feet on spool 

No Bid 6,450.00$                No Bid No Bid  $1.67/ft    
$8350.00/spool  

5.10 Duraline HDPE Microduct 16/12mm, Silicore lining, 
blue, footage markers on pipe, 6500 feet on a spool No Bid $3300.00 15k ft. No Bid No Bid  $0.23/ft    

$1495.00/spool 

5.11 Duraline Micro Coupler 16/12 part 20001517 No Bid  3.70 ea/increments 
of 25 No Bid No Bid 3.87$                     

5.12 Duraline End Cao 16mm part 20001908 No Bid  2.72 ea/increments 
of 25 No Bid No Bid 2.89$                     

5.13 Duraline 2" Clear-Lock Coupler part 20005097 No Bid 8.35$                       No Bid No Bid 8.80$                     

Radios

Switches

Bore Pipe
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5.14

Signal Engineering Co. (SECO) 16x16x16 cabinet, 
ITS, Alabama, Thermostat, - SA- CAB_161616-S-
ALIT. Backplate, Fan, Square D Supressor SDSA 
1175, Terminal Block, Louvers on 2  - Sides, Hub hole 
on
bottom, 2 pole mount brackets on back -

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 2,100.00$              

Schedule 5 Total
Schedule 6 LED Traffic Outdoor Luminaires

6.1 Phillips Lumec RFL-145W64LED4K-G2-R3M-HVU-
DMG-NRC-GY3 480V Luminaire 448.00$                   No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

6.2 Philips Lumec RFL-145W64LED4k-G2-R3M-UNV-
DMG-NRC-GY3 120-277V Luminaire 412.00$                   No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Schedule 6 Total 860.00$                   
Schedule 7 Miscellaneous 

7.1 Polyester Mule Tape 5/8" 1800lb 104.45$                   96.85$                     No Bid No Bid  $121.00/3000ft 
reel  

7.2 Vertical Cable outdoor CAT5E Ethernet part 059-
486/CMXT No Bid 208.00$                   No Bid No Bid  $351.00/1000ft 

reel  

7.3 Card Rack EDI Oracle 4H Series - Quad Channel 1/2 
width No Bid No Bid No Bid 470.00$                   450.00$                 

7.4 MMU2-16LEip w/Ethernet Port Smart Monitor No Bid No Bid 1,470.00$                1,485.00$                1,425.00$              

Camera Cabinet 
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