
CITY OF TUSCALOOSA 
ADVERTISEMENT FOR BIDS 

 
Project Name: 2026 Sanitary Sewer Rehab and Repair Project 

File Number: OCA-25-1007 Engineering Project Number: 2026.001.001 
 
Sealed Bid Proposals will be received by the City of Tuscaloosa, at the Council Chamber of City   
Hall, 2201 University Boulevard, on Thursday, August 14, 2025, at 2:00 p.m. local time for this 
project, at which time bids will be opened and read. 
 
Pre-Bid Conference: Attendance at the MANDATORY Pre-Bid Conference is required in order for 
a General Contractor to submit a bid on this Project. The Pre-Bid Conference will be held at the 
Council Chamber of City Hall, 2201 University Boulevard, on Thursday, August 7, 2025, at 2:00 
p.m. local time. 
 
Project Scope: The purpose of this bid is to provide construction services for the City of 
Tuscaloosa’s sanitary sewer system as designated by the City of Tuscaloosa’s Water and Sewer 
Department Management utilizing unit prices for commonly performed contractor work items. 
The nature of these projects shall be repairs and/or asset renewals. Construction of these 
projects is to be performed within the time frames described in the project specifications and 
notes. Failure to comply with these terms may result in the contractor being prohibited from 
bidding on additional work for the City of Tuscaloosa. All prices must be firm for a period of one 
year from the date of the contract award with extensions as allowable by the Alabama State Bid 
Law. 
              
Award of the contract will be made within fifty (50) calendar days from the date of the bid 
opening. 
 
Plans and Specifications:  Plans and specifications and all related Contract Documents are open 
for public inspection at the office of Bryan Gurney, P.E., located at 4010 Reese Phifer Ave., 
Tuscaloosa, AL 35401 and  plans,  specifications  and  other  elements  of  the  contract  documents  
may  be  obtained  from  the  City of Tuscaloosa Water & Sewer Department Bryan Gurney, P.E., 
designated as the office of the awarding authority for this purpose, located at  4010 Reese Phifer 
Ave., Tuscaloosa, AL 35401.  The contact person for the project is Amy Whitson.  They can be 
reached at awhitson@tuscaloosa.com or 205-248-5251. 
 
Official Bid Documents can also be downloaded at www.centralbidding.com. Electronic Bids can 
be submitted at www.centralbidding.com. For any questions about the electronic bidding 
process, please contact Central Bidding at 225-810-4814 or support@centralbidding.com. 
 


