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City of
TUSCALOOSA

ACCOUNTING & FINANCE

AGGREGATES, GRAVEL, ROCK, AND STONE - BID NO. 9070-032724-2
Issue Date: 03/11/24
Open Date: 03/27/24

Bid Tabulation: Preliminary

Vendor

Vendor

Vendor

Vendor

Bid # 9070-032724-2

Bunn Brothers Materials Inc.

FCR Excavating, LLC

Green Dream International LLC

Martin Marietta

Source ) ) Source ) ) Source ) ) Source ) )
ltem # Description Quarry/Mine Prlt.:e Per Ton | Price _Per Ton Quarry/Mine Prlt.:e Per Ton | Price _Per Ton Quarry/Mine Prlt.:e Per Ton | Price _Per Ton Quarry/Mine Prlt.:e Per Ton | Price _Per Ton
Address Picked up Delivered Address Picked up Delivered Address Picked up Delivered Address Picked up Delivered
Table 1- Limestone Base
Gravel #57 Davis Materials Vance Quarry Vance Quarry
: 660 Story Rd. 10445 Frog Lady 10445 Frog Lady
ALDOT Spec Section 801 NO BID NO BID | o0dstock, AL NOBID |$  44.55 |y Vanco AL $ 32778 4205 |rg vance AL $ 28.25 | $ 35.05
1 Limestone Base 35188 35490 35490
Screenings AHD #8910 Davis Materials Vance Quarry Vance Quarry
ALDOT Spec Section 801 NO BID NOBID [Soosem NOBID |$  39.94 [RFPr9 5% | g 3161($ 4089 vl | §  2200($  28.80
2 Limestone Base 35188 35490 35490
Crushed Aggregate Base, 825B Davis Materials Vance Quarry Vance Quarry
ALDOT Spec Section 825 NO BID NOBID [Soosem NOBID [$  39.50 [fiorcd o™ | '§  2871($  37.99 [ |'§  2475(8% 3155
3 Limestone Base 35188 35490 35490
Class |, per Ton Davis Materials Vance Quarry Vance Quarry
: 660 Story Rd. 10445 Frog Lad 10445 Frog Lad
ALDOT Spec Section 814 NO BID NOBID  |\oodstosk AL NOBID |$ 4827 [pgvancon . | S 3799 |8 4727 [ meear” | $  3275|$ 4055
4 Limestone Base 35188 35490 35490
Class I, per Ton \ulcan Materials Vance Quarry Vance Quarry
. u i 10445 Frog Lady 10445 Frog Lady
ALDOT Spec section 814 NO BID NOBID [t1717vucanRd. | NOBID | $  51.61 |zq vanco AL $ 37998 47.27 |rg vance AL $ 3275 % 40.55
5 Limestone Base Vance, AL 35490 35490 35490
Notes Missing W9
Vendor Vendor Vendor Vendor
Bunn Brothers Materials Inc. FCR Excavating, LLC Green Dream International LLC Martin Marietta
Source Source Source Source
ltem # Description Quarry/Mine Price Per Ton | Price Per Ton Quarry/Mine Price Per Ton | Price Per Ton Quarry/Mine Price Per Ton | Price Per Ton Quarry/Mine Price Per Ton | Price Per Ton
P Address Picked up Delivered Address Picked up Delivered Address Picked up Delivered Address Picked up Delivered
Table 2- Sandstone Base
Bunn Brothers Bunn Brothers
Gravel #57 Materials 10540 Materials 17241
ALDOT Spec Section 801 Howton Loop Rd. $ 21.00 | $ 28.00 |AL-216 NO BID $ 34.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Sandstone Base Brookwood, AL Brookwood, AL
6 35444 35444
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City of
TUSCALOOSA

ACCOUNTING & FINANCE

AGGREGATES, GRAVEL, ROCK, AND STONE - BID NO. 9070-032724-2
Issue Date: 03/11/24
Open Date: 03/27/24

Bid Tabulation: Preliminary Vendor Vendor Vendor Vendor
Bid # 9070-032724-2 Bunn Brothers Materials Inc. FCR Excavating, LLC Green Dream International LLC Martin Marietta
Source Price Per Ton | Price Per T Source | i e Per Ton | Price Per T Source Price Per Ton | Price Per T Source Price Per T Price Per T
T IMi rice Fer lon rice Fer lon IMi rice Fer lon rice Fer lon IMi rice Fer lon rice Fer lon IMi rice Fer lon rice Fer lon
Item # Description Ql:;;{eslsne Picked up Delivered Ql:;;{eslsne Picked up Delivered Ql:;;{eslsne Picked up Delivered Ql:;;{eslsne Picked up Delivered
Screenings AHD #8910 Burn Broters
ALDOT Spec Section 801 NO BID NO BID QL_zlG AL NO BID $ 29.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
rookwood,
7 Sandstone Base 35444
Crushed Aggregate Base, 8258 Motoras 10540 Metorals 17241
ALDOT Spec Section 825 Howton Loop Rd. $ 16.50 | $§  23.50 |AL-216 NO BID $ 28.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
8 Sandstone Base Srookwood, AL Srookwood, AL
Bunn Brothers Bunn Brothers
Class |, per Ton Materials 10540 Materials 17241
ALDOT Spec Section 814 Howton Loop Rd. $ 2450 | $  31.50 |AL-2t6 NO BID $ 36.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
9 Sandstone Base Srookwood, AL Srookwood, AL
Bunn Brothers Bunn Brothers
Class II, per Ton Materials 10540 Materials 17241
ALDOT Spec Section 814 Howton Loop Rd. $ 24.00 [ $  31.00 |AL-2t6 NO BID $ 36.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
10 Sandstone Base Srookwood, AL Srookwood, AL
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