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Inline Electric
Southern Lighting & 

Traffic Systems
WESCO/ ANIXTER ITS Plus Inc Temple Inc

Utilicom Supply 
Associates LLC

Line Item Part Description Bid Price Bid Price Bid Price Bid Price Bid Price Bid Price
Schedule 1 Fiber Optic Supplies

1.1 144SM Cable - Corning 144EU4-T4700D20 No Bid No Bid $1.56 No Bid No Bid $1.34

1.2 48SM Cable - Corning 048ZU4-T4F22D20 No Bid No Bid $0.56 No Bid No Bid $0.52

1.3 96SM Cable - Corning 096EU4-T4700D20 No Bid No Bid $1.03 No Bid No Bid $0.94

1.4 12SM Cable - Corning 012ZU4-T4F22D20 No Bid No Bid $0.34 No Bid No Bid $0.31

1.5 24SM Cable - Corning 024ZU4-T4F22D20 No Bid No Bid $0.42 No Bid No Bid $0.38

1.6 Corning CCH-04U Closet Connector Housing No Bid No Bid $301.59 No Bid No Bid $226.25

1.7 Corning CCH-02U Closet Connector Housing No Bid No Bid $236.68 No Bid No Bid $214.00

1.8 Corning WCH-CLSS-12P Wall Mount Connector Housing No Bid No Bid $289.55 No Bid No Bid $277.00

1.9 Corning CCH-CS12-A9-P00RE Pigtailed Spliced Cassette No Bid No Bid $345.95 No Bid No Bid $187.00

1.10 Corning CCH-CS12-B3-P00RE Pigtailed Spliced Cassette No Bid No Bid $432.38 No Bid No Bid $189.00

1.11 Corning CCH-CS12-6T-P00RE Pigtailed Spliced Cassette No Bid No Bid $324.44 No Bid No Bid No Bid

1.12 Corning FDC-CP1P-06-19 Unit Connector Panel No Bid No Bid $48.25 No Bid No Bid No Bid

1.13 Fiber Optic Closure - SCF-6C28-01-144 with trays No Bid No Bid $384.45 No Bid No Bid $456.00

Traffic Signals & Supplies - Bid No. 9073-050522-1
Issue Date: 04/15/22
Open Date: 05/05/22

Preliminary Bid Tabulation

2022 Bid Data
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1.14 Fiber Optic Closure - SCF-6C22-01-072 with trays No Bid No Bid $363.65 No Bid No Bid $343.00

1.15 Corning CCH-RM12-A9-P03RH No Bid No Bid $431.06 No Bid No Bid No Bid

1.16 Corning CCH-CP12-A9 CCH Connector Panel No Bid No Bid $86.95 No Bid No Bid $23.00

1.17 Corning CCH-CP06-A9 CCH Connector Panel No Bid No Bid $49.23 No Bid No Bid $15.75

1.18 Corning CCH-CP12-19T CCH Connector Panel No Bid No Bid $66.16 No Bid No Bid $32.75

1.19 Corning CCH-CP06-19T CCH Connector Panel No Bid No Bid $38.88 No Bid No Bid $16.25

1.20 Corning Unicams SM ST 95-200-51 No Bid No Bid $14.22 No Bid No Bid $20.00

1.21 Corning Unicams SM LC 95-200-41 No Bid No Bid $14.55 No Bid No Bid $19.00

1.22 Corning Fan-Out Kit FAN-BT25-12 No Bid No Bid $15.86 No Bid No Bid $21.00

1.23 Corning Heat Shrink Splice Protector 60MM 2806031-01 No Bid No Bid $43.11 No Bid No Bid $34.00

Schedule 1 Total $3,490.87
Schedule 2 Junction Box  Encolsures

2.1 Junction Box (Quasite) - ALDOT Comm. Box - 2' x 3' x 24" - Tier 22 $1,252.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

2.2 Junction Box (Quasite) - ALDOT Comm. Box - 3' x 4' x 24" - Tier 22 $1,285.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Schedule 2 Total $2,537.00
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Schedule 3 NEMA Control Cabinets

3.1 NEMA 12 Position Control Cabinet per Specs - Standard Finish No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $14,339.00 No Bid

3.2 NEMA 12 Position Control Cabinet per Specs - Primed & Painted Black No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $15,198.00 No Bid

3.3 NEMA 16 Position Control Cabinet per Specs - Standard Finish No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $14,947.00 No Bid

3.4 NEMA 16 Position Control Cabinet per Specs - Primed & Painted Black No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $15,804.00 No Bid

3.5 Eagle ELS1014, Super P Cabinet w/Integrated UPS - Standard Finish No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $18,673.00 No Bid

3.6 Eagle ELS1014, Super P Cabinet w/Integrated UPS - Primed & Painted Black No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $19,769.00 No Bid

Schedule 3 Total $98,730.00
Schedule 4 Street Light Poles & Transformer Bases

4.1 Street Light Poles (Complete Assembly) per Specs $5,253.00 $8,450.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

4.2 Transformer Bases (replacement) per Specs TB1 $620.00 $375.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

4.3 Transformer Bases (replacement) per Specs TB2 $584.00 $525.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

4.4 Transformer Bases (replacement) per Specs TB3 $789.00 $540.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Schedule 4 Total $7,246.00 $9,890.00
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Schedule 5 Camera Supplies

5.1 Ubiquity NanoStation M5 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $96.00

5.2 Ubiquity VLRM58 Wireless Access Point (5.8 GHz) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $198.00

5.3 Transition Networks SISPM1040-362-LRT Hardened Managed POE Network 
Switch No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $890.00

5.4 Transition Networks SISPM1040-384-LRT-C Hardened Managed POE Network 
Switch No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1,323.00

5.5 Transition Networks TN-GLC-BX-D SFP Module, Cisco Compatible, 10km 1000-
BX 1490 nm, TX/1310 nm RX Single Fiber, LC, SM No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $137.50

5.6 Transition Networks TN-GLC-BX-U SFP Transceiver Module, Cisco Compatible, 
1000-BX 1310 nm, TX/1490 nm RX Single Fiber, LC, SM No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $137.50

5.7 Transition Networks TN-GLC-BX-U-20 SPF Transceiver Module No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $274.95

5.8 Transition Networks TN-GLC-BX-D-20 SPF Transceiver Module No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $274.95

5.9 Mean Well RS-75-12 Power Supply No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $32.00

5.10 Mean Well RS-75-48 Power Supply No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $34.00

5.11 AXIS T8134 Midspan-POE Injector No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $159.50

5.12 AXIS Q6054-E PTZ Dome Network Camera with Pendant Mount, Pendant Arm, 
POE Injector No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $3,020.00

5.13 AXIS P5654-E PTZ Dome Network Camera with Pendant Mount, Pendant Arm, 
POE Injector No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1,989.00

5.14 AXIS P1435-LE Fixed Network Camera (outdoor) with Wall Mount No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $694.00

5.15 AXIS M3045-V Network Camera with Mount No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $352.00

5.16 AXIS M3105-LVE Fixed Dome Network Camera with Mount No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $394.00

Schedule 5 Total $10,006.40
Schedule 6 LED Traffic Lamps

6.1 12" LED Red Traffic Lamp with 5-Year Warranty No Bid $42.00 No Bid No Bid $38.00 $30.00

6.2 12" LED Yellow Traffic Lamp with 5-Year Warranty No Bid $42.00 No Bid No Bid $42.00 $30.00

6.3 12" LED Green Traffic Lamp with 5-Year Warranty No Bid $42.00 No Bid No Bid $42.00 $30.00
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6.4 12" LED Red Arrow Traffic Lamp with 5-Year Warranty No Bid $42.00 No Bid No Bid $40.00 $35.35

6.5 12" LED Yellow Arrow Traffic Lamp with 5-Year Warranty No Bid $42.00 No Bid No Bid $38.00 $35.35

6.6 12" LED Green Arrow Traffic Lamp with 5-Year Warranty No Bid $42.00 No Bid No Bid $43.00 $35.35

Schedule 6 Total $252.00 $243.00 $196.05
Schedule 7 Pedestrian Signals & Supplies

7.1 18" Pedestrian Signal, LED w/Countdown Feature, Clamshell Mount Included, 
Meets ALDOT Specs, City Will Order Left or Right No Bid $346.00 No Bid No Bid $403.00 $285.00

7.2 18" Pedestrian Signal Retrofit, LED w/ Countdown Feature No Bid $130.00 No Bid No Bid $159.00 $118.00

7.3 BDL3-X Bulldog III Pedestrian Push Button, Complete w/Cup, Black or Yellow No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $100.00 No Bid

7.4 iN23TNO-X 9x15 iN2 APS Push Button Station, Black or Yellow No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $462.00 No Bid

7.5 iCCU-S iCCU Shelf Model No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $2,428.00 No Bid

7.6 iN2-ICB Interconnect Board for iCCU-S No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $90.00 No Bid

7.7 iN2-SDLC-YCABLE SDCL Cable Slitter No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $93.00 No Bid

7.8 850-217 Standard Cable Harness, 50 Pin No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $93.00 No Bid

7.9 Navigator EN29ANO-X 9x12 EZ Comm APS Push Button Station, Black or Yellow No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
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7.10 CCU w/USB & Ethernet Port No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

7.11 Cabinet Control Unit Hardware Kit (1 per CCU required) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

7.12 Special Message Recording per Crossing No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

7.13 Cabinet Control Unit Hardware Kit, All Cables 8' No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Schedule 7 Total
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Schedule 8 LED Outdoor Luminaires

8.1 Philips Lumec RFL-145W64LED4K-G2-R3M-HVU-DMG-NRC-GY3 480V 
Luminaire $400.28 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

8.2 Philips Lumec RFL-145W64LED4K-G2-R3M-UNV-DMG-NRC-GY3 120-277V 
Luminaire $385.52 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Schedule 8 Total $785.80
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Schedule 9 Illuminated LED Street Signs

9.1 4' Width Temple Edge-Lit Internally Illuminated LED Street Sign with Astro-Brac 
Mast Arm Mounting Hardware No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1,255.00 No Bid

9.2 5' Width Temple Edge-Lit Internally Illuminated LED Street Sign with Astro-Brac 
Mast Arm Mounting Hardware No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1,394.00 No Bid

9.3 6' Width Temple Edge-Lit Internally Illuminated LED Street Sign with Astro-Brac 
Mast Arm Mounting Hardware No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1,538.00 No Bid

9.4 7' Width Temple Edge-Lit Internally Illuminated LED Street Sign with Astro-Brac 
Mast Arm Mounting Hardware No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1,682.00 No Bid

9.5 8' Width Temple Edge-Lit Internally Illuminated LED Street Sign with Astro-Brac 
Mast Arm Mounting Hardware No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1,742.00 No Bid

Schedule 9 Total $7,611.00
Schedule 10 Traficam/Trafisense/Traficon System Components

10.1 TrafiCam Camera Narrow Angle 10-6091A No Bid No Bid No Bid $7,995.00 No Bid $1,595.00

10.2 Traficam Camera Wide Angle 10-6090A No Bid No Bid No Bid $7,995.00 No Bid $1,595.00

10.3 TrafiCam 1TI 1-Channel Term Board No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $649.00

10.4 TrafiCam 4TI Ethernet Edge 4-Channel Term Board (7250-188) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $550.00

10.5 TrafiCam Belden 9402 Cable – 1000’ Reel No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $695.00

10.6 TrafiCam x-stream BPL Camera, Wide Angle (7250-177) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $3,560.00

10.7 TrafiCam x-stream BPL Camera, Narrow Angle (7250-173) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $3,560.00

10.8 TrafiCon x-stream Edge Card (7250-320) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1,060.00

10.9 TrafiSense BPL 7.5 mm Wide Angle Thermal Camera/Sensor (7250-348) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $4,855.00

10.10 TrafiSense BPL 9 mm Medium Angle Thermal Camera/Sensor (7250-334) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $4,855.00

10.11 TrafiSense BPL 13 mm Narrow Angle Thermal Camera/Sensor (7250-324) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $4,855.00

10.12 TrafiCon VIP3D.1s Vehicle Presense/Data Detector No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $2,270.00

10.13 TrafiCon VIP3D.2s Vehicle Presense/Data Detector No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $3,480.00

10.14 4TI 4-Channel Termination Board, P/N 7250-176 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1,125.00
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Schedule 10 Total $34,704.00
Schedule 11 Wireless Vehicle Detection

11.1 FLEX-CTRL-M-E FlexControl Module Enhanced No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1,987.00 No Bid

11.2 FLEX-CTRL-ACC-3 FlexControl Power Supply w/Power Cords No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $130.00 No Bid

11.3 APCC-M-E APCC Module w/Enhanced Ethernet No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $3,715.00 No Bid

11.4 APCC-SPP APCC Serial Port Protocol (Digital Radio) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $907.00 No Bid

11.5 APCC-ACC-1 APCC Accessory, Isolator No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $315.00 No Bid

11.6 RP240-BH-LL-2 Long-Life Repeater No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1,990.00 No Bid

11.7 FLEX-RP-B-LL-2 FLEX Long-Life Repeater No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $2,605.00 No Bid

11.8 FLEX-RPT3-SLR FlexRepeat3 Solar Repeater No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $2,302.00 No Bid

11.9 FLEX-ANT-1 Standard External Antenna No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $174.00 No Bid

11.10 FLEX-ANT-2 Long Range External Antenna No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $269.00 No Bid

11.11 KIT-MTG Universal Mounting Bracket No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $143.00 No Bid

11.12 CC240 Contact Closure Master Card No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $630.00 No Bid

11.13 EX240 Extension Card No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $360.00 No Bid

11.14 CC-ACC AccessBox for Contact Closure Master Card No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $128.00 No Bid

11.15 VSN240-F-2 FlexMag Flush Wireless Sensor No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $530.00 No Bid

11.16 VSN240-M-2 MicroRadar Flush-Mount Sensor (Bicycle Application) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $553.00 No Bid
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11.17 One Case M-PP-450 Epoxy w/M-SM-750 Mixing/Pour Tubes No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $69.00 No Bid

Schedule 11 Total $16,807.00
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Schedule 12 Miscellaneous Traffic Signal Supplies

12.1 12 Gauge USE Copper Stranded Wire (price per linear foot) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

12.2 Signal Cable, IMSA 20-1, #14, 7 Conductor, Stranded Copper (price per linear 
foot) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

12.3 3/8” Guy Cable, Galvanized (price per linear foot), No Minimum Purchase 
Requirements No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

12.4 1/4" Guy Cable, Galvanized (price per linear foot), No Minimum Purchase 
Requirements No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

12.5 Lead-in Cable, IMSA 50-2, #14 (price per linear foot) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

12.6 One Case - Traffic Loop Sealant, Sausage Tube, Must Be ALDOT Approved No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $450.00 $575.00

12.7 EDI Oracle S1E Series - Single Channel Shelf Mount Detector, Must Meet Current 
ALDOT Specs No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $260.00 No Bid

12.8 Card Rack EDI Oracle 4E Series - Quad Channel No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $332.00 No Bid

12.9 Card Rack EDI Oracle 4H Series - Quad Channel 1/2 Width No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $323.00 No Bid

12.10 MMU2-16LEip w/Ethernet Port Smart Monitor No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1,007.00 No Bid

12.11 SMM-12LEC No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $900.00 No Bid

12.12 Buss KTK 3 Amp 600 Volt Midget Fuses - Price Each for a Minimum Purchase 
Qty of 100 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

12.13 Buss Fuse Holders, Part # HEB-LW-RYA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
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12.14 Traffic Signal Housing (Housing w/No Lens, Reflectors, Etc.), 3 Section, Including 
Visors & Span Wire Hanger. Must Be ALDOT Approved. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $269.00 $305.00

12.15 8-Phase NEMA Traffic Signal Controller Mechanism, Eagle M-60 Version or 
Greater, Complete with Fiber Modem Communications No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $3,100.00 No Bid

12.16 Econolite Cobalt C controller, Shelf Mount, EOS software – 
COBC20100000000000 No Bid $3,025.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

12.17 Traffic Signal Uninterrupted Power Supply, Alpha FXM 1100, Housed in SE48-
1616 Cabinet, to Include 100XTV 12V, AlphaCell Batteries & AlphaGuard No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $4,697.00 No Bid

12.18 Fiberglass/Polymer Concrete Flush Mount Pull Boxes, 20K # Load Rating, 12" W x 
12" L x 18" D $92.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

12.19 AI-500-086-02 Glance Preempt/Priority FMU2 4G Video w/4-Port Switch No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $4,774.00 No Bid

12.20 AI-500-0066 Glance Preempt & Priority Vehicle Monitoring Unit No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $4,653.00 No Bid

12.21 AI-500-068 Glance Preempt/Priority Gate Opener No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $3,947.00 No Bid

12.22 AI-500-071 Glance School Time Clock & Connectivity Package No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $2,458.00 No Bid

12.23 AI-300-021 Glance Indoor Sensor (Parking) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

12.24 AI-500-066 Glance Indoor Sensor Cables 12' (Parking) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

12.25 AI-300-025 Glance Zone Board (Parking) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

12.26 AI-300-027 Glance 200mm Advisor (Parking) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

12.27 AI-300-028 Glance 300mm Advisor (Parking) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
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12.28 AI-300-030 Glance Software (Parking) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
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