
Pound Ton Gallon Pound Ton Gallon Pound Ton Gallon Pound Ton Gallon Pound Ton Gallon Pound Ton Gallon Pound Ton Gallon Pound Ton Gallon

 Brenntag Mid-South Inc  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 
 932.00

Dry 
 No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 2.19  No Bid  No Bid 14.4950  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 1.47  No Bid  No Bid 3.5640

Burnett Lime Company Inc No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 
 0.067
Wet 

 134.00
Wet 

            0.67 No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

 CedarChem LLC  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 
1.75
Dry

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid  No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Chemrite Inc  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 1.63  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 12.28  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

Colonial Chemical Solutions Inc  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 
 0.236
Wet 

 No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

DPC Enterprises LP  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 0.2142 428.38             2.09  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

Pencco Inc
 0.2915

Wet 
 583.00

Wet 
2.97  No Bid  No Bid No Bid  No Bid  No Bid No Bid  No Bid  No Bid No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

Shannon Chemical Corp 0.634      1,268.00 6.34 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid             1.44        2,880.00 13.54  No Bid  No Bid No Bid  No Bid  No Bid No Bid 15.19  No Bid  No Bid No Bid

The Dycho Company Inc  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 
 925.54

Dry 
 No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

 2.12
Wet 

 1.50
Wet 

 No Bid  No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
 10.25
Wet 

No Bid No Bid No Bid

Univar Solutions USA Inc 0.27 540.00 2.7324 0.4555 911.00 2.9061 0.2830 566.00 2.83 No Bid No Bid No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

Bidder
Line Item #8

SODIUM THIOSULFATE 
30% BMS

Bulk Water Treatment Chemicals - Bid No. 9045-090123-2
Issue Date: 08/11/23
Open Date: 09/01/23

Line Item #1
FLUOROSILICIC ACID

Line Item #2
LIQUID SODIUM 

HYDROXIDE
(CAUSTIC SODA)

Line Item #3
LIQUID SODIUM 
HYPOCHLORITE

Line Item #4
LIQUID SODIUM 

PERMANGANATE
Line Item #5

IC-7110 POLYMER

Line Item #7
FIFTY PERCENT CITRIC 

ACID
Line Item #6
LIQUID LIME
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